Fox Truck World LLC (Romie C

Laredo Mechanical Industrial

Heil of Texas (Texan Waste

Texas Pack + Load (Texas

Gorillas Garage Center BTE Body Co. ) A
FoxJr.) Services, Inc. Equipment Inc) Packer and Loader Sales, Inc.)
Total Price $0.00 Total Price $0.00| Total Price $195.00 Total Price $240.00 Total Price $370.00 Total Price $960.00
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Section I: Scorpion (DADEE Manufacturing) C 1 PKG $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1.1 Percent of Discount Offered 1 EA 0.0% 0.0% 0.0%
1.2 Parts will be delivered in working days afterr 1 Days 5.0% 5.0%
2 Section II: Scorpion (DADEE Manufacturing) F 1 PKG No Bid No Bid 60.00 $60.00 $240.00 $240.00
2.1  Labor Rate for Services 1 Hourly Labo $60.00 $140.00
2.2 Mileage Rate (if any) 1 Hourly Labo| $0.00 $100.00
3 Section Ill: G-S (G-S Product) Captive New (Ol 1 PKG No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3.1  Percent of Discount Offered 1 EA 0.0% 0.0% 0.0%
3.2 Parts will be delivered in working days after r 1 Days 1.0% 5.0%
4 Section IV: G-S (G-S Product) Repair Services 1 PKG No Bid $195.00 $195.00 $60.00 $60.00 $240.00 $240.00
4.1 Labor Rate for Services 1 Hourly Labo $120.00 $60.00 $140.00
4.2 Mileage Rate (if any) 1 Hourly Labo $75.00 $0.00 $100.00
5 Section V: Heil (Heil Manufacturing) Captive I 1 PKG No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
5.1  Percent of Discount Offered 1 EA 0.0% 3.0% 0.0%
5.2 Parts will be delivered in working days afterr 1 Days 3.0% 5.0%
6 Section VI: Heil (Heil Manufacturing) Repair S 1 PKG No Bid No Bid $60.00 $60.00 $370.00 $370.00 $240.00 $240.00
6.1  Labor Rate for Services 1 Hourly Labo $60.00 $185.00 $140.00
6.2  Mileage Rate (if any) 1 Hourly Labo $0.00 $185.00 $100.00
7 Section VII: New Way (New Way Manufacturi 1 PKG No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
7.1  Percent of Discount Offered 1 EA 0.0% 0.0%
7.2 Parts will be delivered in working days after r 1 Days 5.0%
8 Section VIII: New Way (New Way Manufactur 1 PKG No Bid No Bid $60.00 $60.00 $240.00 $240.00
8.1  Labor Rate for Services 1 Hourly Labo| $60.00 $140.00
8.2  Mileage Rate (if any) 1 Hourly Labo $0.00 $100.00
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