

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Andy's Auto Air & Supplies, Inc		Rotex Truck Center, Inc		Texas Alternator (McAdams		vehicle maintenance program		FLEETPRIDE	
				Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$144,462.84
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section A: Fuel, Air Oil Filters (Wix) Stock Nur 1	PKG		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$144,462.84	\$144,462.84
1.1	# 33011 fuel	52	EA	No Bid								<u>\$1.54</u>	
1.2	#33032 Fuel	12	EA									\$2.72	
1.3	#33109 Fuel	55	EA									<u>\$4.77</u>	
1.4	#33166 Fuel	6	EA									\$13.03	
1.5	#33210 Fuel	36	EA									\$8.46	
1.6	#33296 Fuel	38	EA									\$5.79	
1.7	#33357 Fuel	10	EA									<u>\$6.41</u>	
1.8	#33358 Fuel	24	EA									<u>\$5.44</u>	
1.9	#33377 Fuel	178	EA									<u>\$7.20</u>	
1.10	#33392 Fuel	50	EA									\$20.91	
1.11	#33405 Fuel	13	EA									<u>\$6.92</u>	
1.12	#33406 Fuel	100	EA									<u>\$10.50</u>	
1.13	#33412 Fuel	48	EA									<u>\$21.43</u>	
1.14	#33442 Fuel	22	EA									<u>\$10.43</u>	
1.15	#33472 Fuel	22	EA									<u>\$7.63</u>	
1.16	#33481 Fuel	27	EA									\$7.10	
1.17	#33518 Fuel	43	EA									<u>\$17.98</u>	
1.18	#33546 Fuel	12	EA									<u>\$12.58</u>	
1.19	#33548 Fuel	51	EA									<u>\$12.58</u>	
1.20	#33595 Fuel	123	EA									\$5.99	
1.21	#33604 Fuel	158	EA									<u>\$20.72</u>	
1.22	#33638 Fuel	19	EA									<u>\$12.47</u>	
1.23	#33668 Fuel	13	EA									<u>\$12.58</u>	
1.24	#33791 Fuel	39	EA									\$9.03	
1.25	#33899 Fuel	47	EA									<u>\$8.36</u>	
1.26	#33936 Fuel	175	EA									<u>\$12.54</u>	
1.27	#33950 Fuel	200	EA									<u>\$34.45</u>	
1.28	#33674 Fuel	180	EA									<u>\$9.03</u>	
1.29	#33966 Fuel	116	EA									\$11.80	
1.30	#42124 Air	40	EA									<u>\$27.07</u>	
1.31	#42226 Air	177	EA									<u>\$21.82</u>	
1.32	#42321 Air	115	EA									<u>\$23.40</u>	
1.33	#42488 Air	123	EA									\$9.88	
1.34	#42610 Air	15	EA									\$51.72	
1.35	#42691 Air	200	EA									\$73.52	
1.36	#42731 Air	51	EA									<u>\$36.95</u>	
1.37	#42812 Air	148	EA									\$64.10	
1.38	#42679 Air	42	EA									<u>\$17.64</u>	
1.39	#42824 Air	22	EA									<u>\$27.98</u>	
1.40	#42843 Magnum AF	237	EA									\$7.13	
1.41	#42868 Air	62	EA									<u>\$24.02</u>	
1.42	#42985 Air	61	EA									<u>\$10.72</u>	
1.43	#46077 Air	15	EA									<u>\$4.70</u>	
1.44	#46134 Air	150	EA									<u>\$4.73</u>	
1.45	#46174 Air	25	EA									<u>\$5.41</u>	
1.46	#46213 Air	15	EA									\$10.99	
1.47	#46253 Ranger AF	168	EA									\$7.12	
1.48	#46360 Mower AF	11	EA									No Bid	
1.49	#46418 Air	150	EA									\$10.53	
1.50	#46429 Air	75	EA									<u>\$14.56</u>	
1.51	#46433 Air	100	EA									<u>\$20.35</u>	

1.52	# 46438 mower AF (o)	145	EA						<u>\$12.47</u>
1.53	# 46449 mower AF	145	EA						<u>\$9.77</u>
1.54	# 46522 aux Eng AF	106	EA						<u>\$13.40</u>
1.55	# 46562 air filter (o)	42	EA						<u>\$21.26</u>
1.56	# 46569 air filter (o)	37	EA						<u>\$12.72</u>
1.57	# 46671 air filter cs (o)	77	EA						\$18.01
1.58	# 46672 air filter cs (i)	67	EA						<u>\$14.04</u>
1.59	# 46728 Air	49	EA						\$15.62
1.60	# 46744 sweeper Main	15	EA						<u>\$25.88</u>
1.61	# 46804 Air	41	EA						\$12.10
1.62	# 46917 Air	8	EA						\$6.35
1.63	# 46919 Refuse truck rear	128	EA						\$44.73
1.64	# 46935 Air	350	EA						\$6.98
1.65	# 49082 Cab a/c	123	EA						<u>\$9.33</u>
1.66	# 49883 F-250 AF	61	EA						\$10.19
1.67	# 49886 Air	237	EA						<u>\$42.88</u>
1.68	# 51040 Oil	19	EA						\$3.29
1.69	# 51056 Oil	11	EA						<u>\$6.06</u>
1.70	# 51061 Oil	20	EA						\$3.98
1.71	# 51085 Mg oil filter	462	EA						\$3.95
1.72	# 51334 mower OF	72	EA						\$3.50
1.73	# 51348 Oil	700	EA						\$3.29
1.74	# 51365 M.O.F.	32	EA						\$3.66
1.75	# 51372 Oil	900	EA						\$3.48
1.76	# 51356 M.O.F	22	EA						\$3.44
1.77	# 51394 Oil	53	EA						\$3.32
1.78	# 51459 CAT OF	12	EA						<u>\$5.99</u>
1.79	# 51515 Oil	19	EA						\$3.50
1.80	# 51522 Oil	100	EA						\$3.33
1.81	# 51551 MFH	36	EA						<u>\$4.70</u>
1.82	# 51602 Oil	18	EA						<u>\$4.08</u>
1.83	# 51516 Oil	125	EA						\$3.89
1.84	# 51721 Hyd Filter	47	EA						\$46.94
1.85	# 51734 Oil	52	EA						<u>\$9.01</u>
1.86	# 51748 Oil	120	EA						<u>\$22.07</u>
1.87	# 51749 Oil	291	EA						<u>\$13.35</u>
1.88	# 51750 Refuse Truck	167	EA						\$9.57
1.89	# 51791 Oil	260	EA						<u>\$6.93</u>
1.90	# 51792 Oil	200	EA						<u>\$11.21</u>
1.91	# 51798 Oil	136	EA						<u>\$7.55</u>
1.92	# 51801 Oil	72	EA						<u>\$13.67</u>
1.93	# 57037 Oil	92	EA						<u>\$10.67</u>
1.94	# 57182 Oil	192	EA						<u>\$7.29</u>
1.95	# 57060 Oil	127	EA						\$3.31
1.96	# 57243 Aux. sweepers oil filter	13	EA						<u>\$9.04</u>
1.97	# 57314 Eng.oil filter	200	EA						\$12.72
1.98	#57750 Deere OF	1000	EA						<u>\$9.78</u>
1.99	Section A: Percentage of stocked item on han 1		EA						80.0%
2	Section B: Automotive Parts - Belts, Hoses, C	1	PKG	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00
2.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%			82.8%	25.0%
2.2	Section B: Percentage of stocked item on han 1		EA		20.0%			82.8%	30.0%
3	Section C- Automotive Parts - Brakes, related	1	PKG	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$0.00
3.1	723 Brake, Shoe	20	EA						No Bid
3.2	3030 Brake, Booster	20	EA						No Bid
3.3	4148 Brake, Seal	200	EA						No Bid

3.4	4160 Brake, Seal, Front, F250-F350	77	EA						No Bid
3.5	7114 Brake, Pads Semi Metallic Rear F 150	22	EA						No Bid
3.6	145076 Front Rotor Ranger	60	EA						No Bid
3.7	3W1Z1225AA Ford, Brake, Bearing	20	EA						No Bid
3.8	86605 Ford, Brake, Seal	14	EA						No Bid
3.9	8C3Z1190A Ford, Brake, Seal	40	EA						No Bid
3.10	91505 Brake, Seal	100	EA						No Bid
3.11	9864S Oil Seal	4	EA						No Bid
3.12	12 Brakes, Bearing	48	EA						No Bid
3.13	13 Brakes, Bearing	5	EA						No Bid
3.14	AlB Brakes, Bearing	40	EA						No Bid
3.15	A2 Brakes, Bearing	20	EA						No Bid
3.16	AS Brakes, Bearing	75	EA						No Bid
3.17	A6 Brakes, Bearing	75	EA						No Bid
3.18	EOA Z21498B Ford, Brakes, Brake Washer	25	EA						No Bid
3.19	F67Z1SI I 77 ACA Ford, Axle, Seal	20	EA						No Bid
3.20	MKD1012 Brake, Pads, Rear	30	EA						No Bid
3.21	MKD1057AFM Rear Brakes, Rear Charger Sev 20		EA						No Bid
3.22	MKD1058FM Brakes, Pads Front Charger 05-C 20		EA						No Bid
3.23	MKD1066 Brakes, FSS0 w/ Sensor	13	EA						No Bid
3.24	MKD067 Brake Pads	13	EA						No Bid
3.25	MKD1068 Brakes, Rear Pads Ford 05-08	10	EA						No Bid
3.26	MKD1069 Brake, Pads, Front	10	EA						No Bid
3.27	MKD1083 Brake, Pads, Front	39	EA						No Bid
3.28	MKD679 Brake, Front Pads FISO- 200-2005	50	EA						No Bid
3.29	MKD702 Brakes, Rear Pads (RAM 2500)	10	EA						No Bid
3.30	MKD777FM Brakes, F450/550 99- 07 WO/SEN	10	EA						No Bid
3.31	MKD785 Brake, Pads, Front	15	EA						No Bid
3.32	MKD824 Brakes, Pads F350 Front	35	EA						No Bid
3.33	MKD833 Brake, Pads, Front, Ran	80	EA						No Bid
3.34	M KD931FM Brake, Pads, Titanium Metallic C 48		EA						No Bid
3.35	MKD932FM Brakes, Pads, Titanium Metallic C 36		EA						No Bid
3.36	PRTS258 Rear Rotor F350 Super Duty	10	EA						No Bid
3.37	PRT5519 Brake Front, Rotor	21	EA						No Bid
3.38	PRTSS20 Ford FRT Rotor 7 Stud 2WD FISO	10	EA						No Bid
3.39	PRT565 1 Brakes, Front Rotors H.D. Dodge M:	12	EA						No Bid
3.40	PRT5739 Brakes, Rea r Rotor Dodge Mag/Cha	12	EA						No Bid
3.41	RS704 Brakes, Rear Shoes	4	EA						No Bid
3.42	RS705 Brakes, Rear Shoes	4	EA						No Bid
3.43	RS745 Brake, Emergency Brakes	4	EA						No Bid
3.44	Section C: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA						0.0%
4	Section D: Brakes/Miscellaneous Brake Parts	1	PKG	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%				
4.2	Section D: Percentage of stocked item on har	1	EA		20.0%				
5	Section E: Automotive Parts - Chassis Steering	1	PKG	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00
5.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%			14.75%	
5.2	Section E: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA		20.0%			14.75%	
6	Section F: Automotive Parts- Drive Train (Trar	1	PKG	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00
6.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%			70.05%	
6.2	Section F: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA		20.0%			60.0%	
7	Section G: Automotive Parts- Electrical (Alter	1	PKG	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid
7.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%		30.0%		
7.2	Section G: Percentage of stocked item on har	1	EA		20.0%		90.0%		
8	Section H: Automotive Parts- Exhaust (Exhau	1	PKG	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%				

8.2	Section H: Percentage of stocked item on har 1	EA			20.0%						
9	Section I: Automotive Parts: Fuel Emission-C: 1	PKG	No Bid		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid
9.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%		30.0%				
9.2	Section I: Percentage of stocked item on han 1	EA			20.0%		70.0%				
10	Section J: Automotive Parts: Heating Air Con 1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
10.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%						
10.2	Section J: Percentage of stocked item on han 1	EA			20.0%						
11	Section K: Automotive Parts: Ignition (Engine 1	PKG	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
11.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA								
11.2	Section K: Percentage of stocked item on han 1	EA									
12	Section L: Automotive Parts: Lamps Bulbs, Fla 1	PKG	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid
12.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA						68.3%		
12.2	Section L: Percentage of stocked item on han 1	EA							61.0%		
13	Section M: Automotive Parts: Shocks Struts (1	PKG	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
13.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA								
13.2	Section M: Percentage of stocked item on han 1	EA									
14	Section N: Automotive Parts: Wipers, Blades, 1	PKG	No Bid		\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid
14.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%				68.3%		
14.2	Section N: Percentage of stocked item on har 1	EA			20.0%				61.0%		
15	Section O: Automotive Parts: Service Lubricar 1	PKG	No Bid		\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
15.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		20.0%						
15.2	Section O: Percentage of stocked item on har 1	EA			20.0%						
16	Section P: Automotive Parts: Brake Disc Pads, 1	PKG	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
16.1	Front Disc Pads #ATD931P w / abutment kit	100	Sets								
16.2	Rear Disc Pads #ATD1040AP w/ abutment kit	100	Sets								
16.3	Rotors #RB680110	100	EA								
16.4	Rotors #RB680129	100	EA								
16.5	Front Calipers# RC11381P	10	EA								
16.6	Front Calipers #RC11382P	10	EA								
16.7	Rear Calipers #RC11821P	10	EA								
16.8	Rear Calipers #RC11822P	10	EA								
16.9	Front Disc Pads #ATD1057P w/abutment kit	40	Sets								
16.10	Rear Disc Pads #ATD1058P w/abutment kit	40	Sets								
16.11	Rotors #780256P	60	EA								
16.12	Front Calipers #RC11701P	5	EA								
16.13	Front Calipers #RC11702P	5	EA								
16.14	Rear Calipers #RC11767P	20	EA								
16.15	Section P: Percentage of stocked item on han 1	EA									
17	Section Q: Automotive Parts: Package 2015 Fr 1	PKG	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
17.1	Front Disc #ATD1508SV w/abutment kit	100	Sets								
17.2	Rear Disc Pads #ATD1377SV w/abutment kit	100	Sets								
17.3	Rot or s Frt. #680758R	100	EA								
17.4	Rotors RR #68686R	100	EA								
17.5	Front Calipers #RC12051	10	EA								
17.6	Front Calipers #RC12052	10	EA								
17.7	Rear Calipers RC12563P	10	EA								
17.8	Rear Calipers RC12564P	10	EA								
17.9	Section Q: Percentage of stocked item on har 1	EA									

				A&A Auto Parts Stores, Inc.		Advance Auto Parts		O'Reilly Auto Parts (O'Reilly		Gonzalez Auto Parts (Laredo		Toro Auto Sales (Toro Motors	
				Total Price	\$233,257.46	Total Price	\$276,934.12	Total Price	\$343,306.88	Total Price	\$395,878.91	Total Price	\$395,878.91
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section A: Fuel, Air Oil Filters (Wix) Stock Nur 1		PKG	<u>\$143,864.05</u>	\$143,864.05	\$185,248.21	\$185,248.21	\$196,933.55	\$196,933.55	\$287,419.45	\$287,419.45	\$287,419.45	\$287,419.45
1.1	# 33011 fuel	52	EA	\$2.89		\$2.62		\$2.19		\$3.62		\$3.62	
1.2	#33032 Fuel	12	EA	\$4.26		<u>\$2.09</u>		\$3.19		\$3.31		\$3.31	

1.3	#33109 Fuel	55	EA	\$4.89	\$6.40	\$6.43	\$11.54	\$11.54
1.4	#33166 Fuel	6	EA	\$429.00	<u>\$5.17</u>	\$5.38	\$9.44	\$9.44
1.5	#33210 Fuel	36	EA	<u>\$7.89</u>	\$11.37	\$9.83	\$18.11	\$18.11
1.6	#33296 Fuel	38	EA	\$9.90	<u>\$5.59</u>	\$7.71	\$7.16	\$7.16
1.7	#33357 Fuel	10	EA	\$6.99	\$8.67	\$8.75	\$16.22	\$16.22
1.8	#33358 Fuel	24	EA	\$6.29	\$7.34	\$7.58	\$14.44	\$14.44
1.9	#33377 Fuel	178	EA	\$7.89	\$9.62	\$9.81	\$15.82	\$15.82
1.10	#33392 Fuel	50	EA	<u>\$7.89</u>	\$28.34	\$26.78	\$49.50	\$49.50
1.11	#33405 Fuel	13	EA	\$8.29	\$9.27	\$10.97	\$17.48	\$17.48
1.12	#33406 Fuel	100	EA	\$11.19	\$14.17	\$14.70	\$23.75	\$23.75
1.13	#33412 Fuel	48	EA	\$23.09	\$29.04	\$30.70	\$50.71	\$50.71
1.14	#33442 Fuel	22	EA	\$16.89	\$22.04	\$21.31	\$39.27	\$39.27
1.15	#33472 Fuel	22	EA	\$7.89	\$10.49	\$10.35	\$18.25	\$18.25
1.16	#33481 Fuel	27	EA	\$12.99	\$7.34	\$9.91	<u>\$6.26</u>	<u>\$6.26</u>
1.17	#33518 Fuel	43	EA	No Bid	\$24.14	\$24.98	\$41.76	\$41.76
1.18	#33546 Fuel	12	EA	\$13.09	\$17.49	\$16.39	\$30.21	\$30.21
1.19	#33548 Fuel	51	EA	\$13.69	\$18.19	\$16.71	\$31.84	\$31.84
1.20	#33595 Fuel	123	EA	\$9.99	<u>\$5.94</u>	\$7.71	\$6.26	\$6.26
1.21	#33604 Fuel	158	EA	\$22.00	\$27.99	\$27.11	\$51.48	\$51.48
1.22	#33638 Fuel	19	EA	\$13.69	\$17.32	\$17.22	\$31.74	\$31.74
1.23	#33668 Fuel	13	EA	\$14.09	\$18.19	\$17.60	\$32.44	\$32.44
1.24	#33791 Fuel	39	EA	<u>\$8.89</u>	\$11.19	\$11.22	\$20.67	\$20.67
1.25	#33899 Fuel	47	EA	\$38.89	\$47.94	\$46.11	\$91.18	\$91.18
1.26	#33936 Fuel	175	EA	\$13.19	\$16.97	\$16.73	\$12.60	\$12.60
1.27	#33950 Fuel	200	EA	No Bid	\$46.54	\$45.18	\$57.40	\$57.40
1.28	#33674 Fuel	180	EA	\$9.59	\$12.24	\$12.83	\$13.64	\$13.64
1.29	#33966 Fuel	116	EA	<u>\$11.39</u>	\$15.92	\$16.27	\$18.47	\$18.47
1.30	#42124 Air	40	EA	\$28.59	\$36.39	\$36.27	\$76.21	\$76.21
1.31	#42226 Air	177	EA	\$23.19	\$29.39	\$29.41	\$62.28	\$62.28
1.32	#42321 Air	115	EA	\$24.39	\$31.49	\$30.97	\$56.59	\$56.59
1.33	#42488 Air	123	EA	\$18.59	<u>\$8.67</u>	\$13.84	\$17.06	\$17.06
1.34	#42610 Air	15	EA	<u>\$8.79</u>	\$69.64	\$67.83	\$77.33	\$77.33
1.35	#42691 Air	200	EA	<u>\$69.79</u>	\$99.04	\$96.41	\$121.57	\$121.57
1.36	#42731 Air	51	EA	\$38.59	\$49.69	\$48.98	\$84.67	\$84.67
1.37	#42812 Air	148	EA	<u>\$61.79</u>	\$86.44	\$85.04	\$178.71	\$178.71
1.38	#42679 Air	42	EA	\$18.49	\$23.79	\$23.53	No Bid	No Bid
1.39	#42824 Air	22	EA	\$29.39	\$37.79	\$37.28	\$78.34	\$78.34
1.40	#42843 Magnum AF	237	EA	\$12.89	<u>\$6.92</u>	\$9.91	\$11.86	\$11.86
1.41	#42868 Air	62	EA	\$24.79	\$32.19	\$31.49	\$66.17	\$66.17
1.42	#42985 Air	61	EA	\$11.39	\$14.52	\$14.46	\$18.80	\$18.80
1.43	#46077 Air	15	EA	\$8.69	\$5.24	\$6.60	\$9.99	\$9.99
1.44	#46134 Air	150	EA	\$8.59	\$5.00	\$6.60	\$6.26	\$6.26
1.45	#46174 Air	25	EA	\$10.49	\$5.59	\$7.71	\$6.26	\$6.26
1.46	#46213 Air	15	EA	\$20.59	\$8.92	\$15.40	<u>\$7.62</u>	<u>\$7.62</u>
1.47	#46253 Ranger AF	168	EA	\$12.89	<u>\$6.99</u>	\$9.91	\$9.50	\$9.50
1.48	#46360 Mower AF	11	EA	No Bid	\$18.54	<u>\$16.60</u>	\$17.55	\$17.55
1.49	#46418 Air	150	EA	\$17.39	<u>\$9.27</u>	\$13.20	\$9.72	\$9.72
1.50	#46429 Air	75	EA	\$14.79	\$19.59	\$19.81	\$24.39	\$24.39
1.51	#46433 Air	100	EA	\$21.00	\$27.29	\$28.05	\$30.58	\$30.58
1.52	# 46438 mower AF (o)	145	EA	\$12.89	\$16.79	\$17.29	\$18.80	\$18.80
1.53	# 46449 mower AF	145	EA	\$10.09	\$13.12	\$13.45	\$19.86	\$19.86
1.54	# 46522 aux Eng AF	106	EA	\$13.49	\$18.19	\$18.71	\$39.31	\$39.31
1.55	# 46562 air filter (o)	42	EA	\$22.09	\$28.69	\$28.80	\$33.82	\$33.82
1.56	# 46569 air filter (o)	37	EA	\$12.89	\$17.14	\$17.22	\$36.17	\$36.17
1.57	# 46671 air filter cs (o)	77	EA	\$19.39	\$24.14	\$25.94	<u>\$13.03</u>	<u>\$13.03</u>

1.58	# 46672 air filter cs (i)	67	EA	\$14.29	\$18.89	\$17.71	\$37.21	\$37.21
1.59	# 46728 Air	49	EA	\$16.59	\$20.99	\$21.14	<u>\$12.33</u>	<u>\$12.33</u>
1.60	# 46744 sweeper Main	15	EA	\$27.39	\$34.99	\$34.55	\$40.79	\$40.79
1.61	# 46804 Air	41	EA	\$17.89	<u>\$10.32</u>	\$13.20	\$10.35	\$10.35
1.62	# 46917 Air	8	EA	\$11.99	<u>\$5.42</u>	\$8.81	\$10.22	\$10.22
1.63	# 46919 Refuse truck rear	128	EA	<u>\$44.29</u>	\$60.19	\$59.45	\$124.92	\$124.92
1.64	# 46935 Air	350	EA	\$12.89	<u>\$3.21</u>	\$9.91	\$10.28	\$10.28
1.65	# 49082 Cab a/c	123	EA	\$9.89	\$12.59	\$12.47	\$15.89	\$15.89
1.66	# 49883 F-250 AF	61	EA	\$16.78	<u>\$8.67</u>	\$12.89	\$12.76	\$12.76
1.67	# 49886 Air	237	EA	\$43.09	\$57.74	\$54.74	\$100.64	\$100.64
1.68	# 51040 Oil	19	EA	\$5.69	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.18	\$4.18
1.69	# 51056 Oil	11	EA	\$6.69	\$8.15	\$8.48	\$6.21	\$6.21
1.70	# 51061 Oil	20	EA	\$7.69	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$5.51	\$5.76	\$5.76
1.71	# 51085 Mg oil filter	462	EA	\$5.59	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.49	\$4.49
1.72	# 51334 mower OF	72	EA	\$5.79	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.55	\$4.55
1.73	# 51348 Oil	700	EA	\$5.59	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.18	\$4.18
1.74	# 51365 M.O.F.	32	EA	\$5.69	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.00	\$4.00
1.75	# 51372 Oil	900	EA	\$5.59	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.49	\$4.49
1.76	# 51356 M.O.F	22	EA	\$5.99	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.00	\$4.00
1.77	# 51394 Oil	53	EA	\$5.99	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.00	\$4.00
1.78	# 51459 CAT OF	12	EA	\$6.99	\$7.97	\$8.24	\$9.39	\$9.39
1.79	# 51515 Oil	19	EA	\$5.79	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$5.70	\$5.70
1.80	# 51522 Oil	100	EA	\$5.65	<u>\$3.25</u>	\$4.41	\$4.18	\$4.18
1.81	# 51551 MFH	36	EA	\$4.99	\$4.89	\$6.28	\$6.99	\$6.99
1.82	# 51602 Oil	18	EA	\$11.49	\$5.52	\$5.72	\$12.01	\$12.01
1.83	# 51516 Oil	125	EA	\$5.60	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.18	\$4.18
1.84	# 51721 Hyd Filter	47	EA	<u>\$44.99</u>	\$65.79	\$63.51	No Bid	No Bid
1.85	# 51734 Oil	52	EA	\$9.29	\$12.07	\$11.53	\$13.37	\$13.37
1.86	# 51748 Oil	120	EA	\$25.69	\$29.74	\$33.95	\$29.77	\$29.77
1.87	# 51749 Oil	291	EA	\$14.59	\$17.84	\$18.15	\$38.14	\$38.14
1.88	# 51750 Refuse Truck	167	EA	<u>\$7.69</u>	\$12.94	\$18.13	\$38.08	\$38.08
1.89	# 51791 Oil	260	EA	\$7.39	\$9.27	\$9.72	\$9.81	\$9.81
1.90	# 51792 Oil	200	EA	\$12.49	\$15.04	\$15.14	\$16.28	\$16.28
1.91	# 51798 Oil	136	EA	\$8.39	\$10.14	\$10.56	\$22.15	\$22.15
1.92	# 51801 Oil	72	EA	\$14.99	\$18.54	\$18.72	\$39.34	\$39.34
1.93	# 57037 Oil	92	EA	\$11.39	\$14.34	\$13.84	\$15.47	\$15.47
1.94	# 57182 Oil	192	EA	\$7.59	\$9.79	\$9.95	\$10.92	\$10.92
1.95	# 57060 Oil	127	EA	\$5.79	<u>\$2.62</u>	\$4.41	\$4.18	\$4.18
1.96	# 57243 Aux. sweepers oil filter	13	EA	No Bid	\$12.24	\$12.32	\$25.88	\$25.88
1.97	# 57314 Eng.oil filter	200	EA	No Bid	\$17.14	\$24.99	<u>\$8.64</u>	<u>\$8.64</u>
1.98	#57750 Deere OF	1000	EA	No Bid	\$13.12	\$12.85	\$22.92	\$22.92
1.99	Section A: Percentage of stocked item on han 1	EA		20.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
2	Section B: Automotive Parts - Belts, Hoses, C 1	PKG		\$0.00 \$0.00	\$0.00 \$0.00	\$0.00 \$0.00	\$0.00 \$0.00	\$0.00 \$0.00
2.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	25.0%	33.0%	41.0%	40.0%	40.0%
2.2	Section B: Percentage of stocked item on han 1	EA		20.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
3	Section C- Automotive Parts - Brakes, related 1	PKG		\$28,738.31 \$28,738.31	\$34,216.906 \$34,216.91	\$37,790.73 \$37,790.73	\$29,983.16 \$29,983.16	\$29,983.16 \$29,983.16
3.1	723 Brake, Shoe	20	EA	\$29.00	<u>\$28.59</u>	\$37.16	No Bid	No Bid
3.2	3030 Brake, Booster	20	EA	No Bid	<u>\$56.79</u>	\$67.78	No Bid	No Bid
3.3	4148 Brake, Seal	200	EA	<u>\$5.69</u>	\$7.59	\$7.19	\$6.97	\$6.97
3.4	4160 Brake, Seal, Front, F250-F350	77	EA	\$9.89	\$9.59	<u>\$8.60</u>	\$11.63	\$11.63
3.5	7114 Brake, Pads Semi Metallic Rear F 150	22	EA	No Bid	\$41.59	<u>\$29.99</u>	No Bid	No Bid
3.6	145076 Front Rotor Ranger	60	EA	\$49.18	\$66.94	\$62.50	<u>\$44.95</u>	<u>\$44.95</u>
3.7	3W1Z1225AA Ford, Brake, Bearing	20	EA	No Bid	\$17.99	\$21.96	<u>\$13.49</u>	<u>\$13.49</u>
3.8	86605 Ford, Brake, Seal	14	EA	No Bid	\$7.69	\$42.97	<u>\$2.96</u>	<u>\$2.96</u>
3.9	8C3Z1190A Ford, Brake, Seal	40	EA	<u>\$4.69</u>	\$13.59	\$6.25	No Bid	No Bid

3.10	91505 Brake, Seal	100	EA	No Bid	<u>\$7.59</u>	\$10.94	\$10.29	\$10.29
3.11	98645 Oil Seal	4	EA	\$10.89	\$13.59	<u>\$8.40</u>	\$8.81	\$8.81
3.12	12 Brakes, Bearing	48	EA	No Bid	\$12.74	\$15.62	<u>\$8.01</u>	<u>\$8.01</u>
3.13	13 Brakes, Bearing	5	EA	No Bid	\$11.99	\$14.45	<u>\$9.09</u>	<u>\$9.09</u>
3.14	A1B Brakes, Bearing	40	EA	No Bid	\$13.49	\$11.35	<u>\$7.43</u>	<u>\$7.43</u>
3.15	A2 Brakes, Bearing	20	EA	\$7.29	\$11.99	\$14.30	<u>\$7.20</u>	<u>\$7.20</u>
3.16	AS Brakes, Bearing	75	EA	No Bid	\$11.99	\$14.61	<u>\$9.78</u>	<u>\$9.78</u>
3.17	A6 Brakes, Bearing	75	EA	\$8.79	\$14.24	\$15.83	<u>\$8.45</u>	<u>\$8.45</u>
3.18	EOA Z21498B Ford, Brakes, Brake Washer	25	EA	No Bid	No Bid	<u>\$6.30</u>	No Bid	No Bid
3.19	F67Z1SI I 77 ACA Ford, Axle, Seal	20	EA	No Bid	No Bid	<u>\$6.25</u>	No Bid	No Bid
3.20	MKD1012 Brake, Pads, Rear	30	EA	\$39.55	<u>\$24.04</u>	\$32.29	\$40.50	\$40.50
3.21	MKD1057AFM Rear Brakes, Rear Charger Sev 20	EA		\$41.59	\$42.24	<u>\$32.28</u>	\$34.06	\$34.06
3.22	MKD1058FM Brakes, Pads Front Charger 05-C	20	EA	\$52.29	\$46.14	\$36.42	<u>\$32.13</u>	<u>\$32.13</u>
3.23	MKD1066 Brakes, FSS0 w/ Sensor	13	EA	\$75.29	<u>\$29.24</u>	\$37.67	\$54.40	\$54.40
3.24	MKD067 Brake Pads	13	EA	No Bid	\$50.04	<u>\$29.99</u>	\$39.18	\$39.18
3.25	MKD1068 Brakes, Rear Pads Ford 05-08	10	EA	\$46.00	<u>\$27.94</u>	\$38.52	\$36.85	\$36.85
3.26	MKD1069 Brake, Pads, Front	10	EA	\$49.00	<u>\$25.34</u>	\$29.99	\$43.20	\$43.20
3.27	MKD1083 Brake, Pads, Front	39	EA	\$36.00	<u>\$25.334</u>	\$29.99	\$36.67	\$36.67
3.28	MKD679 Brake, Front Pads FISO- 200-2005	50	EA	\$44.49	<u>\$24.04</u>	\$32.27	\$27.71	\$27.71
3.29	MKD702 Brakes, Rear Pads (RAM 2500)	10	EA	\$49.00	<u>\$27.29</u>	\$36.42	\$34.06	\$34.06
3.30	MKD777FM Brakes, F450/550 99- 07 WO/SEN	10	EA	\$57.00	\$37.69	<u>\$30.07</u>	\$41.10	\$41.10
3.31	MKD785 Brake, Pads, Front	15	EA	\$52.00	<u>\$25.99</u>	\$29.99	\$30.48	\$30.48
3.32	MKD824 Brakes, Pads F350 Front	35	EA	\$41.00	\$44.84	<u>\$29.16</u>	\$35.93	\$35.93
3.33	MKD833 Brake, Pads, Front, Ran	80	EA	\$50.25	<u>\$25.99</u>	\$29.99	\$28.83	\$28.83
3.34	M KD931FM Brake, Pads, Titanium Metallic C	48	EA	\$52.00	\$43.54	<u>\$29.99</u>	\$31.43	\$31.43
3.35	MKD932FM Brakes, Pads, Titanium Metallic C	36	EA	\$50.25	\$32.49	<u>\$29.99</u>	\$31.24	\$31.24
3.36	PRTS258 Rear Rotor F350 Super Duty	10	EA	No Bid	<u>\$66.94</u>	\$91.50	\$69.95	\$69.95
3.37	PRT5519 Brake Front, Rotor	21	EA	<u>\$64.00</u>	\$103.34	\$118.50	\$139.99	\$139.99
3.38	PRTSS20 Ford FRT Rotor 7 Stud 2WD FISO	10	EA	<u>\$44.24</u>	\$119.59	\$130.50	\$139.00	\$139.00
3.39	PRT565 1 Brakes, Front Rotors H.D. Dodge M	12	EA	No Bid	\$63.69	\$165.20	<u>\$49.95</u>	<u>\$49.95</u>
3.40	PRT5739 Brakes, Rea r Rotor Dodge Mag/Cha	12	EA	No Bid	\$63.69	\$150.88	<u>\$54.95</u>	<u>\$54.95</u>
3.41	RS704 Brakes, Rear Shoes	4	EA	<u>\$22.00</u>	\$27.94	\$31.53	\$29.95	\$29.95
3.42	RS705 Brakes, Rear Shoes	4	EA	<u>\$28.00</u>	\$30.54	\$37.04	\$29.95	\$29.95
3.43	RS745 Brake, Emergency Brakes	4	EA	<u>\$16.00</u>	\$22.74	\$29.03	\$19.40	\$19.40
3.44	Section C: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA	25.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
4	Section D: Brakes/Miscellaneous Brake Parts	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
4.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	25.0%	45.0%	41.0%	40.0%	40.0%
4.2	Section D: Percentage of stocked item on har	1	EA	25.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
5	Section E: Automotive Parts - Chassis Steering	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
5.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	20.0%	28.0%	41.0%	40.0%	40.0%
5.2	Section E: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA	15.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
6	Section F: Automotive Parts- Drive Train (Trar	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
6.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	15.0%	15.0%	41.0%	40.0%	40.0%
6.2	Section F: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA	25.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
7	Section G: Automotive Parts- Electrical (Alter	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
7.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	20.0%	10.0%	41.0%	45.0%	45.0%
7.2	Section G: Percentage of stocked item on har	1	EA	25.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
8	Section H: Automotive Parts- Exhaust (Exhau	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
8.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	20.0%	20.0%	41.0%	40.0%	40.0%
8.2	Section H: Percentage of stocked item on har	1	EA	15.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
9	Section I: Automotive Parts: Fuel Emission-C	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
9.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	18.0%	34.0%	41.0%	40.0%	40.0%
9.2	Section I: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA	20.0%	10.0%	100.0%	75.0%	75.0%
10	Section J: Automotive Parts: Heating Air Con	1	PKG	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
10.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA		34.0%	41.0%	40.0%	40.0%

10.2	Section J: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA			10.0%		100.0%		75.0%		75.0%
11	Section K: Automotive Parts: Ignition (Engine	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
11.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	25.0%		34.0%		41.0%		40.0%		40.0%
11.2	Section K: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA	30.0%		10.0%		100.0%		75.0%		75.0%
12	Section L: Automotive Parts: Lamps Bulbs, Fla	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
12.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	25.0%		8.0%		41.0%		45.0%		40.0%
12.2	Section L: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA	35.0%		10.0%		100.0%		75.0%		75.0%
13	Section M: Automotive Parts: Shocks Struts (	1	PKG	No Bid		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
13.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA			17.0%		41.0%		40.0%		45.0%
13.2	Section M: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA			10.0%		100.0%		75.0%		75.0%
14	Section N: Automotive Parts: Wipers, Blades,	1	PKG	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
14.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA	20.0%		30.0%		41.0%		45.0%		40.0%
14.2	Section N: Percentage of stocked item on har	1	EA	35.0%		10.0%		100.0%		75.0%		75.0%
15	Section O: Automotive Parts: Service Lubricar	1	PKG	No Bid		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
15.1	Percent of Discount Offered	1	EA			5.0%		41.0%		40.0%		40.0%
15.2	Section O: Percentage of stocked item on har	1	EA			10.0%		100.0%		75.0%		75.0%
16	Section P: Automotive Parts: Brake Disc Pads,	1	PKG	\$38,816.80	\$38,816.80	<u>\$32,929.40</u>	\$32,929.40	\$63,210.60	\$63,210.60	\$40,997.10	\$40,997.10	\$40,997.10
16.1	Front Disc Pads #ATD931P w / abutment kit	100	Sets	\$46.62		<u>\$43.54</u>		\$76.59		\$57.89		\$57.89
16.2	Rear Disc Pads #ATD1040AP w/ abutment kit	100	Sets	<u>\$43.45</u>		\$50.04		\$58.23		\$65.90		\$65.90
16.3	Rotors #RB680110	100	EA	\$107.89		<u>\$72.79</u>		\$178.57		\$84.98		\$84.98
16.4	Rotors #RB680129	100	EA	\$79.00		<u>\$52.64</u>		\$127.96		\$74.95		\$74.95
16.5	Front Calipers# RC11381P	10	EA	\$59.08		\$52.64		<u>\$51.69</u>		\$61.53		\$61.53
16.6	Front Calipers #RC11382P	10	EA	\$59.08		\$52.64		<u>\$51.69</u>		\$61.53		\$61.53
16.7	Rear Calipers #RC11821P	10	EA	\$47.85		<u>\$43.54</u>		\$58.49		\$45.56		\$45.56
16.8	Rear Calipers #RC11822P	10	EA	\$47.85		<u>\$43.54</u>		\$58.49		\$45.56		\$45.56
16.9	Front Disc Pads #ATD1057P w/abutment kit	40	Sets	<u>\$41.37</u>		\$42.24		\$75.88		\$45.95		\$45.95
16.10	Rear Disc Pads #ATD1058P w/abutment kit	40	Sets	\$47.03		<u>\$46.14</u>		\$55.42		\$46.95		\$46.95
16.11	Rotors #780256P	60	EA	<u>\$59.88</u>		\$63.69		\$165.20		\$78.98		\$78.98
16.12	Front Calipers #RC11701P	5	EA	\$65.00		\$63.04		<u>\$60.22</u>		\$70.95		\$70.95
16.13	Front Calipers #RC11702P	5	EA	\$75.00		\$63.04		<u>\$60.22</u>		\$70.95		\$70.95
16.14	Rear Calipers #RC11767P	20	EA	\$57.67		\$55.89		<u>\$55.29</u>		\$65.95		\$65.95
16.15	Section P: Percentage of stocked item on han	1	EA	25.0%		10.0%		100.0%		75.0%		75.0%
17	Section Q: Automotive Parts: Package 2015 Fr	1	PKG	<u>\$21,838.30</u>	\$21,838.30	\$24,539.60	\$24,539.60	\$45,372.00	\$45,372.00	\$37,479.20	\$37,479.20	\$37,479.20
17.1	Front Disc #ATD1508SV w/abutment kit	100	Sets	<u>\$43.92</u>		\$46.14		\$84.48		\$75.62		\$75.62
17.2	Rear Disc Pads #ATD1377SV w/abutment kit	100	Sets	<u>\$32.15</u>		\$47.44		\$57.29		\$65.30		\$65.30
17.3	Rot or s Frt. #680758R	100	EA	<u>\$69.00</u>		\$73.44		\$169.02		\$119.99		\$119.99
17.4	Rotors RR #68686R	100	EA	<u>\$41.63</u>		\$55.24		\$114.59		\$86.98		\$86.98
17.5	Front Calipers #RC12051	10	EA	\$54.89		<u>\$52.64</u>		\$66.48		\$59.00		\$59.00
17.6	Front Calipers #RC12052	10	EA	\$69.30		<u>\$52.64</u>		\$66.48		\$59.00		\$59.00
17.7	Rear Calipers RC12563P	10	EA	\$96.32		<u>\$63.04</u>		\$75.22		\$75.51		\$75.51
17.8	Rear Calipers RC12564P	10	EA	\$96.32		<u>\$63.04</u>		\$75.22		\$75.51		\$75.51
17.9	Section Q: Percentage of stocked item on har	1	EA	10.0%		10.0%		41.0%		75.0%		75.0%

Line #
1
1.1
1.2
1.3
1.4
1.5
1.6
1.7
1.8
1.9
1.10
1.11
1.12
1.13
1.14
1.15
1.16
1.17
1.18
1.19
1.20
1.21
1.22
1.23
1.24
1.25
1.26
1.27
1.28
1.29
1.30
1.31
1.32
1.33
1.34
1.35
1.36
1.37
1.38
1.39
1.40
1.41
1.42
1.43
1.44
1.45
1.46
1.47
1.48
1.49
1.50
1.51

1.52
1.53
1.54
1.55
1.56
1.57
1.58
1.59
1.60
1.61
1.62
1.63
1.64
1.65
1.66
1.67
1.68
1.69
1.70
1.71
1.72
1.73
1.74
1.75
1.76
1.77
1.78
1.79
1.80
1.81
1.82
1.83
1.84
1.85
1.86
1.87
1.88
1.89
1.90
1.91
1.92
1.93
1.94
1.95
1.96
1.97
1.98
1.99
2
2.1
2.2
3
3.1
3.2
3.3

3.4
3.5
3.6
3.7
3.8
3.9
3.10
3.11
3.12
3.13
3.14
3.15
3.16
3.17
3.18
3.19
3.20
3.21
3.22
3.23
3.24
3.25
3.26
3.27
3.28
3.29
3.30
3.31
3.32
3.33
3.34
3.35
3.36
3.37
3.38
3.39
3.40
3.41
3.42
3.43
3.44
4
4.1
4.2
5
5.1
5.2
6
6.1
6.2
7
7.1
7.2
8
8.1

8.2
9
9.1
9.2
10
10.1
10.2
11
11.1
11.2
12
12.1
12.2
13
13.1
13.2
14
14.1
14.2
15
15.1
15.2
16
16.1
16.2
16.3
16.4
16.5
16.6
16.7
16.8
16.9
16.10
16.11
16.12
16.13
16.14
16.15
17
17.1
17.2
17.3
17.4
17.5
17.6
17.7
17.8
17.9

Line #
1
1.1
1.2

1.3
1.4
1.5
1.6
1.7
1.8
1.9
1.10
1.11
1.12
1.13
1.14
1.15
1.16
1.17
1.18
1.19
1.20
1.21
1.22
1.23
1.24
1.25
1.26
1.27
1.28
1.29
1.30
1.31
1.32
1.33
1.34
1.35
1.36
1.37
1.38
1.39
1.40
1.41
1.42
1.43
1.44
1.45
1.46
1.47
1.48
1.49
1.50
1.51
1.52
1.53
1.54
1.55
1.56
1.57

1.58
1.59
1.60
1.61
1.62
1.63
1.64
1.65
1.66
1.67
1.68
1.69
1.70
1.71
1.72
1.73
1.74
1.75
1.76
1.77
1.78
1.79
1.80
1.81
1.82
1.83
1.84
1.85
1.86
1.87
1.88
1.89
1.90
1.91
1.92
1.93
1.94
1.95
1.96
1.97
1.98
1.99
2
2.1
2.2
3
3.1
3.2
3.3
3.4
3.5
3.6
3.7
3.8
3.9

3.10
3.11
3.12
3.13
3.14
3.15
3.16
3.17
3.18
3.19
3.20
3.21
3.22
3.23
3.24
3.25
3.26
3.27
3.28
3.29
3.30
3.31
3.32
3.33
3.34
3.35
3.36
3.37
3.38
3.39
3.40
3.41
3.42
3.43
3.44
4
4.1
4.2
5
5.1
5.2
6
6.1
6.2
7
7.1
7.2
8
8.1
8.2
9
9.1
9.2
10
10.1

10.2
11
11.1
11.2
12
12.1
12.2
13
13.1
13.2
14
14.1
14.2
15
15.1
15.2
16
16.1
16.2
16.3
16.4
16.5
16.6
16.7
16.8
16.9
16.10
16.11
16.12
16.13
16.14
16.15
17
17.1
17.2
17.3
17.4
17.5
17.6
17.7
17.8
17.9