Mike's Western Wear GMES LLC
Laredo, Texas Columbia, Missouri
Sections Total price Qty 1 each Total price Qty 1 each 5 % Local Perference
2 $5,318.25 $4,462.65 17%
4 $1,709.45 $1,578.95 8%
7 no bid $461.35
8 $624.75 $459.45 27%
9 no bid $1,059.50
11 no bid $103.15
Mike's western wear GMES LLC USA CONTRACT SOLUTIONS LLC
Total Price $656,785.00( Total Price $695,177.50( Total Price $1,352,545.50
Line#  Description Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 The City of Laredo, is herein soliciting formal bids from interested pal
Section | - Ariat Brand or Approved EqualThe quantities are
2 estimates and are based on the best available information. If
quoting approved equal, item must be approved by our Risk
Management.See attributes tab for pictures $465,100.00 $465,100.00| $394,225.00 $394,225.00f $776,767.00 $776,767.00
2.1 Ariat Steel Toe Round Toe Shape Brown ASTM F2413see AR0014241 or
attributes tab for pictures approved equal 100 EA $134.95 $104.40 $199.68
2.2 priat Composite Toe Brown Carbon toe is ASTM F2413-18 M I/C  AR10031483 or
EH ratedsee attributes tab for pictures approved equal 100 EA $174.95 $158.15 $298.77
Ariat WorkHog XT Cognac Waterproof Round Carbon Toe Work
23 Boots ASTM F2413 M/I/C EH Rated Cognac Tansee attributes tab for AR0045435 or
pictures approved equal 100 EA $169.95 $150.65 $298.77
Ariat Overdrive Alamo Brown Square Composite Toe Work Boot
24 Brown Square Composite Toe (ASTM F2413-11 M/1/75 C/75 EH AR0011933 or
rated for safety) approved equal 100  EA $164.95 $143.75 $280.60
Ariat Rebar Wedge Distressed Brown Waterproof Round
2.5 Composite Toe Pull-On Work Boots Soft Round Toe ASTM F2413 AR0053613 or
M/I/C EH approved equal 100 EA $149.95 $125.65 $248.98
Ariat WorkHog Earth Brown and Brick Orange Square Steel Toe
26 Work Boot Steel Toe - ASTM F2413-05 F1/75 C/75 EH Rated Dark AR006961 or
Brown approved equal 100  EA $164.95 $144.40 $267.65
2.7 Ariat Workhog Xt Waterproof Composite Toe Pull On Work Boots  AR0024968 or
Carbon toe is ASTM F2413-18 M I/C EH rated Brown approved equal 100 EA $174.95 $158.15 $298.77
2.8 Ariat Workhog Xt Waterproof Composite Toe Pull On Work Boots ~ AR0024966 or
Carbon toe is ASTM F2413-18 M I/C EH rated Cognac Tan approved equal 100  EA $174.95 $158.15 $298.77
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2.9

2.10

211

212

2.13

2.14

2.15

2.16

2.17

2.18

2.19

2.20

221

Ariat Rebar Flex Brown and Olive Waterproof Wide Square
Composite Toe Work Boot Wide Square Toe Composite Toe ASTM
F2413-11 M 1/75 C/75 EH Rated Brown Foot Olive Upper

Ariat Rebar Flex SD Brown and Grey Wide Square Composite Toe
Work Boot Distressed Brown Foot Stone Grey Upper Wide Square
Composite Toe ASTM F2413 M/1/C SD 35 Rated

Ariat Sierra Aged Bark Wide Square Steel Toe Work Boots Wide
Square Toe Steel Toe ASTM F2413-05 M/1/75 C/75 EH Rated
Distressed

Ariat WorkHog XT Patriot Distressed Brown Embroidered Flag
Waterproof Square Carbon Toe Work Boot Distressed Brown Full-
Grain Leather Embroidered Flag on Upper Wide Square Toe Safety
Toe is ASTM F2413-18 M I/C EH Rated

Ariat Groundbreaker Brown Waterproof Square Steel Toe Work
Boot Square Steel Toe Distress Safety toe is ATSM F2413-11 M/1/75
C/75 EH rated.

Ariat Sierra Shock Shield Patriot Distressed Brown American Flag

Square Steel Toe Work Boots Brown Distressed Brown Stamped Flag

Design on Upper Wide Square Toe Steel Safety Toe, ASTM F2413
M/1/C Rated Meets ASTM F2413 Standards

Ariat Sierra Shock Shield Black Square Steel Toe Work Boots Black

Ariat WorkHog Bruin Brown and Coffee Waterproof Square
Composite Toe Work Boots Distress Safety toe is ASTM F2413-11
M/1/75 C/75 EH rated. Bruin Brown Pull Straps Mesh Lining
Composite Square Toe

Ariat Intrepid VentTEK Composite Toe Work Boot Certification:

ASTM F2413-11 M I/75 C/75 EH Rated Toe Shape: Square Safety Toe:

Composite Toe Dark brown

Ariat Men's 10034156 Distressed Brown Black Composite Toe H20
Western Work Boot Brown Composite Safety Toe- ASTM F2413-05
M 1/75 C/75

Ariat WorkHog XT Rye Brown and Storm VentTEK Waterproof
Square Carbon Toe Work Boot Rye Brown Foot Storm Grey Upper
Square Composite Toe Safety Toe is ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH Rated

Ariat WorkHog XT Phoenix Distressed Brown Wide Square Carbon
Toe Work Boots Distressed Brown Wide Square Composite Toe
ASTM F2413 M/I/C EH Rated

Ariat WorkHog Composite Toe Work Boots Safety toe is ASTM
F2413-11 M/1/75 C/75 EH rated Green upper Dark Brown

AR0021486 or
approved equal

AR0053616 or
approved equal

AR0010134 or
approved equal

AR0036002 or
approved equal

AR0015196 or

approved equal

AR0044426 or

approved equal

AR0046929 or
approved equal

AR0017420 or
approved equal

AR0020072 or
approved equal

AR0034156 or
approved equal

AR0036005 or
approved equal

AR0046931 or
approved equal

AR0020084 or
approved equal

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

$144.95

$149.95

$144.95

$174.95

$144.95

$154.95

$149.95

$169.95

$169.95

$154.95

$179.95

$169.95

$169.95

$119.40

$125.65

$120.65

$154.40

$116.90

$131.90

$125.65

$150.65

$150.65

$133.15

$161.90

$148.15

$148.15

$326.72

$248.98

$224.68

$298.77

$230.60

$261.52

$248.98

$280.80

$292.65

$255.70

$311.52

$298.77

$286.82
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2.22

2.23

2.24

2.25

2.26

2.27

2.28

2.29

2.30

231

2.32

2.33

2.34

Ariat Intrepid Brown and Orange VentTEK Square Composite Toe
Work Boot Brown Brown and Orange Upper Square Toe Composite
Toe ASTM F2413-11 M 1/75 C/75 EH Rated

Ariat Women's Anthem Dark Chocolate with Serape VentTEK
Waterproof Wide Square Composite Toe Work Boot Safety Toe,
ASTM F2413 F/I1/C Rated Meets ASTM F2413 Standards for EH
Resistant Footwear Meets ASTM F3445 Safety Standards for Slip
Resistance

Ariat Women's Krista Dark Brown Met Guard Wide Square Steel
Toe Work Boots Dark Brown Wide Square Steel Toe Safety Toe is
ASTM F2413-18 F I/C Mt EH Rated

Ariat Women's Tracey Dusted Brown Round Composite Toe Work
Boots Brown Foot Tan Upper Blue & Orange Six-Row Stitch Pattern
Round Toe Composite Toe ASTM F2413-11 1/75 C/75 EH Rated

Ariat Edge LTE Dark Brown Bantamweight Chukka Round
Composite Toe Lace Up Work Boot Dark Brown Chukka Work Boot
Lace Up Round Toe Composite Toe Rated F2413-11 M I/75 C/75 E

Ariat Edge LTE Dark Brown Waterproof Bantamweight Moc Round
Composite Toe Lace Up Work Boot

Ariat Rebar Flex Chocolate Round Composite Toe Lace Up Work
Boot Brown Round Toe Composite Toe ASTM F2413-11 M 1/75 C/75
EH Rated

Ariat Groundbreaker Dark Brown Waterproof Round Steel Toe
Chelsea Work Boot Dark Brown Round Toe Steel Toe ASTM F2413-
11 M 1/75 C/75 EH Rated

Ariat Edge LTE Dark Brown Bantamweight Moc Round Composite
Toe Lace Up Work Boot Dark Brown Safety Toe Rated ASTM F2413-
11 M 1/75 C/75 EH Round Moc Toe Lace Up

Ariat Rebar Lift Distressed Brown Round Composite Toe Chukka
Work Boot Distressed Brown Round Moc Toe Composite Toe Meets
ASTM F2413 M/I/C EH Standards

Ariat Outpace Shift Mid Dark Shadow Round Composite Toe Work
Shoe Dark Grey & Blue Ripstop and Rubber Round Composite Toe
ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH Rated

Ariat Rebar Lift Distressed Brown Waterproof Round Composite
Toe 8" Lace Up Work Boots Full Grain Leather Distressed Brown
Round Composite Toe ASTM F2413 M/I/C EH Rated

Ariat Rebar Wedge Distressed Brown Moc Composite Toe 6"
Waterproof Lace Up Work Boot Distressed Brown Round Moc Toe
Composite Toe ASTM F2413 M/I/C EH Rated

AR0023042 or
approved equal

AR0050827 or
approved equal

AR0033994 or
approved equal

AR008634 or
approved equal

AR10024951 or
approved equal

AR10024956 or
approved equal

AR10021495 or
approved equal

AR0024983 or
approved equal

AR10024954 or
approved equal

AR0050837 or
approved equal

AR0050844 or
approved equal

AR0047028 or
approved equal

AR0053615 or
approved equal

100

100

100

100

50

50

50

50

50

50

50

50

50

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

$169.95

$144.95

$144.95

$134.95

$129.95

$134.95

$129.95

$134.95

$124.95

$134.95

$119.95

$149.95

$144.95

$150.65

$119.40
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4

$292.55

$236.53

$230.90

$205.70

$230.30

$199.68

$186.73

$211.63

$199.88

$211.63

$168.66

$248.98

$236.53
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2.35

4.1

4.2

4.3

4.4

4.5

4.6

4.7

4.8

Ariat Edge LTE Dark Brown Round Composite Toe Slip On Work
Boot Slip On 3" Total Height Brown Round Toe Composite Toe
ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C

AR0029530 or
approved equal 50 EA

Section IIl - Twisted X Brand or Approved EqualThe quantities are
estimates and are based on the best available information. If
quoting approved equal, item must be approved by our Risk
Management.See attributes tab for pictures

Twisted X Oiled Saddle Brown Round Composite Moc Toe Hiker

Work Boots Full Grain Leather Distressed Saddle Brown Round Moc

Toe Composite Safety Toe Meets or Exceeds ANSI Standards ASTM ~ XMHKBCW1 or

F2413-18 M/I/C EH approved equal 100 EA

Twisted X Distressed Saddle Brown CellStretch MetGuard Round
Nano Composite Toe Work Boot Distressed Saddle Brown Nano
Composite Safety Toe Meets or Exceeds ANSI Standards ASTM
F2413-18 M/I/C MT EH

XMXCNMOL1 or
approved equal 100 EA

Twisted X Mens Charcoal and Grey Wide Square Composite Toe
Work Boots Charcoal Water Resistant DuraTWX Hybrid Leather Foot
Grey Leather Upper Wide Square Toe Composite Toe Safety Toe
Meets or Exceeds ANSI Standards ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH

XMXBAOO2 or
approved equal 100 EA

Twisted X Men's Mocha Brown and Navy Blue with Cross
Embroidery Waterproof Wide Square Alloy Toe Work Boot Wide
Square Toe Alloy Safety Toe Toe Meets or Exceeds ANSI Standards
ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C MT EH

XMXBAWO1 or
approved equal 100 EA

Twisted X Brown Caiman Print Foot and Grey CellStretch Wide

Square Composite Toe Work Boots Brown Mini Caiman Print Foot

Grey Upper Wide Square Toe Composite Toe ANSI: ASTM F2413-18 XMXBNOO5 or

M/I/C EH approved equal 100 EA

Twisted X Bomber Brown with Cross UltralLite X Wide Square Nano
Composite Toe Work Boots Leather Bomber Brown Wide Square
Nano Composite Toe ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH

XMULNWO3 or
approved equal 100 EA

Twisted X Brown and Dark Blue with Cross UltraLite X Wide Square
Nano Composite Toe Work Boots Brown Foot Dark Blue Upper Wide XMULAWO2 or
Square Nano Composite Toe ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH approved equal 100 EA

Twisted X Rust Brown and Sky Blue with Barbwire Embroidery

CellStretch Square Alloy Toe Work Cowboy Boot Rust Brown Foot

Blue Upper White Barbwire Embroidery Alloy Square Toe Toe Meets XMXBAQOO1 or

or Exceeds ANSI Standards ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH approved equal 100 EA

$129.95

$141,955.00

$149.95

$159.95

$164.95

$169.95

$159.95

$159.95

No Bid

$164.95

$141,955.00

$98.75

$134,392.50

$124.40

$136.90

$143.15

$150.00

$137.50

$136.90

$136.90

$143.15

$134,392.50
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$192.96

$268,636.00

$248.98

$273.87

$286.62

$298.77

$273.87

$273.87

$273.87

$286.62

$268,636.00




4.9

4.10

4.11

4.12

7.1

7.2

7.3

7.4

8.1

8.2

8.3

Twisted X Oiled Saddle Brown Composite Toe Wedge Chelsea Work
Boots Oiled Saddle Brown Nano Composite Safety Toe Safety Toe
Meets or Exceeds ANSI standards ASTM F2413-18 M/1/C MT EH

Twisted X Cognac Waterproof CellStretch Square Composite Toe
Lace Up Work Boot Wide Square Toe CellStretch Technology Alloy
Toe - ANSI: ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH

Twisted X Khaki Shitake Waterproof CellStretch Round Nano
Composite Toe Work Boot Shitake Brown Round Nano Composite
Toe Safety Toe ANSI: ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH Rated

Twisted X Charcoal Round Steel Toe Chuckka Driving Moc Work
Shoe Round Toe Steel Toe Meets or Exceeds ASTM F2413-18 I/C EH

Section VI - Durango brand or Approved EqualThe quantities are
estimates and are based on the best available information. If
quoting approved equal, item must be approved by our Risk
Management.see attributes tab for pictures.

Durango Rebel Distressed Brown and American Flag Square Steel
Toe Work Boot American Flag Upper Square Toe Steel Toe ASTM
F2413-11 EH Rated

Durango Rebel Brown and Tan Waterproof Square Steel Toe Work
Boot Brown Foot Tan Upper Square Toe Steel Toe ASTM F2413
Protective Toe ASTM F2413 EH Standard

Durango Rebel Brown Square Steel Toe Work Boot Brown Foot
Brown Upper Square Toe Steel Toe ASTM F2413-05 1/75 C/75
Protective Toe ASTM F2413 EH Standard

Durango Women's Lady Rebel Brown and Turquoise Square Steel
Toe Work Boot Distressed Brown Foot Turquoise Upper Embroidery
on Shaft Square Toe Steel Toe ASTM F2413 EH Rated

Section VII - Wolverine or Approved EqualThe quantities are
estimates and are based on the best available information. If
quoting approved equal, item must be approved by our Risk
Management.See attributes tab for pictures

Wolverine Rancher Flag LX Brown Wide Square Steel Toe Work
Boots Embossed Flag Design on Upper Wide Square Toe Steel Toe
ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH Rated

Wolverine 10in Steel Toe Waterproof ASTM F2413-18

Wolverine Floorhand Brown Waterproof Round Steel Toe
Wellington Work Boot Brown Round Toe Steel Toe ASTM F2413-11
M 1/75 C/75 EH Rated Waterproof

XMCANOO1 or
approved equal

XMXALWO1 or
approved equal

XMXCNWO06 or
approved equal

XMDMSTO3 or
approved equal

DUDBO020 or
approved equal

DUDBO019 or
approved equal

DUDB4343 or
approved equal

DUDWRD022
or approved
equal

WV241184 or
approved equal

WV10765 or
approved equal

WV10680 or
approved equal

50

50

50

50

100

100

100

100

100

100

100

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

$134.95

$164.95

$154.95

$124.95

No Bid

No Bid

$49,730.00

$124.95

$124.95

$119.95

$49,730.00

$106.25

$143.15

$130.65

$90.00

$46,135.00

$115.65

$115.65

$115.65

$114.40

$36,567.50

$93.75

$93.75

$84.40

$46,135.00

$36,567.50
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$211.63

$286.32

$261.32

$180.51

$86,205.00

$217.85

$224.68

$211.63

$207.89

$67,385.50

$168.86

$168.66

$155.61

$86,205.00

$67,385.50




8.4

8.5

9.1

9.2

9.3

9.4

9.5

9.6

11

Wolverine 1-90 EPX Romeo CarbonMax Brown Waterproof Round
Composite Toe Chelsea Work Boots Round Composite Toe ASTM
F2413-18 M 1/75 C/75 EH Rated

Wolverine Tradesman Sudan Brown Waterproof Moc Steel Toe
Wedge Work Boots ASTM F2413-18 M/I/C EH Rated

Section VIII - Thorogood brand or Approved EqualThe quantities are
estimates and are based on the best available information. If
quoting approved equal, item must be approved by our Risk
Management.

Thorogood American Heritage Crazy Horse & Pebble Brown Wide
Square Steel Toe Work Boots Pebble Brown Foot Trail Crazy Horse
Brown Upper Wide Square Toe Steel Toe ASTM F3445-21

Thorogood American Heritage Trail Crazy Horse Steel Moc Toe
Wellington Work Boots ASTM F3445-21

Thorogood American Heritage Black and Crazy Horse Waterproof
Square Steel Toe Work Boots ASTM F2413 or ASTM F2892

Thorogood American Heritage Crazy Horse Brown Moc Steel Toe 8"
Lace Up Work Boot ANSI/ASTM 175 & C75 EH Rated

Thorogood American Heritage Crazy Horse Brown Moc Steel Toe 6"
Lace Up Work Boot ANSI/ASTM 175 & C75 EH Rated

Thorogood 8in. Lace Up Steel Toe Waterproof ASTM F2413-18

Section X - Timberland or Approved EqualThe quantities are
estimates and are based on the best available information. If
quoting approved equal, item must be approved by our Risk
Management.

Timberland PRO Men's Titan Brown Round Alloy Toe Lace Up Work
Boot meet or exceed ASTM standards

Freight charges if any

Freight charges if any

WV10791 or
approved equal 50 EA

WV231103 or
approved equal 50 EA

TG8044331 or
approved equal 100 EA

TG8043311 or
approved equal 100 EA

TG8044330 or
approved equal 100 EA

TB8044378 or
approved equal 50 EA

TG8044375 or
approved equal 50 EA

TG8403800 or
approved equal 50 EA

TB150506242
or approved
equal 50 EA

$134.95

$119.95

No Bid

No Bid

$103.15

84.4

:

$78,700.00

164.5

178.7

:

171.2

178.7

172.5

EEE T

193.7

$5,157.50

$103.15

$78,700.00

$5,157.50
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$192.69

$168.76

$144,215.50

$292.55

$336.62

$298.77

$336.92

$323.67

$367.84

$9,336.50

$186.73

$144,215.50

$9,336.50




