
Total Price $1,050.12 Total Price $2,929.43

Line # Description QTY UOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended

1

Discount (40 Points): An evaluation of the discount to the City of 

Laredo. Proposal pricing shall be a cost-plus, fixed price, or 

discount from list format. 1 PKG

1.1 Fixed Price Schedule 1 Discount 0.0% 0.0%

1.2 Cost Plus Percentage 1 Discount 0.0% 0.0%

1.3 Discount from List Price. 1 Discount 7.0% 3.0%

2

Pricing (15 Points): An evaluation of the pricing to the City of 

Laredo. The City’s net price shall be F.O.B City of Laredo facilities, 

freight pre-paid. Provide proposed pricing for all the commodities 

listed. **Shall be used for evaluation and scoring purposes only. 

** 1 PKG $1,050.12 $1,050.12 $2,929.43 $2,929.43

2.1 Pre-Filter Blanket (5"W x 33"L, fits filter size F8-109)(Item 10464) 

or approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $29.05

2.2
Blower Filter Monitor Kit for Vacuum Pick-Up Ring Sensing Point 

(Item 58142) or approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $58.15

2.3
Wide Mouth Square Bottle, HDPE 4 L 6/CS(Item 201343) or 

approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $260.83

2.4
COD Standard Solution, 1000 ppm 200 ml, 2253929(Item 201952) 

or approved equal. 1 Each $30.35 $33.46

2.5 Sealing Tape 3” (Item 330787) or approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $6.97

2.6 (HM) Hach Nessier Reagent 500 mL, 2119449(Item 200419) or 

approved equal. 1 Each $72.15 $79.53

2.7 Premium Safety Pipet Bulb, Red w/ 3 SS Balls(Item 40671) or 

approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $28.52

2.8
Rectangular HDPE Carboy w/Cap 20L/5.3gal Nalgene 2211-0050 

(Item 28827) or approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $211.41

2.9
Universal Sorbent Pads Heavy Weight, Case of 100(Item 50404) or 

approved equal. 1 Each $67.72 $91.13

2.10
Aggressive Sorbent Roll 30” W x 150’L (Item 96913) or approved 

equal. 1 Each No Bid $195.89

2.11
Industrial Discharge Hose 1.5” x 50’ MxF Quick Alum(Item 88523) 

or approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $273.49

2.12 (OR) Sodium Arsenite, 0.5% 500mL (Item 29769) 1 Each $15.80 $21.00

2.13
(OR) Sufuric Acid, Conc., ACS Grade, 500 mL (Item 29875) or 

approved equal. 1 Each $31.64 $27.79

2.14 Double Strength TSB 100-mL 35mm, Box of 100(Item 38118) or 

approved equal. 1 Each $40.44 $43.84

2.15
Rectangular HDPE Carboy w/Cap 20L/5.3gal, Nalgene 2211-0050 

(Item 28827) or approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $211.41
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2.16 Hach DR300 Chlorine Pocket Colorimeter‚ LPV445.97.00110 (Item 

87890) or approved equal 1 Each $587.20 $669.30

2.17 Glass Disposal Basket (Item 40679) or approved equal. 1 Each $79.73 $116.64

2.18
DWK Life Sciences (Kimble) Kimax Heavy Wall Filtering Flask, 4000 

mL (Item 201491) or approved equal. 1 Each No Bid $274.46

2.19
Hach Chlorine Standard Solution 25-30 mg/L 2 mL PourRite 

Ampules, 20/pk, 2630020 (Item 32520) or approved equal. 1 Each $67.05 $75.55

2.20
DWK Life Sciences (Wheaton) Imhoff Settling Cones, W990800, 

Pack of 4 (Item 41369) or approved equal. 1 Each $58.04 $221.01

3 Shipping (5 Points) 1 PKG

3.1 Free shipping on orders above $____________. (5 Points) 1 Shipping $0.00 $0.00
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