Polydyne Inc. Baker Services, Inc. iFrida Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC
Total Price $875,145.00( Total Price $984,700.00 Total Price| $1,892,670.00 Total Price| $2,299,136.00
Line # Description QrTY UuomM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Section | —Chemical Bid Price ScheduleNote: Unit price shall include fr 1 EA $875,145.00 $875,145.00 $984,700.00 $984,700.00 $1,892,670.00 $1,892,670.00 | $2,299,136.00  $2,299,136.00
1.1 Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (50%)Average order (47,000 Ibs.) 9 Bulk (lbs) No Bid No Bid $32,430.00 No Bid
1.2 Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (50%)Average order (275 Gal. Tote) 9 275 Gallon Tote (Gallon) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.3 Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (25%)Average order (47,000 Ibs.) 9 Bulk (Ibs.) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.4 calcium HypochloriteAverage order (40 drums) 90 100 Ib. Drums No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15  Liquid ChlorineAverage order (2,000 Ibs. cylinders) 1120 2000 Ib.Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.6 Liquid ChlorineAverage order (150 Ibs. cylinders) 630 150 Ib Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.7  LiquidAluminum Sulfate(50%)Average order (48,000 Ibs.) 145 Bulk (lbs) No Bid No Bid $11,040.00 $4,540.80
1.8  Cationic PolymerAverage order (45,000 Ibs.) 10 Bulk (Ibs.) $40,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.9 AnionicPolymerAverage order (270 Gal. Tote) 10 270 Gallon Tote (Gallon) $3,657.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.10 Liquid Ammonium SulfateAverage order (50,000 lbs.) 50 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid $9,950.00 No Bid $7,900.00
111 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate with 1% Copper SulfateAverage order
(48,000 Ibs.) 145 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,976.00
1.12  Wastewater PolymerAverage order (25,000 Ibs.) 9 Bulk (Ibs.) $44,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.13  Wastewater PolymerAverage order (55 Gal. drums) 50 55 gallon drum $796.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
114 Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (38%-40%)Average order (48,000 Ibs.) 50 Bulk (Ibs). No Bid $9,744.00 No Bid $7,584.00
Univar Solutions USA Inc. Chemrite, Inc. Hawkins Inc. Pencco, Inc
Total Price $27.14| Total Price $197.10 Total Price $198,603.00 Total Price $730,100.00
Line # Description QTY UoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Section | —Chemical Bid Price ScheduleNote: Unit price shall include fr 1 EA $27.14 $27.14 $197.10 $197.10 $198,603.00 $198,603.00 $730,100.00 $730,100.00
1.1  Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (50%)Average order (47,000 Ibs.) 9 Bulk (lbs) $0.22 No Bid $11,938.00 No Bid
1.2 Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (50%)Average order (275 Gal. Tote) 9 275 Gallon Tote (Gallon) No Bid No Bid $1,575.00 No Bid
1.3 Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (25%)Average order (47,000 Ibs.) 9 Bulk (Ibs.) $0.13 No Bid $8,554.00 No Bid
1.4  Calcium HypochloriteAverage order (40 drums) 90 100 Ib. Drums No Bid $2.19 No Bid No Bid
1.5  Liquid ChlorineAverage order (2,000 Ibs. cylinders) 1120 2000 Ib.Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.6  Liquid ChlorineAverage order (150 lbs. cylinders) 630 150 Ib Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.7  LiquidAluminum Sulfate(50%)Average order (48,000 Ibs.) 145 Bulk (lbs) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.8  Cationic PolymerAverage order (45,000 Ibs.) 10 Bulk (Ibs.) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.9  AnionicPolymerAverage order (270 Gal. Tote) 10 270 Gallon Tote (Gallon) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.10  Liquid Ammonium SulfateAverage order (50,000 Ibs.) 50 Bulk (Ibs.) $0.24 No Bid No Bid $7,450.00
111 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate with 1% Copper SulfateAverage order
(48,000 Ibs.) 145 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.12 Wastewater PolymerAverage order (25,000 Ibs.) 9 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.13  Wastewater PolymerAverage order (55 Gal. drums) 50 55 gallon drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
114 Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (38%-40%)Average order (48,000 Ibs.) 50 Bulk (Ibs). $0.24 No Bid No Bid $7,152.00
Brenntag Southwest, Inc.
Total Price| $4,070,780.00
Line#  Description QTY uom Unit Extended
1 Section | —Chemical Bid Price ScheduleNote: Unit price shall include fr 1 EA $4,070,780.00 $4,070,780.00
1.1  Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (50%)Average order (47,000 Ibs.) 9 Bulk (lbs) $16,450.00
1.2 Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (50%)Average order (275 Gal. Tote) 9 275 Gallon Tote (Gallon) $1,680.00
1.3 Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (25%)Average order (47,000 Ibs.) 9 Bulk (lbs.) $14,100.00
1.4  Calcium HypochloriteAverage order (40 drums) 90 100 Ib. Drums $319.00
1.5  Liquid ChlorineAverage order (2,000 Ibs. cylinders) 1120 2000 Ib.Cylinder $2,475.00
1.6  Liquid ChlorineAverage order (150 Ibs. cylinders) 630 150 Ib Cylinder No Bid
1.7  LiquidAluminum Sulfate(50%)Average order (48,000 Ibs.) 145 Bulk (lbs) No Bid
1.8  Cationic PolymerAverage order (45,000 Ibs.) 10 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid
1.9  AnionicPolymerAverage order (270 Gal. Tote) 10 270 Gallon Tote (Gallon) No Bid
1.10 Liquid Ammonium SulfateAverage order (50,000 lbs.) 50 Bulk (lbs.) $10,000.00
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Liquid Aluminum Sulfate with 1% Copper SulfateAverage order
(48,000 Ibs.)

Wastewater PolymerAverage order (25,000 Ibs.)

Wastewater PolymerAverage order (55 Gal. drums)

Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (38%-40%)Average order (48,000 lbs.)

145

50

50

Bulk (Ibs.)
Bulk (Ibs.)
55 gallon drum

Bulk (Ibs).

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$9,600.00
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