Battery Systems Inc

Advance Auto Parts

Gonzalez Auto Parts (Laredo

Total Price $118,001.45 Total Price $178,381.80 Total Price $226,304.50
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Section |A: Battery Price Built in USA 1 Year F1 Pkg No Bid $80,564.25 $80,564.25|No Bid

1.1 Battery Group: BAT-24 Reserve Capacity Ratii 25 Each $82.40
1.2 Battery Group: BAT-24F Reserve Capacity Rat 25 Each $82.40
1.3 Battery Group: BAT-27 Reserve Capacity Ratii 10 Each

1.4  Battery Group: BAT-26R Reserve Capacity Ral35 Each $82.40
1.5 Battery Group: BAT-31P Reserve Capacity Rat 100 Each $82.40
1.6 Battery Group: BAT-31S Reserve Capacity Rat 265 Each 82.40
1.7 Battery Group: BAT-34 Reserve Capacity Ratii 25 Each $66.99
1.8 Battery Group: BAT-35 Reserve Capacity Ratii 10 Each No Bid
1.9  Battery Group: BAT-40R Reserve Capacity Rai 20 Each No Bid
1.10 Battery Group: BAT-47 Reserve Capacity Ratii 10 Each No Bid
1.11  Battery Group: BAT-48 Reserve Capacity Ratil 65 Each No Bid
1.12  Battery Group: BAT-49 Reserve Capacity Ratii125  Each No Bid
1.13  Battery Group: BAT-58 Reserve Capacity Ratii 60 Each $103.17
1.14 Battery Group: BAT-58R Reserve Capacity Rai 15 Each No Bid
1.15 Battery Group: BAT-59 Reserve Capacity Ratii 15 Each No Bid
1.16  Battery Group: BAT-65 Reserve Capacity Ratii 375 Each $82.40
1.17 Battery Group: BAT-75 Reserve Capacity Ratii 20 Each $82.40
1.18 Battery Group: BAT-78 Reserve Capacity Ratii 30 Each $66.99
1.19 Battery Group: BAT-86 Reserve Capacity Ratii 15 Each No Bid
1.20 Battery Group: BAT-94R Reserve Capacity Rai 55 Each No Bid
1.21  Battery Group: BAT-UIL Reserve Capacity Rat 15 Each $20.76
1.22  Battery Group: BAT-UIR Reserve Capacity Rat 20 Each $37.51

2 Section IB: Battery Price Built in USA 11/2 Yel Pkg No Bid $97,817.55 $97,817.55|No Bid

2.1  Battery Group: BAT-24 Reserve Capacity Ratil 25 Each $103.17
2.2 Battery Group: BAT-24F Reserve Capacity Rat 25 Each $103.17
2.3 Battery Group: BAT-27 Reserve Capacity Ratii 10 Each 103.17
2.4 Battery Group: BAT-26R Reserve Capacity Ral 35 Each $103.17
2.5 Battery Group: BAT-31P Reserve Capacity Rai100  Each No Bid
2.6 Battery Group: BAT-31S Reserve Capacity Rat265  Each No Bid
2.7 Battery Group: BAT-34 Reserve Capacity Ratii 25 Each $103.17
2.8 Battery Group: BAT-35 Reserve Capacity Ratii 10 Each $103.17
2.9 Battery Group: BAT-40R Reserve Capacity Ral 20 Each No Bid
2.10 Battery Group: BAT-47 Reserve Capacity Ratii 10 Each $116.57
2.11 Battery Group: BAT-48 Reserve Capacity Ratii 65 Each 116.57
2.12  Battery Group: BAT-49 Reserve Capacity Ratii 125 Each $116.57
2.13 Battery Group: BAT-58 Reserve Capacity Ratii 60 Each $103.17
2.14  Battery Group: BAT-58R Reserve Capacity Rai 15 Each $103.17
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