

				The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company		Southern Tire Mart, LLC	
				Total Price	\$136,814.00	Total Price	\$143,189.00
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section I: Recapped Tires (60 Points)	1	PKG	\$136,800.00	\$136,800.00	\$143,128.00	\$143,128.00
1.1	11R22.5 - 27/32 Thread Depth Recapped Tires as per Specs.	900	EA	\$152.00		\$159.00	
1.2	Spot Repairs	1	EA	No Bid		0 (No Charge)	
1.3	120Repairs	1	EA	No Bid		\$5.00	
1.4	124Repairs	1	EA	No Bid		\$9.00	
1.5	140Repairs	1	EA	No Bid		\$11.00	
1.6	Nail HoleRepair	1	EA	No Bid		\$3.00	
2	Option 1 Buyback	1	PKG	No Bid		\$60.00	\$60.00
2.1	Buyback payment price for old tire castings (Paid to the City) Other than 11R22.5	1	EA			\$60.00	
3	Delivery Supplies (20 Points)	1	PKG				
3.1	The vendor agrees to perform delivery of supplies in a timely manner. Delivery will be completed within a minimum _____ working days after receipt of order.	1	Working Days		14 Days	1 to 3 Working Days	

Line #

1

1.1

1.2

1.3

1.4

1.5

1.6

2

2.1

3

3.1
