
Event Number IFB 2026-009 Organization City of Laredo Purchasing

Event Title Street Construction Various Items (LUMBER, STEEL, TOOLS, REBAR WIRE & MESH) - Public WorksWorkgroup City of Laredo Purchasing

Event Description Bidders are strongly encouraged to submit their bids electronically through use of Cit-E-Bid or in person - hand delivery. Mailed Bids (i.e. USPS, FedEx, UPS), telegraphic, emails or facsimile bids will not be considered. 
 
Request for bids may be hand delivered at the City Secretary Office, 1110 Houston St., 3rd. floor, Laredo, Texas 78040 until 5:00 P.M. on November 17, 2025, and all bids received will be opened and publicly acknowledged at 11:00 A.M. on November 18, 2025.
 

The City of Laredo has established a local vendor preference ordinance 2018-O-175. All informal and formal Requests for bids for contracts will be evaluated with a 5% preference for local vendors.Event Owner Tania Herrera

Event Type IFB Email therrera1@ci.laredo.tx.us

Issue Date 10/30/2025 12:15:00 PM (CT) Phone (956) 794-1734

Close Date 11/17/2025 05:00:00 PM (CT) Fax

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)San Antonio TX 11/14/2025 11:07:00 AM (CT) 13 $23,570.43

CMC Commercial Metals Laredo TX 11/13/2025 01:32:21 PM (CT) 75 $43,644.32

Beaver's Source LLC Laredo TX 11/14/2025 05:09:23 PM (CT) 75 $51,592.59

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response data is included.
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1

2

3

4

5

6

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)$22,114.15 $22,114.15

CMC Commercial Metals $23,057.25 $23,057.25

Beaver's Source LLC $30,303.251 $30,303.25

6.1

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)1000 EA $6.91 $6,910.00

CMC Commercial Metals 1000 EA $6.99 $6,990.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 1000 EA $10.35 $10,350.00

6.2

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)300 EA $10.80 $3,240.00

CMC Commercial Metals 300 EA $10.92 $3,276.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 300 EA $16.14 $4,842.00

6.3

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 400 EA $1.00 $400.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)400 EA $2.23 $892.00 Round Bar A-36/A 529 GR50 1/2" x 20' 400 pcs cut to 2' long (must be ordered in multiples of 10)

Beaver's Source LLC 400 EA $3.23 $1,292.00

SECTION I. STEEL

Domestic #4 rebar ½ in.x20ft.

Domestic #5 rebar 5/8 in.x20ft.

1/2" x 24 Smooth Dowel

Notice is hereby given that the City of Laredo is now accepting sealed bids, subject to the Terms and Conditions of this Invitation for Bids and other contract provisions, for awarding an 

Term of Contract

Price Adjustment:

Delivery:

Award of Contract:
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6.4

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 100 EA $1.05 $105.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)100 EA $2.47 $247.00 Round Bar A-36/A 529 GR 50 5/8" x 20' 100 pcs cut to 18" long (must be ordered in multiples of 10)

Beaver's Source LLC 100 EA $3.64 $364.00

6.5

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 10 ROLL $195.00 $1,950.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)10 ROLL $282.53 $2,825.30 Wire Mesh 6ga 6"x6" 5' x 150'

Beaver's Source LLC 10 ROLL $332.11 $3,321.10

6.6

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 150 EA $43.00 $6,450.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)150 EA $52.16 $7,824.00 Wire Mesh 6ga 6"x6" 96" x 240"

Beaver's Source LLC 150 EA $62.98 $9,447.00

6.7

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 100 EA $1.00 $100.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)100 EA $1.53 $153.00 Reinforcing Bar 60 domestic, 3/8 #3 x 5/10 S9 Open Stirrup C=8", B&D=24" A&G=4"

Beaver's Source LLC 100 EA $1.70 $170.00

6.8

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 5 ROLL $2.95 $14.75 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 ROLL $4.57 $22.85 AIW# 42435905689, TIE WIRE ANNEALED 16ga BLK(CTN=20 ROLLS)

Beaver's Source LLC 5 ROLL $5.09 $25.45

6.9

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Beaver's Source LLC 30 PKG $0.7189 $21.57

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)30 PKG NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 30 PKG $32.00 $960.00

6.10

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

1/2"X6"X10' Fibre Expansion Joint

Domestic Wire mesh #65inx150 ft.

Domestic Flat wire mesh 8'x20'

#3 stirrup 8” x 24"

Tie Wire 16 GA. Black 3.5 lb Roll

1/2"X4"X10' Fibre Expansion Joint

5/8 in. x 18 in. Smooth Dowel
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Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 PKG NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 20 PKG $1.0647 $21.29

CMC Commercial Metals 20 PKG $45.00 $900.00

6.11

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $2.05 $41.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $4.28 $85.60

6.12

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 30 EA $1.55 $46.50 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 30 EA $2.07 $62.10

6.13

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $2.65 $53.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $3.18 $63.60

6.14

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $4.25 $85.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $4.74 $94.80

6.15

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $1.49 $29.80

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $18.00 $360.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

6.16

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $2.40 $48.00

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $19.00 $380.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Keyway 4" x10'

Keyway 6" x10'

Steel nail pin 12”

Steel nail pin 18”

Steel nail pin 24”

Steel nail pin 36”
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6.17

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $2.85 $57.00

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $24.00 $480.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

6.18

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Beaver's Source LLC 2 BX $0.75 $1.50

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)2 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 2 BX $108.00 $216.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

6.19

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)2 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 2 BX $1.59 $3.18

CMC Commercial Metals 2 BX $60.00 $120.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

6.20

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)2 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 2 BX $1.63 $3.26

CMC Commercial Metals 2 BX $65.00 $130.00

7

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Percent Off Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)EA 1.0% Due to market fluctuation, Steel is priced at time of request

Beaver's Source LLC EA 5.0%

CMC Commercial Metals EA 25.0%

8

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc) NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals $5,844.00 $5,844.00

Beaver's Source LLC $7,000.05 $7,000.05

8.1

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

12” heavy duty loop panel tie 100/box

The City of Laredo requires a discount percentage on other items not listed but related to STEEL: Percent discount offered.

SECTION II. LUMBER

3/4-in x 4-ft x 8-ft Plywood

Keyway 8" x10'

Keyway stake 12"

6” heavy duty loop panel tie 100/box

IFB 2026-009 - Page 5



Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 30 EA $26.50 $795.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 30 EA $32.50 $975.00

8.2

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $18.85 $377.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $24.88 $497.60

8.3

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 1000 LINEAR FEET $0.11 $110.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 1000 LINEAR FEET $0.1341 $134.10

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)1000 LINEAR FEET NO BID NO BID NO BID

8.4

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 5 EA $16.00 $80.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 5 EA $20.23 $101.15

8.5

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)200 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 200 EA $8.50 $1,700.00

CMC Commercial Metals 200 EA $9.50 $1,900.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

8.6

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 100 EA $10.95 $1,095.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 100 EA $12.65 $1,265.00

8.7

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 50 EA $9.50 $475.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 50 EA $13.99 $699.50

3/4" x 10' Wood Chamfer

1/4" x 4' x 8' Tempered Masonite Fiberboard

2"x4"x16' stud

2"x6"x16' stud

1-in x 6-in x 16-ft Cedar

1/2-in x 4-ft x 8-ft Plywood
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8.8

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $7.85 $157.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $12.50 $250.00

8.9

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 5 BX $45.00 $225.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 5 BX $64.01 $320.05

8.10

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 5 BX $39.00 $195.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 5 BX $66.05 $330.25

8.11

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 5 BX $43.00 $215.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 5 BX $68.67 $343.35

8.12

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 5 BX $44.00 $220.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 5 BX $76.81 $384.05

9

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Percent Off Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC EA 5.0%

CMC Commercial Metals EA 25.0%

10

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

The City of Laredo requires a discount percentage on other items not listed but related to LUMBER: Percent discount offered.

SECTION III. TOOLS FOR ON CONCRETE/CONSTRUCTION

1-in x 4-in x 16-ft Cedar

16D duplex nail

8D duplex nail

16D Common nails

8D Common nails
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Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)$1,456.28 $1,456.28

CMC Commercial Metals $3,678.40 $3,678.40

Beaver's Source LLC $5,499.97 $5,499.97

10.1

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 3 EA $43.85 $131.55

Beaver's Source LLC 3 EA $52.50 $157.50

10.2

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 3 EA $30.95 $92.85

Beaver's Source LLC 3 EA $31.14 $93.42

10.3

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 5 EA $52.75 $263.75

Beaver's Source LLC 5 EA $90.71 $453.55

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 EA $121.49 $607.45 AIW# 03710390713, 0190MC BOLT CUTTER 24IN CENTER CUT INDUST GRADE

10.4

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)8 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 8 EA $32.85 $262.80

Beaver's Source LLC 8 EA $51.32 $410.56

10.5

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)8 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 8 EA $4.43 $35.44

CMC Commercial Metals 8 EA $11.75 $94.00

10.6

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)8 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 8 EA $6.00 $48.00

Beaver's Source LLC 8 EA $10.54 $84.32

16'' X 4-1/2'' Steel Pool Trowel

5 in. x 2 in. Margin Trowel

Water brush

½”x3/8”wx1/4” hand groover

6' Magnesium Threaded Handle - 1-3/4" Diameter

24 in. Bolt Cutter
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10.7

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 3 EA $21.95 $65.85

Beaver's Source LLC 3 EA $67.44 $202.32

10.8

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 EA $32.03 $160.15 AIW# 03710322670, SS22RCFN HAMMER 22OZ SLD STL CLAW CHECK FACE

CMC Commercial Metals 5 EA $35.25 $176.25

Beaver's Source LLC 5 EA $53.93 $269.65

10.9

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)8 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 8 EA $35.85 $286.80

Beaver's Source LLC 8 EA $49.39 $395.12

10.10

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)4 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 4 EA $112.50 $450.00

Beaver's Source LLC 4 EA $194.11 $776.44

10.11

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)4 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 4 EA $25.30 $101.20

Beaver's Source LLC 4 EA $36.89 $147.56

10.12

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

CMC Commercial Metals 8 EA $16.25 $130.00

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)8 EA $49.81 $398.48 AIW# 46005019701, WIRE TIE REELS IDEAL #IR MODEL 99 (#77531)

Beaver's Source LLC 8 EA $54.39 $435.12

10.13

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Ironwork pliers

48" ROUND END BULL FLOAT

16 X 3-1/8 Cast Magnesium Float-Round

Tie wire reel 

Measure tape 30 ft.

24" All Purpose Horsehair Floor & Finish Broom

Framing hammer 22oz.
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CMC Commercial Metals 10 EA $11.30 $113.00

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)10 EA $12.64 $126.40 AIW# 07617430464, 30-464 TAPE RULE 1X30FT

Beaver's Source LLC 10 EA $23.13 $231.30

10.14

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 10 EA $24.60 $246.00

Beaver's Source LLC 10 EA $41.90 $419.00

10.15

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 EA $32.76 $163.80 AIW# 04920614290, 20185000 8LB SLEDGEHAMMER 36IN

CMC Commercial Metals 5 EA $37.95 $189.75

Beaver's Source LLC 5 EA $67.63 $338.15

10.16

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 5 EA $26.30 $131.50

Beaver's Source LLC 5 EA $36.79 $183.95

10.17

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)4 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 4 EA $10.11 $40.44

CMC Commercial Metals 4 EA $11.15 $44.60

10.18

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)4 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 4 EA $32.03 $128.12

CMC Commercial Metals 4 EA $34.60 $138.40

10.19

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)8 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 8 EA $18.95 $151.60

Beaver's Source LLC 8 EA $32.03 $256.24

Snap Button Handle 6' X 1-3/4"

Concrete Placer, 20 x 4 In

Sledge hammer

Leather belt size Large

6" x 6" x 1/2" R x 5/8" Lip Blue Steel Edger

Radius joiner

IFB 2026-009 - Page 10



10.20

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)3 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 3 EA $100.27 $300.81

CMC Commercial Metals 3 EA $145.00 $435.00

10.21

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 2 EA $30.50 $61.00

Beaver's Source LLC 2 EA $39.47 $78.94

10.22

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 2 EA $31.01 $62.02

CMC Commercial Metals 2 EA $32.25 $64.50

11

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Percent Off Extended Supplier Notes

Beaver's Source LLC EA 5.0%

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)EA 10.0% 10% of web price on aiwdirect.com

CMC Commercial Metals EA 25.0%

12

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc) NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC $8,789.32 $8,789.32

CMC Commercial Metals $11,064.67 $11,064.67

12.1

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Beaver's Source LLC 3 BX $0.55 $1.65

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)3 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 3 BX $105.00 $315.00

12.2

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

SECTION IV. OTHER

Castle chairs 1-1/2”

Castle chairs 2-2-1/4”

36 in. x 5 in. Fresno Round End Finishing Trowel

level 4'

level 2'

The City of Laredo requires a discount percentage on other items not listed but related to TOOLS FOR CONCRETE/CONSTRUCTION: Percent discount offered.
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Beaver's Source LLC 3 BX $0.73 $2.19

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)3 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 3 BX $192.00 $576.00

12.3

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Beaver's Source LLC 3 BX $0.85 $2.55

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)3 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 3 BX $152.64 $457.92

12.4

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Beaver's Source LLC 3 BX $0.92 $2.76

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)3 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 3 BX $150.00 $450.00

12.5

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)2 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 2 BX $2.14 $4.28

CMC Commercial Metals 2 BX $110.00 $220.00

12.6

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)2 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 2 BX $2.27 $4.54

CMC Commercial Metals 2 BX $250.00 $500.00

12.7

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)40 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 40 EA $95.00 $3,800.00 PRICE INCREASES ARE SUBJECT TO INDUSTRY WIDE FLUXUATIONS.

Beaver's Source LLC 40 EA $140.93 $5,637.20

12.8

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $8.00 $160.00

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $11.34 $226.80

Castle chairs 5-5-1/4”

Castle chairs 6-6-1/4”

14 in diamond blade to cut concrete

7-1/4in  blade to cut wood

Castle chairs 3-3-1/4”

Castle chairs 4-4-1/4”
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12.9

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)25 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 25 EA $2.95 $73.75

Beaver's Source LLC 25 EA $46.36 $1,159.00

12.10

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 10 EA $9.00 $90.00

Beaver's Source LLC 10 EA $11.25 $112.50

12.11

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $3.95 $79.00

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $6.15 $123.00

12.12

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 20 EA $7.25 $145.00

Beaver's Source LLC 20 EA $10.99 $219.80

12.13

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)4 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 4 BX $9.75 $39.00

CMC Commercial Metals 4 BX $144.00 $576.00 CMC DOES NOT CARRY THE3 MASTERSEAL BRAND. CMC IS OFFERING SIKAFLEX 1C-SL IN LUE OF THE MASTERSEAL NP1 PRODUCT. SIKAFLEX IS EQUIVALENT TO OR BETTER THAN THE MASTERSEAL NP1.

12.14

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)15 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 15 BX $18.97 $284.55

CMC Commercial Metals 15 BX $150.00 $2,250.00

12.15

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Braided neon string

14" blade to cut metal 

1/4 X 6 X 8 inch SDS Drill Bit

1/4 X 6 X 10 inch SDS Drill Bit

NP1 self-leveling (12bx)

SL1 self-leveling (12bx)

7-1/4in  blade to cut metal
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Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)10 ROLL NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 10 ROLL $5.20 $52.00

Beaver's Source LLC 10 ROLL $20.79 $207.90

12.16

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)8 ROLL NO BID NO BID NO BID

CMC Commercial Metals 8 ROLL $45.00 $360.00

Beaver's Source LLC 8 ROLL $75.00 $600.00

12.17

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)20 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID

Beaver's Source LLC 20 BX $8.08 $161.60

CMC Commercial Metals 20 BX $48.00 $960.00

13

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Percent Off Extended Supplier Notes

Beaver's Source LLC EA 5.0%

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)EA 10.0% 10% of web price on aiwdirect.com

CMC Commercial Metals EA 25.0%

Poly Sheeting, Black, 6 mil, 20 ft x 100 ft,

Spray paint marking orange (12ea)

The City of Laredo requires a discount percentage on other items not listed but related to STREET CONSTRUCTION TOOLS : Percent discount offered.
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1

2

3

4

5

6

6.3

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

SECTION I. STEEL

Domestic #4 rebar ½ in.x20ft.

Domestic #5 rebar 5/8 in.x20ft.

1/2" x 24 Smooth Dowel

Notice is hereby given that the City of Laredo is now accepting sealed bids, subject to the Terms and Conditions of this Invitation for Bids and other contract provisions, for awarding an 

Term of Contract

Price Adjustment:

Delivery:

Award of Contract:
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6.4

6.5

6.6

6.7

6.8

6.9

6.10

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

1/2"X6"X10' Fibre Expansion Joint

Domestic Wire mesh #65inx150 ft.

Domestic Flat wire mesh 8'x20'

#3 stirrup 8” x 24"

Tie Wire 16 GA. Black 3.5 lb Roll

1/2"X4"X10' Fibre Expansion Joint

5/8 in. x 18 in. Smooth Dowel
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6.11

6.12

6.13

6.14

6.15

6.16

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Keyway 4" x10'

Keyway 6" x10'

Steel nail pin 12”

Steel nail pin 18”

Steel nail pin 24”

Steel nail pin 36”
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6.17

6.18

7

8

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

12” heavy duty loop panel tie 100/box

The City of Laredo requires a discount percentage on other items not listed but related to STEEL: Percent discount offered.

SECTION II. LUMBER

3/4-in x 4-ft x 8-ft Plywood

Keyway 8" x10'

Keyway stake 12"

6” heavy duty loop panel tie 100/box
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8.2

8.3

8.4

8.5

8.6

8.7

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

3/4" x 10' Wood Chamfer

1/4" x 4' x 8' Tempered Masonite Fiberboard

2"x4"x16' stud

2"x6"x16' stud

1-in x 6-in x 16-ft Cedar

1/2-in x 4-ft x 8-ft Plywood
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8.8

8.9

8.10

8.11

8.12

9

10

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

The City of Laredo requires a discount percentage on other items not listed but related to LUMBER: Percent discount offered.

SECTION III. TOOLS FOR ON CONCRETE/CONSTRUCTION

1-in x 4-in x 16-ft Cedar

16D duplex nail

8D duplex nail

16D Common nails

8D Common nails
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10.2

10.3

10.4

10.5

10.6

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

16'' X 4-1/2'' Steel Pool Trowel

5 in. x 2 in. Margin Trowel

Water brush

½”x3/8”wx1/4” hand groover

6' Magnesium Threaded Handle - 1-3/4" Diameter

24 in. Bolt Cutter
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10.7

10.8

10.9

10.10

10.11

10.12

10.13

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Ironwork pliers

48" ROUND END BULL FLOAT

16 X 3-1/8 Cast Magnesium Float-Round

Tie wire reel 

Measure tape 30 ft.

24" All Purpose Horsehair Floor & Finish Broom

Framing hammer 22oz.
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10.14

10.15

10.16

10.17

10.18

10.19

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Snap Button Handle 6' X 1-3/4"

Concrete Placer, 20 x 4 In

Sledge hammer

Leather belt size Large

6" x 6" x 1/2" R x 5/8" Lip Blue Steel Edger

Radius joiner
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10.20

10.21

10.22

11

12

12.2

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

SECTION IV. OTHER

Castle chairs 1-1/2”

Castle chairs 2-2-1/4”

36 in. x 5 in. Fresno Round End Finishing Trowel

level 4'

level 2'

The City of Laredo requires a discount percentage on other items not listed but related to TOOLS FOR CONCRETE/CONSTRUCTION: Percent discount offered.
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12.3

12.4

12.5

12.6

12.7

12.8

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Castle chairs 5-5-1/4”

Castle chairs 6-6-1/4”

14 in diamond blade to cut concrete

7-1/4in  blade to cut wood

Castle chairs 3-3-1/4”

Castle chairs 4-4-1/4”
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12.9

12.10

12.11

12.12

12.13

12.14

12.15

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Braided neon string

14" blade to cut metal 

1/4 X 6 X 8 inch SDS Drill Bit

1/4 X 6 X 10 inch SDS Drill Bit

NP1 self-leveling (12bx)

SL1 self-leveling (12bx)

7-1/4in  blade to cut metal
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12.16

12.17

13

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Poly Sheeting, Black, 6 mil, 20 ft x 100 ft,

Spray paint marking orange (12ea)

The City of Laredo requires a discount percentage on other items not listed but related to STREET CONSTRUCTION TOOLS : Percent discount offered.
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Line # Att # Attribute Name Attribute Note Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)CMC Commercial MetalsBeaver's Source LLC

Header 1 Award By Section This contract will be awarded by section to the lowest responsive responsible bidder (s), in accordance to the provisions of Chapters 252 and 271 of the State of Texas – Local Government CodeYes Yes Yes

Header 2 Terms and Conditions for Request for BidsTERMS AND CONDITIONS OF INVITATIONS FOR BIDS
GENERAL CONDITIONS
Bidders are required to submit bids upon the following expressed conditions:
(a)	Bidders shall thoroughly examine the specifications, schedule instructions and other contract documents.  Once the award has been made, failure to read all specifications, instructions, and the contract documents, of the City shall not be cause to alter the original contract or for a vendor to requests additional compensation. 
(b)	Bidders shall make all investigations necessary to thoroughly inform themselves regarding facilities and locations for delivery of materials and equipment as required by the bid conditions. No pleas of ignorance by the bidder of conditions that exist or that may hereafter exist as a result of failure or omission on the part of the bidder to make the necessary examinations and investigations, or failure to fulfill in every detail the requirements of the contract documents, will be accepted as a basis for varying the requirements of the CityI Agree to the Terms and ConditionsI Agree to the Terms and ConditionsI Agree to the Terms and Conditions

Header 3 Insurance Terms and ConditionsINSURANCE REQUIREMENTS 
If and when applicable or required by the contract, the successful bidder(s) shall furnish the City with original copies of valid insurance policies herein required upon execution of the contract and shall maintain said policies in full force and effect at all times throughout the term of this contract.
 

(a)	Commercial General Liability insurance at minimum combined single limits of $1,000,000 per-occurrence and $2,000,000 general aggregate for bodily injury and property damage, which coverage shall include products/completed operations ($1,000,000 products/completed operations aggregate) and XCU (Explosion, Collapse, Underground) hazards. Coverage must be written on an occurrence form. Contractual Liability must be maintained covering the Contractors obligations contained in the contract. The general aggregate limit must be at least two (2) times the each occurence limit. 
 

(b)	Workers Compensation insurance at statutory limits, including Employers Liability coverage a minimum limI agree my insurance meets minumum requirementsI agree my insurance meets minumum requirementsI agree my insurance meets minumum requirements

Header 4 Disqualification & Debarment CertificationDISQUALIFICATION & DEBARMENT CERTIFICATION
By submitting this request for bids, proposal or statement of qualifications, the firm certifies that it is not currently debarred or eligible for debarment from the City of Laredo pursuant to Ordinance No. 2017-O-098, and that it is not an agent of a person or entity that is currently debarred from receiving contracts from any political subdivision or agency of the State of Texas.  The City will further verify debarment status through use of the federal website SAM.gov. The contract parties are further prohibited from making any award at any tier to any party that is debarred or suspended or otherwise excluded from or ineligible for participation in Federal Assistance Programs under Executive Order 12549, “Debarment and Suspension.” 

By executing this agreement, the Engineer certifies that it is not currently debarred, suspended, or otherwise excluded from or ineligible for participation in Federal Assistance Programs under Executive Order 12549. The parties to thiI certify to the terms and conditionsI certify to the terms and conditionsI certify to the terms and conditions

Header 5 Contract Requirements 1.CODE OF ETHICS ORDINANCE
Vendors doing business with the City of Laredo shall comply with all provisions of the City of Laredo’s Code of Ethics (Ordinance, as amended). Vendors may be required to participate in Code of Ethics trainings.
1.2
PROHIBITED CONTACTS DURING CONTRACT SOLICITATION PERIOD
A person or entity who seeks or applies for a city contract or any other person acting on behalf of such person or entity, is prohibited from contacting city officials and employees regarding such a contract after a Formal Bid, Request for Proposal (RFP), Request for Qualification (RFQ) or other solicitation has been released. This no-contact provision shall conclude when the contract is awarded. The City of Laredo reserves the right to contact respondents and may require such contact as part of the evaluation process (for presentation, clarification) of bids and/or negotiation of RFP submittal(s) prior to the award of contract. If contact is required, such contact will be done in accordance with provisions of ChaptI have read and understand this sectionI have read and understand this sectionI have read and understand this section

Header 6 Byrd Anti-Lobbying Amendment (31 U.S.C. 1352)Byrd Anti-Lobbying Amendment (31 U.S.C. 1352)
Contractors that apply or bid for an award exceeding $100,000 must file the required certification. Each tier certifies to the tier above that it will not and has not used Federal appropriated funds to pay any person or organization for influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any agency, a member of Congress, officer or employee of Congress, or an employee of a member of Congress in connection with obtaining any Federal contract, grant or any other award covered by 31 U.S.C. 1352. Each tier must also disclose any lobbying with non-Federal funds that takes place in connection with obtaining any Federal award. Such disclosures are forwarded from tier to tier up to the non-Federal award.I have read and understand this sectionI have read and understand this sectionI have read and understand this section

Header 7 Questionnaire Description"The undersigned affirms that they are duly authorized to execute this contract, that this company, corporation, firm, partnership or individual has not prepared this bid in collusion with any other bidder, and that the contents of this bid as to prices, terms or conditions of said bid have not been communicated by the undersigned nor by any employee or agent to any other person engaged in this type of business prior to the official opening of this request.  By submitting this bid the vendor agrees to the City of Laredo specifications and all terms and conditions stipulated in the proposed document.   That I, individually and on behalf of the business named in this Business Questionnaire, do by my signature below, certify that the information provided in the questionnaire is true and correct ".

Header 8 Name of Offeror (Business) and Name & Phone Number of Authorized Person to sign bidTriple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works), Carmen Mata 210-704-8341CMC CONSTRUCTION SERVICES  HUMBERTO GARZA 956-726-1936White Cap Rene Castano (956)795-1500

Header 9 State how long under has the business been in its present business name4 years 110 YEARS 26

Header 10 If applicable, list all other names under which the Business identified above operated in the last five yearsVallen Distribution dba Alamo Iron WorksN/A White Cap

Header 11 State if the Company is a certified minority business enterpriseThe below information is requested for statistical and tracking purposes only and will not influence the amount of expenditure the City will make with any given company.

Header 12 Questions Part 1 1) Is any litigation pending against the Business?   
2) Has the Business ever been declared "not responsive" for the purpose of any governmental agency contract award?
3) Has the Business been debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, voluntarily excluded, or other wise disqualified from bidding, proposing or contracting?
4) Are there any proceedings, pending relating to the Business responsibility, debarment, suspension, voluntary exclusion, or qualification to receive a public contract?
5) Has the government or other public entity requested or required enforcement of any of its rights under a surety agreement on the basis of default or in lieu of declaring the Business at default?NA N/A no

Header 13 Questions Part 2 1) Is the Business in arrears in any contract or debt?
2) Has the Business been a defaulter, as a principal, surety, or otherwise?
3) Have liquidated damages or penalty provisions been assessed against the Business for failure to complete work on time or any other reason?NA N/A no

Header 14 State if the Company is a certified minority business enterpriseThis company is not a certified minority businessThis company is not a certified minority businessOther

Header 15 Conflict of Interest DisclosureA form disclosing potential conflicts of interest involving counties, cities, and other local government entities may be required to be filed after January 1, 2006, by vendors or potential vendors to local government entities. The new requirements are set forth in Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code added by H.B. No. 914 of the last Texas Legislature.
Companies and individuals who contract, or seek to contract, with the City of Laredo and its agents may be required to file with the City Secretary's Office, 1110 Houston Street, Laredo, Texas 78040, a Conflict of Interest Questionnaire that describes affiliations or business relationships with the City of Laredo officers, or certain family members or business relationships of the City of Laredo officer, with which such persons do business, or any gifts in an amount of $250.00 or more to the listed City of Laredo officer (s) or certain family members.
The new requirements are in addition to any other disclosures required by law. The dates for filing d

Header 16 Conflict of Interest Questionnaire Form CIQFor vendor or other person doing business with local governmental entity.
This questionnaire reflects changes made to the law by H.B. 1491, 80th Leg., Regular Session.
This questionnaire is being filed in accordance with Chapter 176, Local Government Code by a person who has a business relationship as defined by Section 176.001(1-a) with a local governmental entity and the person meets requirements under Section 176.006(a).
By law this questionnaire must be filed with the records administrator of the local governmental entity not later than the 7th business day after the date the person becomes aware of facts that require the statement to be filed. See Section 176.006, Local Government Code.
A person commits an offense if the person knowingly violates Section 176.006, Local Government Code. An offense under this section is a Class C misdemeanor.

Header 17 Conflict of Interest QuestionnaireVendor is required to submit Conflict of Interest Form for bid to be considered complete.  Have you submitted your completed Conflict of Interest Form with your response?Yes Yes No

Header 18 Disclosure Form For details on use of this form, see Section 4.01 of the City’s Ethics Code.

Header 19 This is a New Submission New Submission Correction

Header 20 Question 1. Name of person submitting this disclosure formPlease include First Name, Middle Initial, Last Name and Suffix (if applicable)Carmen Mata DANIEL O. BUENTELLORene Castano

Header 21 Question 2. Contract InformationPlease include the following:
a)Contract or Project Name
b)Originating DepartmentIFB 2026-009 (Street Construction Various Items (LUMBER, STEEL, TOOLS, REBAR WIRE & MESH) - Public Works)IFB 2026-009 (STREET CONSTRUCTION VARIOUS ITEMS (LUMBER, STEEL, TOOLS, REBAR WIRE & MESH)White Cap

Header 22 Question 3. Name of individual(s) or entity(ies) seeking a contract with the city (i.e. parties to the contract)Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works)CMC CONSTRUCTION SERVICESRene Castano

Header 23 Question 4. List any business entity(ies) that is a partner, parent, subsidiary business entity(ies) of the individual or entity listed in Question 3.Not Applicable Not Applicable Not Applicable

Header 24 Question 4. List any business entity(ies) that is a partner, parent, subsidiary business entity(ies) of the individual or entity listed in Question 3If you selected Not Applicable on Question 4, skip this section. If it applies to you, please list the name of partner, parent, or subsidiary business entity(ies) in this section.N/A

Header 25 Question 5. List any individuals or entities that will be subcontractors on this contractNot Applicable Not Applicable Not Applicable

Header 26 Question 5. List any individuals or entities that will be subcontractors on this contractIf you selected Not Applicable on Question 5, please skip this section.  If it applies to you, please list subcontractors in this section.N/A

Header 27 Question 6. List any attorneys, lobbyists, or consultants that have been retained to assist in seeking this contractNot Applicable Not Applicable Not Applicable

Header 28 Question 6. List any attorneys, lobbyists, or consultants that have been retained to assist in seeking this contractIf selected Not Applicable on question 6, please skip this section. If it applies to you, please list attorneys, lobbyists, or consultants that have been retained to assist in seeking this contract.N/A

Header 29 Question 7. Disclosure of political contributionsList any campaign or officeholder contributions made by the following individuals in the past 24 months totaling more than $100 to any current member of City Council, former member of City Council, any candidate for City Council, or to any political action committee that contributes to City Council elections. 

a)	Any individual seeking contract with the city (Question 3)
b)	Any owner of officer of entity seeking contract with the city (Question 3)
c)	Any individual or owner or officer of any entity listed above as partner, parent, or subsidiary business (Question 4)
d)	Any subcontractor or owner/office of subcontracting entity for the contract (Question 5)
e)	The spouse of any individual listed in response to (a) through (d) above
f)	Any attorney, lobbyist, or consultant retained to assist in seeking contract (Question 6)Not Applicable Not Applicable Not Applicable

Header 30 Question 7. Disclosure of political contributionsIf you selected Not Applicable on question 7, please skip this section.  If it applies to you, please list all contributors in this section.N/A

Header 31 Updates on contributions requiredInformation regarding contributions must be updated by submission of a revised form from the date of the submission of this form, up through the time City Council takes action on the contracts identified in response to Question 2 and continuing for 30 calendar days after the contract has been awarded.

Header 32 Question 8. Disclosure of Conflict of InterestAre you aware of any fact(s) with regard to this contract that would raise a “conflict of interest” issue under Section 2.01 of the Ethics Code for any City Council member or board/commission member that has not or will not be raised by these city officials?I am not aware of any conflict of interestI am not aware of any conflict of interestI am not aware of any conflict of interest

Header 33 8. Disclosure of Conflict of InterestIf you selected I am aware of conflict of interest is question 8, please list them in this section.N/A

Header 34 Question 9. Updates RequiredI understand that this form must be updated by submission of a revised form if there is any change in the information before the discretionary contract is the subject of action by the City Council, and no later than five (5) business days after any changes has occurred, whichever comes first. This include information about political contributions made after the initial submission and up until thirty (30) calendar days after the contract has been awarded.I have read and understand this sectionI have read and understand this sectionI have read and understand this section

Header 35 Question 10. No Contact with City Officials or Staff during Contract EvaluationI understand that a person or entity who seeks or applies for  city contract or any other person acting on behalf of that person or entity is prohibited from contacting city officials and employees regarding the contract after a Request for Proposal (RFP), Request for Qualifications (RFQ), or other solicitation has been released.
This no-contact provision shall conclude when the contract is posted as a City of Laredo Council agenda item. If contact is required with city officials or employees, the contact shall take place in accordance with procedures incorporated into the solicitation documents. Violation of this prohibited contacts provision set out in Section 2.09 of the Ethics Code by respondents or their agents may lead to disqualification of their offer from consideration.I have read and understand this sectionI have read and understand this sectionI have read and understand this section

Header 36 Question 11. Conflict of Interest Questionnaire (CIQ)Chapter 176 of the Local Government Code requires contractor and vendors to submit a Conflict of Interest Form (CIQ) to the Office the of City Secretary.I have acknowledge that I have been advisedI have acknowledge that I have been advisedI have acknowledge that I have been advised

Header 37 Question 11. Oath Please complete in this section the required information for your company:
1) Name
2) Title
3) Company or DBA 
4) DateCarmen Mata, MRO Coordinator, Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) 11/13/25HUMBERTO GARZA, BRANCH MANAGER, CMC CONSTRUCTION SERVICES 11/13/25Rene Castano, Account Manager, White Cap
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Line # Att # Attribute Name Attribute Note Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)CMC Commercial MetalsBeaver's Source LLC

Header 38 Question 12. Oath I swear or affirm that the statements contained in this Discretionary Contracts Disclosure Form, including any attachments, to the best of my knowledge and belief are true, correct, and complete.I swear or affirm information is correctI swear or affirm information is correctI swear or affirm information is correct

Header 39 Addendum The City of Laredo reserves the right to issue addenda to solicitations as necessary. Addenda are used to clarify, revise, or otherwise modify solicitation documents. All submitting parties are responsible for acknowledging receipt of each addendum issued. Failure to acknowledge any issued addendum will result in the submission being returned and considered incomplete.
 

Important Notice:

    Addendum notifications will be sent to the email address associated with each submission.
    It is the submitting party’s responsibility to monitor the provided email address and ensure that all addenda are received and acknowledged.
    Failure to acknowledge any issued addendum will result in the submission being returned and considered incomplete.Acknowledge Acknowledge Acknowledge
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Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

Triple-S Steel Supply, LLC (dba Alamo Iron Works) (Triple-S Steel Holdings, Inc)Carmen Mata cmata@aiwnet.com

CMC Commercial Metals DANIEL BUENTELLO daniel.buentello@cmc.com

Beaver's Source LLC Rene Castano rene.castano@whitecap.com Beaver' Source Has been acquired by White Cap
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