

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Core and Main		FERGUSON WATERWORKS	
				Total Price	\$1,148,943.95	Total Price	\$1,370,523.80
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section I -Compression Brass Fittings AY McDonalds or approved equal. All brass curb stop to be Jones or approve equal. Must comply with S.3874 (111th) Reduction of Lead in Drinking Water Act.	1	PKG	\$639,376.10	\$639,376.10	<u>\$499,644.70</u>	\$499,644.70
1.1	3/4" Male adapter #H-15428	400	EA	\$14.36		<u>\$12.95</u>	
1.2	1"Male adapter # H-15428	50	EA	\$16.97		<u>\$15.80</u>	
1.3	1 1/2" Male adapter # H-15428	20	EA	\$46.92		<u>\$43.40</u>	
1.4	1 Female Adapter x compression (CTS x FIP)	20	EA	<u>\$30.00</u>		\$53.50	
1.5	2 Female Adapter x compression (CTS x FIP)	20	EA	\$71.50		<u>\$63.80</u>	
1.6	2" Male adapter # H-15428	20	EA	\$68.37		<u>\$62.50</u>	
1.7	3/4" Female adapter # H-15428	150	EA	\$16.77		<u>\$14.15</u>	
1.8	1" Female adapter # H-15428	70	EA	\$23.99		<u>\$19.00</u>	
1.9	1"x 3/4" Compression U Branch with angle curb stops #H-1460	70	EA	\$134.22		<u>\$113.00</u>	
1.10	3/4"Compression Curb Stop # H-15170	500	EA	<u>\$46.74</u>		\$49.50	
1.11	1"Compression Curb Stop # H-15170	100	EA	\$101.61		<u>\$82.00</u>	
1.12	3/4"Compression Corporation Stop AWWACC thread x compression	100	EA	\$31.37		<u>\$29.50</u>	
1.13	1" Compression Corporation Stop AWWACC thread x compression	500	EA	\$47.50		<u>\$42.50</u>	
1.14	1 1/2" Compression Corporation Stop AWWACC thread x compression for Mueller E-5 and D-5 Tapping Machine	150	EA	\$134.64		<u>\$122.75</u>	
1.15	2" Compression Corporation Stop AWWACC thread x compression for Mueller E-5 and D-5 Tapping Machines	20	EA	\$222.67		<u>\$200.50</u>	
1.16	3/4" Compression Angle Curb Stop #14258	300	EA	\$37.29		<u>\$33.75</u>	
1.17	1" Compression Angle Curb Stop #14258	50	EA	\$51.07		<u>\$48.00</u>	
1.18	3/4" Compression Union # H-15403	500	EA	\$17.52		<u>\$16.25</u>	
1.19	1" Compression Union # H-15403	250	EA	<u>\$17.52</u>		\$17.99	
1.20	1 1/2 " Compression Union # H-15403	20	EA	\$67.40		<u>\$60.50</u>	
1.21	2" Compression Union # H-15403	50	EA	\$91.03		<u>\$81.25</u>	
1.22	3/4" x 2 Meter Cplg O.T	2000	EA	\$9.50		<u>\$7.85</u>	
1.23	3/4" meter coupling check valve	5000	EA	\$22.95		<u>\$20.32</u>	
1.24	3/4" x 5/8" Meter Cplg I.T	2500	EA	\$19.87		<u>\$11.75</u>	
1.25	1" x 2 Meter Cplg O.T	1000	EA	\$35.48		<u>\$12.95</u>	
1.26	1" meter coupling check valve	2000	EA	\$49.54		<u>\$25.50</u>	
1.27	3/4" Straight Curb Stop # J1949SG	100	EA	\$64.24		<u>\$59.25</u>	
1.28	1" Straight Curb Stop # J1949SG	100	EA	\$96.55		<u>\$87.46</u>	
1.29	1- 1/2" Straight Curb Stop # J1949SG	50	EA	\$219.77		<u>\$198.25</u>	
1.30	2" Straight Curb Stop # J1949SG	50	EA	\$327.03		<u>\$289.44</u>	
1.31	6 x3/4 single strap brass saddle	50	EA	\$48.81		<u>\$42.66</u>	
1.32	6 x 1 single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$48.81		<u>\$42.66</u>	
1.33	6 x 1-1/2 single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$92.08		<u>\$81.31</u>	
1.34	6 x 2 single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$92.08		<u>\$81.31</u>	
1.35	6 x 3/4 double strap brass saddle	50	EA	\$103.63		<u>\$97.00</u>	
1.36	6 x 1 double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$103.63		<u>\$97.00</u>	
1.37	6 x 1-1/2 double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$118.49		<u>\$110.00</u>	
1.38	6 x 2 double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$130.27		<u>\$121.75</u>	
1.39	8 x 3/4" single strap brass saddle	50	EA	\$68.30		<u>\$65.32</u>	
1.40	8 x 1 single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$68.30		<u>\$65.32</u>	
1.41	8 x 1-1/2 single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$105.10		<u>\$91.86</u>	
1.42	8 x 2 single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$105.10		<u>\$91.86</u>	
1.43	8 x 3/4" double strap brass saddle	50	EA	\$128.30		<u>\$120.00</u>	
1.44	8 x 1 double strap brass saddles	20	EA	\$128.30		<u>\$120.00</u>	
1.45	8 x 1-1/2 double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$135.05		<u>\$125.00</u>	

1.46	8 x 2 double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$147.20		<u>\$136.25</u>
1.47	10 x 3/4" single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$184.62		<u>\$159.67</u>
1.48	10 x 1 single strap brass saddles	20	EA	\$184.62		<u>\$159.67</u>
1.49	10 x 1-1/2 single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$184.62		<u>\$159.67</u>
1.50	10 x 2 single strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$184.62		<u>\$159.67</u>
1.51	10 x 3/4" double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$158.95		<u>\$147.25</u>
1.52	10 x 1 double strap brass saddles	20	EA	\$158.95		<u>\$147.25</u>
1.53	10 x 1-1/2 double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$174.55		<u>\$161.71</u>
1.54	10 x 2 double strap brass saddles	20	EA	\$187.53		<u>\$173.69</u>
1.55	14 x 3/4" double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$390.20		<u>\$354.47</u>
1.56	14 x 1 double strap brass saddles	20	EA	\$390.20		<u>\$354.47</u>
1.57	14 x 2 double strap brass saddles	20	EA	\$436.94		<u>\$354.47</u>
1.58	16 x 3/4" double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$471.82		<u>\$400.00</u>
1.59	16 x 1 double strap brass saddles	20	EA	\$471.82		<u>\$400.00</u>
1.60	16 x 1-1/2 double strap brass saddle	20	EA	\$500.63		<u>\$400.00</u>
1.61	16 x 2 double strap brass saddles	20	EA	\$553.23		<u>\$400.00</u>
2	Section II Brass Fittings Mueller or approved equal **All Gate Valves shall be Mueller brand or approved equal. The Gate Valves shall be 316 stainless steel and shall include bolts. AWWA C905 Must comply with S.3874 (111th) Reduction of Lead in Drinking Water Act.	1	Pkg	<u>\$224,679.10</u>	\$224,679.10	<u>\$576,709.20</u> <u>\$576,709.20</u>
2.1	3/4" Comp. X Comp. 90 ELL # H-15526	100	Each	\$21.54		<u>\$19.23</u>
2.2	1" Comp. X Comp. 90 ELL # H-15526	50	Each	\$27.65		<u>\$24.67</u>
2.3	1 1/2" Comp. X Comp. 90 ELL # H-15526	25	Each	\$93.91		<u>\$85.17</u>
2.4	2"Comp. X Comp. 90 ELL # H-15526	25	Each	\$190.00		<u>\$168.94</u>
2.5	1"X 3/4" Meter Brass Brushing #10889	50	Each	<u>\$9.43</u>		\$9.55
2.6	1cc X 3/4cc Corporation Brass Brushing	20	Each	\$37.16		<u>\$13.78</u>
2.7	1 1/2" Angle Curb Stop Comp/Flange #H-14277	15	Each	\$177.97		<u>\$160.56</u>
2.8	2" Angle Curb Stop Comp/Flange #H-14277	25	Each	\$228.48		<u>\$202.44</u>
2.9	2 X 1" Meter Adapter 10J47	25	Each	No Bid		<u>\$66.00</u>
2.10	3/4"Curb Stop # H-10200	100	Each	<u>\$39.56</u>		\$47.40
2.11	1"Curb Stop # H-10200	25	Each	\$90.47		<u>\$74.80</u>
2.12	3/4" Curb Stop flare by inside thread #H-15166	10	Each	<u>\$44.05</u>		\$55.50
2.13	1" Curb Stop flare by inside thread #H-15175	10	Each	\$84.03		<u>\$75.40</u>
2.14	3/4" x 1/2" Meter Coupling # H-10890	50	Each	\$9.50		<u>\$9.40</u>
2.15	5/8" x 3/4" X 7 Resetter # H-14118	300	Each	\$85.18		<u>\$71.09</u>
2.16	5/8" x 3/4" x 12" Resetter	200	Each	\$92.25		<u>\$79.52</u>
2.17	5/8" x 3/4" X 15 Resetter # H-14118	50	Each	\$96.64		<u>\$83.42</u>
2.18	5/8 x x 3 Resetter (710-203 NNJ-X90)	30	Each	No Bid		<u>\$136.21</u>
2.19	2" x 3/4" single strap Saddle	10	Each	\$18.30		<u>\$15.50</u>
2.20	2" x 1 single strap Saddle	10	Each	\$18.30		<u>\$15.50</u>
2.21	1 1/2" Copper to Copper Union # H-15400	10	Each	\$85.41		<u>\$75.40</u>
2.22	2" Copper to Iron O.T. Union # H-15425	5	Each	\$103.93		<u>\$92.15</u>
2.23	1" Copper to Iron O.T. Union # H-15425	20	Each	\$18.23		<u>\$16.45</u>
2.24	2" Brass Gate Valve with Brass Hand wheel	50	Each	\$276.35		<u>\$33.30</u>
2.25	1 x 10 Resetters #H141118	300	Each	\$165.58		<u>\$131.32</u>
2.26	3" Brass Gate Valve	10	Each	\$466.32		<u>\$86.79</u>
2.27	1 x 1 coupling CTS x CTS (74758Q)	200	Each	No Bid		<u>\$17.81</u>
2.28	CTS fast connect 2 piece coupling (74756)	250	Each	No Bid		<u>\$22.93</u>
2.29	1" CTS fast connect 2 piece couplings (74756)	250	Each	No Bid		<u>\$26.23</u>
2.30	1.5" CTS fast connect 2 piece couplings (747576)	150	Each	No Bid		<u>\$87.76</u>
2.31	2" CTS fast connect 2 piece couplings (74756)	150	Each	No Bid		<u>\$118.51</u>
2.32	3/4" x 1 CTS fast connect 2 piece couplings (74756)	200	Each	No Bid		<u>\$26.64</u>
2.33	3/4" Coupling Ranger x Ranger (74758-11)	250	Each	No Bid		<u>\$45.98</u>

2.34	1" Coupling Ranger x Ranger (74758-11)	250	Each	No Bid		<u>\$76.31</u>	
2.35	3/4" x 1" Coupling Ranger x Ranger (74758-11)	150	Each	No Bid		<u>\$61.66</u>	
2.36	1.5" Coupling Ranger x Ranger (74758-11)	125	Each	No Bid		<u>\$147.94</u>	
2.37	3/4" Adapter Ranger x MNPT (74753-11)	150	Each	No Bid		<u>\$31.21</u>	
2.38	1" Adapter Ranger x MNPT (74753-11)	150	Each	No Bid		<u>\$48.63</u>	
2.39	1.5" Adapter Ranger x FNPT (74754-11)	125	Each	No Bid		<u>\$101.14</u>	
2.40	MSR RSTR Sample Station SS Quick Conn(710-203NNHS X72X780)	200	Each		<u>\$386.90</u>	\$536.75	
2.41	Sampling Rod Assy threaded Type (710SSFaucet x 780)	50	Each	No Bid		<u>\$304.55</u>	
2.42	3/4x5/8x3/4 Ball Valve FNPT x Meter-Telescoping (7E6101MW)	500	Each	No Bid		<u>\$78.58</u>	
2.43	3/4 Angle BV FNPT x Meter-telescoping (7E4644)	400	Each	No Bid		<u>\$79.17</u>	
2.44	2" Telescoping Flange x Meter-Telescoping (7E610FD)	75	Each	No Bid		<u>\$102.72</u>	
2.45	2" Angle BV Q Comp x Telescoping Flange (74602BQ)	50	Each	No Bid		<u>\$428.00</u>	
2.46	2" Str BV Q Comp x Telescoping Flange (7E6100MWQ)	50	Each	No Bid		<u>\$397.00</u>	
2.47	2" Resetter with Telescoping Valve (718-715KN)	50	Each	No Bid		<u>\$1,415.00</u>	
2.48	2" double Check Valve Assembly (2 LM007M1-QT)	25	Each	No Bid		<u>\$455.00</u>	
3	Section III Gate and Butterfly Mueller or approved equal All Gate and Butterfly Valves shall be Mueller brand or approved equal. The valves shall meet AWWA C509 for gate valves and C-504 for butterfly valves. The bolts and nuts shall be 316 stainless steel.	1	Pkg		<u>\$284,888.75</u>	\$284,888.75	\$294,169.90 \$294,169.90
3.1	3" Muller Gate Valves **	20	Each		<u>\$408.60</u>		\$435.63
3.2	4" Muller Gate Valves **	20	Each		<u>\$456.58</u>		\$486.77
3.3	6" Muller Gate Valves **	40	Each		<u>\$582.37</u>		\$614.42
3.4	8" Muller Gate Valves **	40	Each		<u>\$927.53</u>		\$978.57
3.5	10" Muller Gate Valves **	5	Each		<u>\$1,446.20</u>		\$1,541.84
3.6	12" Muller Gate Valves **	20	Each		<u>\$1,829.97</u>		\$1,950.98
3.7	14" Muller Gate Valves **	5	Each		<u>\$2,839.84</u>		\$2,892.43
3.8	16 Muller butterfly Valve	10	Each		<u>\$3,378.13</u>		\$3,404.85
3.9	18 Muller butterfly Valve	5	Each		<u>\$3,794.22</u>		\$3,864.48
3.10	20 Muller butterfly Valve	5	Each		<u>\$5,106.13</u>		\$5,200.69
3.11	24 Muller butterfly Valve	10	Each		<u>\$7,087.65</u>		\$7,143.70

Line #
1
1.1
1.2
1.3
1.4
1.5
1.6
1.7
1.8
1.9
1.10
1.11
1.12
1.13
1.14
1.15
1.16
1.17
1.18
1.19
1.20
1.21
1.22
1.23
1.24
1.25
1.26
1.27
1.28
1.29
1.30
1.31
1.32
1.33
1.34
1.35
1.36
1.37
1.38
1.39
1.40
1.41
1.42
1.43
1.44
1.45

1.46
1.47
1.48
1.49
1.50
1.51
1.52
1.53
1.54
1.55
1.56
1.57
1.58
1.59
1.60
1.61
2
2.1
2.2
2.3
2.4
2.5
2.6
2.7
2.8
2.9
2.10
2.11
2.12
2.13
2.14
2.15
2.16
2.17
2.18
2.19
2.20
2.21
2.22
2.23
2.24
2.25
2.26
2.27
2.28
2.29
2.30
2.31
2.32
2.33

2.34
2.35
2.36
2.37
2.38
2.39
2.40
2.41
2.42
2.43
2.44
2.45
2.46
2.47
2.48
3
3.1
3.2
3.3
3.4
3.5
3.6
3.7
3.8
3.9
3.10
3.11