SECTION | WATER FOUNTAINS

7.1 |WaII Mount WMB8A Halsey Taylor

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[ 7.2 [wall Mount HACSFS Halsey Taylor
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $695.70
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $740.80 36958

| 7.3 |Elkay Fountain EZSTL8C
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1,137.60 37906
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1,147.90

| 7.4 [Elkay Fountain EZssL
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $695.70
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $819.87 25326

| 7.5 |Elkay Fountain EWA-8 Level ADA
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 7.6 |Haws 1435 3 Bubblers Fountain
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3,449.88
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 7.7 |Haws 1430 Cast Iron 2 Bubblers Fountain
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $2,686.56
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 7.8 [Haws 3202 steel s 2364
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3,223.08
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

SECTION Il WATER HEATERS

8.1 |Rheem 120 gal. 36 kw, 240v, 3 ph. Model ES120-36G

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $10,049.75
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[ 8.2 [Rheem 85 gal., 36kw, 240v, 3 ph. Model ES85-36G
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $8,959.40
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.3 |Lo-Boy 2.5 gal. Electric
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $419.20
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.4 |Lo-Boy 6 gal. Electric
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $454.95
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
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| 8.5 |10 gallon Electric

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $614.25
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.6 |20 gallon Electric
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $699.75
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.7 |30 gallon Electric
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.8 |40 gallon Electric
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $639.75
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.9 |50 gallon Electric
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $670.35
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.10 |30 gallon Gas
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.11 |40 gallon Gas
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $699.50
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 8.12 |50 gallon Gas
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $723.60
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

SECTION IIl BATHROOM SUPPLIES

9.1 |White Tank 1.28 4438

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $60.90
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 9.2 |White Elongated Bowl 4325
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $83.90
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $136.20 32461

| 9.3 |Toi|et Seat Open Front White
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $23.85
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $30.14 09100

| 9.4 |High Efficiency Toilet 1.5 gal. white elongated complete.

Supplier
Clark Hardware Ltd

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.)

uom
EA
EA

Price Supplier Notes
No Bid
No Bid
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| 9.5 [White Elongated Bowl 3251A101.020

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $94.08
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[ 9.6 [White cadet Tank 4192A.104.020
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 9.7 |white Cadet Bowl 16- 1/8" # 3068.001.020
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $95.00
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[ 9.8 [All Brook Urinal 6550.001.020
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $147.84 25340
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $212.95

| 9.9 |AF wall MT Back Flush # 2257.001.020
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $147.98 29642
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $161.85

[ 9.10 [white handicap bowl #2234.001.020
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $139.05 29640
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $170.75

[ 9.11 [Lav/Sink Connectors Hose 20" sS
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $6.41 13801
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $6.73

| 9.12 |Fluid Master valve 400A
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $11.33 09311
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $14.36

| 9.13 |Bras Grid Strainer PO Plug 35072
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $15.39
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $24.27 04425

| 9.14 |Plastic Bath Waste & Over flow assembly pvc # 35213

Supplier
Clark Hardware Ltd
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.)

uom
EA
EA

Price Supplier Notes
$18.95
$48.63 04570

[ 9.15 [Kitchen sink Supply Line vinyl 3/8" ¢ x 1/2 ips x 20" # 28320

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $5.12
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $6.31 08703

[ 9.16 [Toilet Supply Line 7/8"bc x 3/8" ¢ x 12"1 # 29412
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $5.47 13804
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $5.55
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| 9.17 |Laundry Faucets male

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $14.49
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 9.18 |Laundry Faucets Female

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $15.59
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 9.19 |Water Heater Supply Lines set 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $11.26
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $27.14 27757

10 |SECTION IV PLUMBING SUPPLIES PVC ITEMS

10.1 [Caps sch. 40 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.31
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $6.66 45470

| 10.2 |Caps sch. 40 2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.97
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $3.74 45468

[ 10.3]caps sch. 402 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.03
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $5.09 45469

| 10.4 |Caps sch 402"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.97
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[ 10.5]caps sch 401"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.54
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.58 42859

| 10.6 |4“ Combination wye dwv

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $35.25
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid 45455

| 10.7 |4" Wye dwv

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $23.44 19524
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $24.31
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[ 10.8[4" coupling dwv

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $5.81 17842

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $6.10
| 10.9 |6" x 4" Combination wye dwv

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $135.00

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $206.58 45465
[10.10]6" x 4" PVC bushing dwv

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $28.98

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $29.63 19287
|10.11|4" Male adapter dwv

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $6.50

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $12.66 19475
|10.12|2" Male adapter dwv sch. 40 pressure

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.20

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid 98105
|10.13|3“ Male adapter sch. 40 pressure

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $5.12

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $8.47 42820
[10.14]cap slips 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.30

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.40 98000
|10.15|3“ x 2" Bushing sch. 40

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.29

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $5.04 42809
[10.16]3" x 2 1/2" Bushing sch. 40

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.29

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $5.04 42810
|10.17|4“ Male adapter sch. 40 pressure

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $6.53

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $10.86 42821
|10.18|3" Female adapters sch. 40

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $4.13

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $6.36 45492
|10.19|2“ Male adapter dwv sch. 40

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.20

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.95 98105
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|10.20|Tees sch. 40 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $9.87

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $15.22 42897
[10.21]Tees sch. 40 2 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $7.53

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $11.59 42855
[10.22]Tees sch. 40 2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $2.29

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $3.52 98085
[10.23]Tees sch. 40 1 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.38

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $2.40 98084
[10.24]Tees sch. 40 1 1/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.30

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.98 98083
|10.25|Tees sch. 40 1"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.85

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.28 98082
[10.26]Tees sch. 40 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA S0.44

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.68 98081
[10.27]Tees sch. 40 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.41

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.59 98080
[10.28]couplings sch. 40 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.82

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $5.88 42839
|10.29|Coup|ings sch.40 21/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $2.42

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $3.76 42838
|10.30|Coup|ings sc h. 40 2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.13

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.61 98025
|10.31|Coup|ings sch.40 11/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.73

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.19 98024
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|10.32|Coup|ings sch.40 1"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.32

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.04 98023
[10.33]couplings sch. 40 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.31

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.75 98022
[10.34{couplings sch. 40 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.27

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.31 98020
|10.35|EII5 90 degrees slip 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $6.76

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $10.38 42856
[10.36]Ells 90 degrees slip 2 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $5.62

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $8.67 42860
|10.37|EII5 90 degrees slip 2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.87

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $3.04 98045
[10.38]Ells 90 degrees slip 1 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.19

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.82 98044
|10.39|EII5 90 degrees slip 1"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.62

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.95 98042
[10.40]Ells 90 degrees slip 1 1/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.12

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.70 98043
|10.41|Ells 90 degrees slip 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.38

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.54 98041
[10.42]ENs 90 degrees slip 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.36

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.47 98040
[10.43]cap slips 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.31

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

FY24-080 - Page 7



[10.44]cap slips 2 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.03

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[10.45]cap slips 2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.97

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.46 98005
[10.46[cap slips 11/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.82

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.50 98004
[10.47|cap slips 13/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[10.48]cap Slips 1"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.54

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.79 98002
[10.49]cap slips 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.35

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.50 98001
|10.50|Ma|e Adapters 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $5.12

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.51|Ma|e Adapters 21/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.52

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $5.40 42819
[10.52]male Adapters 2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.20

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid 98105
|10.53|Ma|e Adapters 11/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.91

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.40 98104
[10.54|male Adapters 11/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.69

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.04 98103
|10.55|Ma|e Adapters 1"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.57

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.90 98102
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[10.56|male Adapters 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.36

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.47 98101
[10.57]male Adapters 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.30

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.43 98100
[10.58]Female Adapters 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $4.13

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid 45492
[10.59]Female Adapters 2 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.10

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $4.74 45473
|10.60|Fema|e Adapters 2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.21

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.87 98126
|10.61|Female Adapters 11/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.91

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.40 98125
[10.62]Female Adapters 11/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.82

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.22 98123
|10.63|Female Adapters 1"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.34

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.79 98122
[10.64]Female Adapters 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA S0.44

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $1.28 45482
|10.65| Female Adapters 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.38

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.54 98120
[10.66[Bushing Slips 3/4" x 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.37

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[10.67]Bushing Slips 1 x 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.60

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.90 42798
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[10.68Bushing Slips 1" x 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.60

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $0.90 98141
[10.69]Bushing slips 2" x 1 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.41

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $2.13 98149
[10.70|Bushing Slips 2" x 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.41

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $2.13 98152
|10.71|Bushing Slips 2"x 1"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.41

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $2.13 98151
[10.72|Bushing Slips 2' x 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $3.29

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.73| Dressing Coupling 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $38.21

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.74| Dressing Coupling 2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $10.45 10256

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $16.50
|10.75|Dressing Coupling 11/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $7.82 10255

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $12.98
|10.76|Dressing Coupling 1 1/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $6.26 10254

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $12.26
|10.77|Dressing Coupling 1"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $4.29 10253

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $7.40
|10.78| Dressing Coupling 3/4"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $3.72 10252

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $6.19
|10.79|Dressing Coupling 1/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes

Clark Hardware Ltd EA $4.73

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
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|10.80|Elbows 90 degrees, sch. 40 pressure, 3"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $6.76
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.81|Elbows 90 degrees, sch. 40 pressure, 2-1/2"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $5.67
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.82|Elbows 90 degrees, sch. 40 pressure, 2"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.87
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.83|Elbows 90 degrees, sch. 40 pressure, 11/2"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.19
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.84|Elbows 90 degrees sch. 40 pressure 1"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.62
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.85|Elbows 90 degrees sch. 40 pressure 3/4"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.38
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.86|Elbows 90 degrees sch 40 pressure 1/2"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.36
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.87|Elbow 45 degrees 6"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $38.72
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|10.88|Elbow 45 degrees 5"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[10.89]Green cut off Nipples 3/4" x 1/2" x 6" M481101
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.73
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[10.90]valve Box 12" x 17" x 6" DFW
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $28.79
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[10.91]Extension only no lid DFT 12" x 17" x 6" VB14B
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $30.00
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
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[10.92[Box without lid DFW 12 x 17 x 12 VB12N

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $44.57
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

|10.93|Pipe 40 plain 2" x 20"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $22.79
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[10.94]Pipe 40 BE 2 1/2" x 20’
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $54.61
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[10.95Pipe 40 plain 1 1/2" x 20’
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $17.89
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[10.96]Pipe 40 BE 1" x 20’
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $10.98
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[10.97]Pipe 40 BE 1 1/4" x 20’
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $16.69
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[10.98]Pipe 40 BE 3/4" x 20’
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $7.98
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

|10.99|Pipe 40 bell end 4" x 20'
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $73.69
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

10.10(Pipe 40 bell end 3" x 20'
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $59.49
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

10.10]Pipe 40 bell end 2" x 20'
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $23.29
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

10.103Pipe 40 bell end 2 1/2" x 20'
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $54.61
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

10.103Pipe 40 bell end 1" x 20'
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $10.98
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
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10.104Pipe 40 bell end 1/2" x 20'

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $7.09
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

10.10PVC Cement Pint size HD
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $8.02 08184
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $9.82

10.104PVC Cement Quart size HD
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $11.11
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $12.98 13306

10.101 Liquid Drain & Sewer Cleaner 32 oz.
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $7.90

33434 must be ordered in quantities of 12.

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA $7.97 Priced per each.

10.104 Pipe 40 BE 1/2" x 20'
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $7.09
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

11 |SECTION V SPRINKLERS AND RELATED MATERIAL

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd $159,146.75

| 11.1 |Hunter Pop Up Rotor Sprinklers PGP ADJ
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $13.86
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 11.2 |Rain Bird Rotors Sprinklers 2045A
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $21.12
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[ 11.3[Rainbird Removal Tool SO 9084
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $10.00
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

| 114 |Weatermatic Solenoid Square M24QE # S07309
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $35.00
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

[ 11.5]valve, Solenoid Control Weatermatic 2100 1 1/2" 508426
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $92.95
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
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[ 11.6 [Rainbird Valves 11/2"

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $85.49
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
| 11.7 |Rainbird Valves 2"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $111.73
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
| 11.8 |Watermatic flow Control Valves 1 1/2"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $92.95
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
| 11.9 |Watermatic flow Control Valves 2"
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $130.00
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.10| Rainbird Sprayhead 4" less nozzle 1804 LN
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $2.11
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.11|Mu|tinipp|es cut off Green1/2x 6
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $0.71
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.12]Multi-nipples cut off Green 3/4 x 6
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.12
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.13|IPS auto Valve w/tlow control 150 PGA
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $85.49
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.14]Auto valve w/flow control 100 DVF 1 IPS
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.15]Auto Valve W/flow control 250 SF 1 IPS
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $14.27
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.16]Auto Valve w/flow control 216B 1 1/2 IPS
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $107.68
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.17]Auto Valve w/flow control 150 PGA 1 1/2 IPS
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $85.49
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
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[11.18{Auto Valve w/flow control 217B 2 IPS

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $132.40
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.19|Auto Valve w/flow control 200 PGA 2 IPS
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $111.73
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.20]s0lenoid irritrol 24 vt.
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $21.70
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.21| Solenoid for DV Valve A2239
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA No Bid
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.22]s0lenoid weaterrnatic 507309
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $32.34
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.23]1/2 circle Nozzle 10H
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.24]Full Circle Nozzle 10F
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.25]circle Nozzle 10 @ 1/4
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.26]circle Nozzle 12q 1/4
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.27|Circle Nozzle 5q 1/4
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.28]circle Nozzle 1/2 15h
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.29|Circle Nozzle 5h
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
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|11.30|Circle Nozzle 12H

Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.31|Circle Nozzle 8h
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.32]Full Circle Nozzle 12F
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.33|Adjustable Rotor w/nozzle 120 hunter
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $29.79
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
|11.34|Side Strip Nozzle 9sst
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.35]Adjustable Bubbler 1300AF
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.25
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid
[11.36]Circle Nozzle 8q
Supplier uom Price Supplier Notes
Clark Hardware Ltd EA $1.05
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) EA No Bid

12 |[DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE: Provide applicable discounts available from your company for any item you sell not listed in the

12.1 |A) % OFF CATALOG PRICE:

Supplier uom Percent Off  Supplier Notes
Any applicable discounts to be applied at
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) 0.0% time of quotation or purchase.
Clark Hardware Ltd 25.0%
[ 12.2]B) % OFF LIST PRICE:
Supplier uom Percent Off  Supplier Notes
Any applicable discounts to be applied at
Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.) 0.0% time of quotation or purchase.
Clark Hardware Ltd 60.0%
[ 12.3]c) % OFF SHELF PRICE:
Supplier uom Percent Off  Supplier Notes

Mark's Plumbing Parts (John W. Gasparini, Inc.)
Clark Hardware Ltd

Any applicable discounts to be applied at
0.0% time of quotation or purchase.
20.0%
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