South Texas Specialties hydrahose sevices Gonzalez Auto Parts (Laredo Velco Inc.
Total Price $4,392.50| Total Price $26,500.65| Total Price $29,722.90| Total Price
Line#  Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Section |: Fabricated Hydraulic Hoses w/Fittir 1 PKG $4,392.50 $4,392.50| $26,473.65 $26,473.65| $29,722.90 $29,722.90

1.1  Orifice Size: 2Wires: 2Approximate number ¢ 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid 1.50 No Bid No Bid
1.2  Orifice Size: 2Wires: 4Approximate number ¢ 35 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid
1.3 Orifice Size: 2Wires: 6Approximate number ¢ 35 Cost Per Linear Foot] No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid
1.4  Orifice Size: 4Wires: 2Approximate number ¢ 35 Cost Per Linear Foot] $1.31 $5.42 $7.86 $3.55
1.5  Orifice Size: 4Wires: 4Approximate number ¢ 35 Cost Per Linear Foot] No Bid $6.88 No Bid No Bid
1.6  Orifice Size: 4Wires: 6Approximate numberc 35 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid 8.55 No Bid No Bid
1.7  Orifice Size: 6Wires: 2Approximate number ¢ 40 Cost Per Linear Foot $1.89 $6.88 $9.18 $4.41
1.8  Orifice Size: 6Wires: 4Approximate number ¢ 80 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid $11.25 $16.48 $0.00
1.9 Orifice Size: 6Wires: 6Approximate numberc 35 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid 14.25 $26.82 $0.00
1.10 Orifice Size: 8Wires: 2Approximate number c 50 Cost Per Linear Foot $2.03 $8.20 $10.50 $5.04
1.11  Orifice Size: 8Wires: 4Approximate number ¢ 80 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid $_13.87 $18.94 $0.00
1.12  Orifice Size: 8Wires: 6Approximate number ¢ 80 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid $15.63 $30.92 $0.00
1.13  Orifice Size: 10Wires: 2Approximate number 35  Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid $11.25 No Bid $6.59
1.14  Orifice Size: 10Wires: 4Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid 16.58 No Bid No Bid
1.15  Orifice Size: 10Wires: 6Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid $18.74 No Bid No Bid
1.16 Orifice Size: 12Wires: 2Approximate number 35  Cost Per Linear Foot] $3.16 $13.94 No Bid 6.82
1.17  Orifice Size: 12Wires: 4Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid 16.94 No Bid 16.04
1.18 Orifice Size: 12Wires: 6Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot] No Bid $19.85 No Bid No Bid
1.19 Orifice Size: 14Wires: 2Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid $17.52 No Bid No Bid
1.20 Orifice Size: 14Wires: 4Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot] No Bid $20.63 No Bid No Bid
1.21  Orifice Size: 14Wires: 6Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid $24.74 No Bid No Bid
1.22  Orifice Size: 16Wires: 2Approximate number 35  Cost Per Linear Foot $8.55 $18.54 $22.74 $9.04
1.23  Orifice Size: 16Wires: 4Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid $21.50 $30.62 $16.38
1.24  Orifice Size: 16Wires: 6Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid $28.45 $96.04 $96.04
1.25 Orifice Size: 18Wires: 2Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid 20.52 No Bid No Bid
1.26  Orifice Size: 18Wires: 4Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot] No Bid $30.65 No Bid No Bid
1.27  Orifice Size: 18Wires: 6Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid $36.55 No Bid No Bid
1.28 Orifice Size: 20Wires: 2Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot] $15.56 $33.70 No Bid 11.12
1.29 Orifice Size: 20Wires: 4Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid $35.18 No Bid 20.25
1.30 Orifice Size: 20Wires: 6Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot| No Bid 45.88 $141.48 $0.00
1.31 Orifice Size: 24Wires: 6Approximate number 35  Cost Per Linear Foot| $40.82 $39.70 $164.14 $0.00
1.32  Orifice Size: 32Wires: 6Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot] $51.04 $54.21 $182.40 $0.00
1.33  Orifice Size: 36Wires: 6Approximate number 35 Cost Per Linear Foot No Bid 75.25 No Bid No Bid

2 Section Il: Mobile Servicelndicate if mobilese 1 PKG No Bid $27.00 $27.00 No Bid No Bid
2.1  Labor Rate Services. 1 Hourly Rate No Bid $25.00
2.2  Mileage Rate per Hour. 1 Mileage Rate/Hour 2.00
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