Border Tire (B&ger Recapping, T&W Tire LLC oyervides tire service lic Toro Automotive LLC Goodyear Tire & Rubber Comp Southern Tire Mart, LLC
Total Price $0.00| Total Price $0.00| Total Price $1,152.00( Total Price $1,218.00| Total Price $1,881.45| Total Price $1,917.30
Line # Description QTY UoOmM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Section I: Schedule for Cars & TrucksEstimate 1 PKG $275.00 $275.00 $233.00 $233.00 $850.49 $850.49 $348.30 $348.30
1.1 Regular Service Call Rate8:00 AM to 5:00 PM 1 EA $45.00 $45.00 $50.00 $50.00 $55.00 $35.00 $135.00 $35.00
1.2 After Hour Service Call Rate5:01 PM to 7:59 £ 1 EA $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 $75.00 $191.25 $93.80
1.3 Holiday/Weekend Service Call Rate 1 EA $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 $0.00 $191.25 93.50
1.4  After and Weekend hour Tire Replacement d 1 EA 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 1.0% 1.0% 41.46% 10.0%
1.5 14 P225/60R18, P225/60R16, P235/55R17 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 $23.25 $23.25 $10.00 15.00 47.57 18.00
1.6 15 P225/70R15, P235/65R17, P225/75R15 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 $23.25 $23.25 $10.00 $15.00 $47.57 $18.00
1.7 16 LT235/85r16, LT215/85R16, LT245/70R1 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 $23.25 $23.25 $10.00 $16.50 $47.57 $18.00
1.8 18 LT225/7019.5, LT215/75R17.5, LT265/75 1 EA 15-$25 15-$25 $23.25 $23.25 $10.00 $30.00 $47.57 $18.00
19 19 P265/60R18, LT245/75R16, P265/60R18 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 $23.25 $23.25 $10.00 $16.50 $47.57 $18.00
1.10 20 P265/70R17, P215/60R15, P205/65R15 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 23.25 $23.25 $10.00 15.00 47.57 18.00
111  26X12X12, 24X12X12 1 EA $15.00 $15.00 $50.00 $50.00 $10.00 $15.00 $47.57 $18.00

2 Section II: Heavy Trucks, Dump Trucks, Refus: 1 PKG $370.00 $370.00 $320.00 $320.00 $1,030.96 $1,030.96 $432.00 $432.00
2.1 Regular Service Call Rate8:00 AM to 5:00 PM 1 EA $65.00 $65.00 $50.00 $50.00 $55.00 $35.00 $135.00 $35.00
2.2 After Hour Service Call Rate5:01 PM to 7:59 /# 1 EA $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 75.00 $191.25 $93.50
2.3 Holiday/Weekend Service Call Rate 1 EA $95.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 $0.00 $191.25 $93.50
2.4  After and Weekend hour Tire Replacement d 1 EA 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 1.0% 1.0% 41.46% 10.0%
2.5 11R X 22.5 1 EA $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $76.57 $35.00
2.6 11Rx 24.5 1 EA $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $25.00 $35.00 $76.57 $35.00
2.7 31580x22.5 1 EA $35.00 $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $103.59 $35.00
2.8  255-75R22.5 1 EA $35.00 $35.00 35.00 $35.00 10.00 35.00 76.57 $35.00
29 295-75R22.5 1 EA $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $25.00 $35.00 $76.57 $35.00
2.10 425/80R/22.5 1 EA $35.00 $35.00 35.00 $35.00 35.00 35.00 103.59 $35.00

3 Section Ill: Construction Equipment: Backhoe 1 PKG $507.00 $507.00 $665.00 $665.00 No Bid $1,137.00 $1,137.00
3.1  Regular Service Call Rate8:00 AM to 5:00 PM 1 EA $35.00 $35.00
3.2 After Hour Service Call Rate5:01 PM to 7:59 £ 1 EA No Bid $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $93.50
3.3 Holiday/Weekend Service Call Rate 1 EA No Bid 85.00 $75.00 $0.00 $93.50
3.4  After and Weekend hour Tire Replacementd 1 EA No Bid 0.00% 1.0% 1.0% 10.0%
35 13.6x28 1 EA No Bid 0.00% $35.00 $65.00 $85.00
3.6 11.00 X16 1 EA No Bid $60.00 $12.00 $35.00 $35.00
3.7 14.9x 24 1 EA No Bid $37.50 $35.00 $65.00 $85.00
3.8 16.00 x 24 1 EA No Bid $60.00 $35.00 $65.00 $85.00
3.9 18.4x 30 1 EA No Bid 65.00 45.00 $65.00 85.00
3.10 18.4x34 1 EA No Bid $75.00 $50.00 $65.00 $85.00
3.11 19.5Lx24 1 EA No Bid $75.00 $50.00 $65.00 $85.00
3.12 20.5x25 1 EA No Bid $70.00 50.00 $65.00 $150.00
3.13 33.25RX 29 1 EA No Bid 165.00 No Bid $65.00 $220.00
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