
Total Price $14,100.00 Total Price $159,030.00 Total Price $671,865.00 Total Price $837,688.00 Total Price $1,188,832.50 Total Price $2,803,380.00

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
Section I Chemical Bid Price Schedule Note: 

Unit price shall include freight charges, fuel 

charges, and HAZ-Mat Fees 1 EA $14,100.00 $14,100.00 $159,030.00 $159,030.00 $671,865.00 $671,865.00 $837,688.00 $837,688.00 $1,188,832.50 $1,188,832.50 $2,803,380.00 $2,803,380.00

1.1
Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (50%) Average 

order (47,000 lbs.) 9 Bulk (lbs) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.2
Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (50%) Average 

order (3,500 gallons.) 9 275 Gallon Tote (Gallon) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.3
Liquid Sodium Hydroxide (25%) Average 

order (47,000 lbs.) 9 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.5
Calcium Hypochlorite Average order (40 

drums) 60 100 lb. Drums $235.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $312.00

1.6
Liquid Chlorine Average order (480 cylinders) 540 2000 lb.Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,379.00

1.7
Liquid Chlorine Average order (180 cylinders) 540 150 lb Cylinder No Bid $294.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.8
Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (50%) Average 

order (47,000 lbs.) 75 Bulk (lbs) No Bid $8,958.20 No Bid $4,808.10 $7,332.00

1.9
Cationic Polymer (C-308) Average order 

(45,000 lbs.) 10 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid No Bid $38,700.00 No Bid No Bid

1.10
Anionic Polymer (Clarifloc 210) Average 

order (8 totes) 8 270 Gallon Tote (Gallon) No Bid No Bid $3,611.00 No Bid No Bid

1.11
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate Average order 

(50,000 lbs.) 27 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,075.00 $12,300.00

1.12 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate with 1% Copper 

Sulfate Average order (60,000 lbs.) 60 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,270.00 $8,250.00

1.13
Wastewater Polymer Average order (35,000 

lbs.) 6 Bulk (lbs.) No Bid No Bid $64,750.00 No Bid No Bid

1.14
Wastewater Polymer Average order (30 

drums) 40 55 gallon drum No Bid No Bid $832.50 No Bid No Bid

1.15
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (38%-40%) 

Average order (200 tons) 250 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $492.00

Brenntag Southwest, Inc.Chemrite, Inc. DPC Industries, Inc. G2O Technologies LLC Polydyne Inc. Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC
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