
On August 13, 2024 the owner of 1810 Milk St aka 1804 
Milk St aka 1804 Milk St Mr. Juan Elias Garcia was 
issued 3 citations, for having a vehicle holding yard in a 
residential zoning, for doing auto repair/auto body 
repair/ auto paint in a residential zoning and for Using 
public property for commercial gain by storing vehicles 
on public property. His court date was set for 9-4-2024, 
customer plead not guilty so his case was sent to 
pretrial, pretrial date is set for 1-8-2025 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 



 

 



 

 





 



 

 
 



 
 



 



 

 



 

 
 



 



 

 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

On May 6, 2024 the owner of 1810 Milk St aka 1802 
Milk St aka 1804 Milk St was issued one citation. For 
doing auto repair/auto body repair/ auto paint in a 
residential zoning. He Plead no contest for these 
charges and he is in a payment plan to pay the fine.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 



 
 



 
 



 
 



 



 

 
 



 
 



 
 



 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 

On January 25, 2024 the owner of 1810 Milk St aka 1802 
Milk St aka 1804 Milk St was issued one citation. For 
doing auto repair/auto body repair/ auto paint in a 
residential zoning. He Plead no contest for this charges 
and he is in a payment plan to pay the fine.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 





 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
On June 1, 2022 the Department of Environmental 
Services Cited Mr. Juan E. Garcia for filling within the 
floodplain without an approval.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 





 



 



 



 
 



On April 28, 202  the owner of 1810 Milk St aka 1802 
Milk St aka 1804 Milk St was issued two citations. For 
doing auto repair in a residential zoning and for having 
a vehicle holding yard/salvage yard in a residential 
zoning. He Plead no contest for these charges and he 
paid his fines.   



 



 



 



 

 



 



 

 



 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 



 





 



 



 



 



 



 


