
Total Price $2,617,582.99 Total Price $2,703,188.26 Total Price $5,176,075.19

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1

Section IV: Bid Price ScheduleAn evaluation of the pricing to the City 

of Laredo - Weighted Evaluation Score (50 Points)* Vendor must bid 

on all items section in order to be considered for an award of 

contract******When bidding 1.1 to 1.6 fill either profit or 

discount***** 1 EA $2,617,582.9875 $2,617,582.9875 $2,703,188.26 $2,703,188.26 $5,176,075.1918 $5,176,075.1918

1.1
Transport Load(Unleaded Gasoline w/10% Ethanol)Discount from 

OPIS Average Rack Composite 1 Price/Gallon -$0.024 -$0.0025 $0.0225

1.2
Transport Load(Unleaded Gasoline w/10% Ethanol)Profitfrom OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon No Bid $0.00 $0.00

1.3
Transport Load(No. 2, Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel)Discount from OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon -$0.0575 $0.00 $0.0795

1.4
Transport Load(No. 2, Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel)Profitfrom OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon No Bid $0.0125 $0.00

1.5
Tank Wagon Load(Ultra Low Sulfur RedDiesel)Discount from OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon No Bid $0.00 $0.00

1.6
Tank Wagon Load(Ultra Low Sulfur RedDiesel)Profitfrom OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon $0.069 $0.25 $0.0898

1.7
Transport Load(Unleaded Gasoline w/10% Ethanol)Average rack 

price for 9/1/20 900000

OPIS Average Rack 

Price/Gallon $1.4213 $1.4213 $1.4213

1.8 Transport Load(Unleaded Gasoline w/10% Ethanol) 900000 Bid Price/Gallon -$0.024 -$0.0025 $1.3988

1.9
Transport LoadNo. 2 Ultra Low Sulfur DieselAverage rack price for 

9/1/20 920000

OPIS Average Rack 

Price/Gallon $1.3457 $1.3457 $1.3457

1.10 Transport LoadNo. 2 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 920000 Bid Price/Gallon -$0.0575 $0.0125 $1.2662

1.11
Tank Wagon LoadUltra Low Sulfur DieselAverage rack price for 

9/1/20 55000

OPIS Average Rack 

Price/Gallon $1.3268 $1.3268 $1.3268

1.12 Tank Wagon LoadUltra Low Sulfur Diesel 55000 Bid Price/Gallon $0.069 $0.25 $1.4166

1.13 Bulk Diesel Exhaust Fluid(Not subject to OPIS Pricing) 45000 Bid Price/Gallon $2.18 $2.00 $1.87

Line # Description QTY UOM

1

Section IV: Bid Price ScheduleAn evaluation of the pricing to the City 

of Laredo - Weighted Evaluation Score (50 Points)* Vendor must bid 

on all items section in order to be considered for an award of 

contract******When bidding 1.1 to 1.6 fill either profit or 

discount***** 1 EA Total Price $5,259,726.66 Total Price $5,263,708.19 Total Price $5,283,838.19

1.1
Transport Load(Unleaded Gasoline w/10% Ethanol)Discount from 

OPIS Average Rack Composite 1 Price/Gallon
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1.2
Transport Load(Unleaded Gasoline w/10% Ethanol)Profitfrom OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon $5,259,726.6618 $5,259,726.6618 $5,263,708.192 $5,263,708.192 $5,283,838.1881 $5,283,838.1881

1.3
Transport Load(No. 2, Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel)Discount from OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon $0.0228 -$0.0121 $0.0724

1.4
Transport Load(No. 2, Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel)Profitfrom OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon No Bid $0.00 No Bid

1.5
Tank Wagon Load(Ultra Low Sulfur RedDiesel)Discount from OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon $0.049 -$0.0159 $0.0123

1.6
Tank Wagon Load(Ultra Low Sulfur RedDiesel)Profitfrom OPIS 

Average Rack Component 1 Price/Gallon No Bid $0.00 No Bid

1.7
Transport Load(Unleaded Gasoline w/10% Ethanol)Average rack 

price for 9/1/20 900000

OPIS Average Rack 

Price/Gallon No Bid $0.00 No Bid

1.8 Transport Load(Unleaded Gasoline w/10% Ethanol) 900000 Bid Price/Gallon $0.59 $0.22 $1.1034

1.9
Transport LoadNo. 2 Ultra Low Sulfur DieselAverage rack price for 

9/1/20 920000

OPIS Average Rack 

Price/Gallon $1.4213 $1.4213 $1.4213

1.10 Transport LoadNo. 2 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 920000 Bid Price/Gallon $1.3985 $1.4092 $1.3489

1.11
Tank Wagon LoadUltra Low Sulfur DieselAverage rack price for 

9/1/20 55000

OPIS Average Rack 

Price/Gallon $1.3457 $1.3457 $1.3457

1.12 Tank Wagon LoadUltra Low Sulfur Diesel 55000 Bid Price/Gallon $1.2967 $1.3298 $1.3334

1.13 Bulk Diesel Exhaust Fluid(Not subject to OPIS Pricing) 45000 Bid Price/Gallon $1.3268 $1.3268 $1.3268

Saratoga Rack Marketing LLC

Sun Coast Resources, Inc. Sunoco, LLC Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd

Petroleum Traders Corporation Indigo Energy
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$1.9168 $1.5468 $2.4302

$2.50 $2.15 $2.65
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