Andy's Auto Air & Supplies, Inc

DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF

Rotex Truck Center, Inc

Rush Truck Center, Laredo

Total Price $0.00| Total Price $0.00( Total Price $0.00| Total Price $0.00
Line # Description Mfgr QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
L Section I: Peterbilt Captive New Parts Peterbilt Captive New Parts 1 PKG $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
1.1  Percentage of Discount offered Peterbilt OEM Parts 1 EA 20.0% 10.0% 20.0%
Parts will be delivered within
1.2 . . .
working days after receipt of order. 1 Working Days No Response
9 Freightliner Captive New
Section II: Freightliner Captive New Parts  Parts 1 PKG $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
2.1  Percentage of Discount offered Freightliner OEM Parts 1 EA 20.0% 25.0% 10.0%
29 Parts will be delivered within
working days after receipt of order. 1 Working Days No Response
International Captive New
3 Section Ill: International Captive New Parts Parts 1 PKG $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3.1  Percentage of Discount offered International OEM Parts 1 EA 20.0% 10.0% 20.0% 10.0%
32 Parts will be delivered within
: working days after receipt of order. 1 Working Days No Response No Response
4 Section IV: MACK Captive New Parts MACK Captive New Parts 1 PKG $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
4.1  Percentage of Discount offered MACK OEM Parts 1 EA 20.0% 10.0% 10.0%
42 Parts will be delivered within
working days after receipt of order. 1 Working Days No Response
5 Section V: GMC/Chevrolet Captive New GMC/Chevrolet Captive New
Parts Parts 1 PKG $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
>1 Percentage of Discount offered GMC/Chevrolet OEM Parts 1 EA 20.0% 10.0% 10.0%
52 Parts will be delivered within
i working days after receipt of order. 1 Working Days No Response
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