FERGUSON WATERWORKS Core and Main Aguaworks Pipe & Supply, LLC
Total Price $224,764.00 Total Price| $1,477,566.00 Total Price| $1,510,526.94
Line#  Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Section | Fittings for Sewer Lift Stations or approved equa 1 EA $1,147,905.60 $1,147,905.60 $1,192,175.04 $1,192,175.04

1.1 3 turn plugvalve MJ x MJ 4 EA $259.31 $305.36
1.2 3-1/4 turn plug valve Flange x Flange 4 EA $242.27 $285.29
1.3 3-1/4 turn plug valve Flange x Mechanical joint 4 EA No Bid No Bid

1.4 3 lever and weight check valve MJ x MJ 4 EA $415.14 $488.86
1.5 3 lever and weight check valve Flange x Flange 4 EA $628.18 $739.74
1.6 3 lever and weight check valve Flange x MJ 4 EA No Bid No Bid

1.7 3 90 degree bend mechanical x mechanical 4 EA $195.45 $338.29
1.8 390 degree bend Flange x Flange 4 EA $332.65 $353.28
1.9 390 degree bend Flange x mechanical 4 EA No Bid $335.88
1.10 3-45 degree bend mechanical x mechanical 4 EA $191.04 $202.73
1.11  3-45 degree bend Flange x flange 4 EA $308.39 $327.44
1.12  3-45 degree bend mechanical x flange 4 EA $1,474.84 No Bid

1.13  3-22.5 degree bend Flange x Flange 4 EA $388.69 $282.71
1.14  3-22.5 degree bend mechanical x mechanical 4 EA $195.45 $207.20
1.15 3-22.5 degree bend mechanical x flange 4 EA $1,474.84 No Bid

1.16 3 x 6 long flange x flange spool 4 EA $347.40 $357.50
1.17 3 x 1 long flange x flange spool 4 EA $347.40 $425.07
1.18 3 x 2 long flange x flange spool 4 EA $457.83 $560.20
1.19 3 x 3 long flange x flange spool 4 EA $568.27 $695.32
1.20 3 x5 long flange x flange spool 4 EA $789.14 $965.58
1.21 3 x 10 long flange x flange spool 4 EA $1,341.31 $1,641.22
1.22 3 x 20 long spool flange x flange spool 4 EA $2,224.79 $3,577.44
1.23 3 x 4 mechanical x mechanical reducer 4 EA $256.77 $201.24
1.24 3 x4 flange x flange reducer 4 EA $256.77 $272.79
1.25 3 x4 mechanical x flange reducer 4 EA $256.77 $349.17
1.26 3 x 3 mechanical x flange adapter 4 EA $210.45 $305.66
1.27  3-True wye flange x flange 4 EA $441.18 $446.04
1.28 3-Wye flange x flange 4 EA $431.48 $458.13
1.29 3-Tee mechanical 4 EA $253.24 $418.25
1.30 3-tee flange x flange 4 EA $412.95 $505.25
1.31  3-blind flange 4 EA $173.83 $184.34
1.32 3 stainless steel bolt pack 4 EA $13.73 $18.12
1.33 3 red rubber gasket 1/8 4 EA $4.13 $17.47
1.34 4 turn plug valve MJ x MJ 4 EA $346.96 $408.58
1.35  4-1/4 turn plug valve Flange x Flange 4 EA $343.31 $404.28
1.36  4-1/4 turn plug valve Flange x Mechanical joint 4 EA No Bid No Bid

1.37 4 lever and weight check valve MJ x MJ 4 EA $483.31 $569.14
1.38 4 lever and weight check valve Flange x Flange 4 EA $738.96 $870.20
1.39 4 lever and weight check valve Flange x MJ 4 EA No Bid No Bid

1.40 490 degree bend mechanical x mechanical 4 EA $221.04 $143.58
1.41 490 degree bend Flange x Flange 4 EA $332.65 $234.53
1.42 490 degree bend Flange x mechanical 4 EA $232.06 $354.00
1.43 4x 690 degree bend MJ x MJ 4 EA No Bid No Bid

1.44  4x 6 90 degree bend flange x flange 4 EA $459.28 $487.94
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1.45
1.46
1.47
1.48
1.49
1.50
1.51
1.52
1.53
1.54
1.55
1.56
1.57
1.58
1.59
1.60
1.61
1.62
1.63
1.64
1.65
1.66
1.67
1.68
1.69
1.70
1.71
1.72
1.73
1.74
1.75
1.76
1.77
1.78
1.79
1.80
1.81
1.82
1.83
1.84
1.85
1.86
1.87
1.88
1.89
1.90
1.91
1.92

4x 6 90 degree bend flange x MJ

4-45 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
4-45 degree bend Flange x flange

4-45 degree bend mechanical x flange
4-22.5 degree bend Flange x Flange

4-22.5 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
4-22.5 degree bend mechanical x flange

4 x 6 long flange x flange spool

4 x 1 long flange x flange spool

4 x 2 long flange x flange spool

4 x 3 long flange x flange spool

4 x 5 long flange x flange spool

4 x 10 long flange x flange spool

4 x 20 long spool flange x flange spool

4 x 6 mechanical x mechanical reducer

4 x 6 flange x flange reducer

4 x 6 mechanical x flange reducer

4 x 6 mechanical x flange adapter

4-True wye flange x flange

4-Wye Flange x Flange

4-Tee flange x flange

4 Tee mechanical x mechanical

4- blind flange

4 stainless steel bolt pack

4 red rubber gasket 1/8

6- knife gate valve flange

6gate valve flange to flange

6 gate valve mechanical x mechanical

6 gate valve flange x mechanical

6 turn plug valve flange to mechanical

6- plug valve mechanical to mechanical

6 turn plug valve flange to flange

6-lever and weight check valve flange x MJ
6- lever and weight check valve MJ x MJ

6- lever and weight check valve flange x flange
6 90 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
6 90 degree bend Flange x Flange

6 90 degree bend Flange x mechanical
6-45 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
6-45 degree bend Flange x flange

6-45 degree bend mechanical x flange
6-22.5 degree bend Flange x Flange

6-22.5 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
6-22.5 degree bend mechanical x flange

6 x 6 long flange x flange spool

6 x 1 long flange x flange spool

6 x 2 long flange x flange spool

6 x 3 long flange x flange spool

A Db AP EEMAEAEEAEEEAAMDEAEAEMDEEEAEEAEAAEAEEAEAEAAEAEAEAEAAEMAEAADELEAEDDLPN

EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA

No Bid
199.4
308.3!
250.5!
388.6'
195.4.
211.3
392.9
392.9
478.5
564.2.
735.5
1,163.77
2,020.2
255.4
388.6!
No Bid
No Bid
454.4
657.8
439.86
263.3!
173.8
$28.75
$5.13
748.7
519.1
499.9
499.9

L

14

No Bid
594.0

595.3

No Bid
764.7

1,014.0

340.5!

494.1

375.4

304.8

451.3

411.6

571.3

290.3

312.3

458.2

458.2

546.9

635.6

HEHRLD

No Response
$211.68
$327.44
$369.71
$412.90
$207.20
$335.88
$395.81
$444.22
$541.04
$637.87
$831.52

$1,315.64
$2,283.88
$271.30
$412.90

No Bid

No Bid
$482.46
$698.61
$358.06
$279.74
$184.34

$18.12
$1.59
$881.66
$611.34
$588.71
$588.71

No Bid
$699.60
$701.03

No Bid
$901.73

$1,194.19
$361.73
$524.70
$398.50
$323.46
$479.49
$437.25
$606.69
$308.06
$396.29
$506.46
$560.73
$669.26
$777.78

FY21-093 - Page 2



1.93
1.94
1.95
1.96
1.97
1.98
1.99
1.100
1.101
1.102
1.103
1.104
1.105
1.106
1.107
1.108
1.109
1.110
1.111
1.112
1.113
1.114
1.115
1.116
1.117
1.118
1.119
1.120
1.121
1.122
1.123
1.124
1.125
1.126
1.127
1.128
1.129
1.130
1.131
1.132
1.133
1.134
1.135
1.136
1.137
1.138
1.139
1.140

6 x 5 long flange x flange spool

6 x 10 long flange x flange spool

6 x 20 long spool flange x flange spool

6 x 8 mechanical x mechanical reducer

6 x 8 flange x flange reducer

6 x 8 mechanical x flange reducer

6 x 6 mechanical x flange adapter

6-True wye flange x flange

6-Wye Flange x Flange

6-Tee flange x flange

6 Tee mechanical x mechanical

6- blind flange

6 stainless steel bolt pack

6 red rubber gasket 1/8

8- knife gate valve flange

8gate valve flange to flange

8 gate valve mechanical x mechanical

8 gate valve flange x mechanical

8 turn plug valve flange to mechanical

8- turn plug valve mechanical to mechanical
8 turn plug valve flange to flange

8- lever and weight check valve MJ x flange
8- lever and weight check valve MJ x MJ

8- lever and weight check valve flange x flange
8 90 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
8 90 degree bend Flange x Flange

8 90 degree bend Flange x mechanical
8-45 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
8-45 degree bend Flange x flange

8-45 degree bend mechanical x flange
8-22.5 degree bend Flange x Flange

8-22.5 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
8-22.5 degree bend mechanical x flange

8 x 6 long flange x flange spool

8 x 1 long flange x flange spool

8 x 2 long flange x flange spool

8 x 3 long flange x flange spool

8 x 5 long flange x flange spool

8 x 10 long flange x flange spool

8 x 20 long flange x flange spool

8 x 10 mechanical x mechanical reducer

8 x 10 flange x flange reducer

8 x 10 mechanical x flange reducer

8 x 8 mechanical x flange adapter

8-True wye flange x flange

8-Wye Flange x Flange

8-Tee flange x flange

8 Tee mechanical x mechanical

A Db AP EEMAEAEEAEEEAAMDEAEAEMDEEEAEEAEAAEAEEAEAEAAEAEAEAEAAEMAEAADELEAEDDLPN

EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA

No Bid

No Bid

813.05
1,256.5
2,143.4

378.5

605.3

605.3

299.5

759.7

$1,022.64

659.1

431.4

280.1

$55.20

$6.00
1,044.35

811.2

796.2

781.2

HEHE

H

936.6
824.1

1,222.2
1,535.1.
482.2
830.3
607.0
421.7
704.1
510.00
839.1
416.4
434.5
677.4
677.4
790.4
903.4
1,129.57
1,694.7
2,825.2
485.7
1,093.9
2,147.3
431.4
1,256.0
1,681.77
1,433.8
622.0

HIHIES

W

HiHE L H

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$994.84
$1,537.48
$2,622.76
$401.98
$642.96

$318.00
$806.93
$806.93
$1,086.18
$458.13
$297.63
$25.12

$2.51
$1,182.72

$955.34
$937.62
$919.94

$1,105.31
$970.55

$1,439.33
$1,807.77
$512.28
$881.95
$624.66
$447.69
$747.80
$292.16
$891.40
$441.00
$476.04
$759.70
$828.86
$967.18
$1,105.50
$1,382.14
$2,073.74
$3,456.94
$490.91
$1,161.70

$458.13
$1,334.11
$1,786.76
$1,523.43
$660.85
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1.141
1.142
1.143
1.144
1.145
1.146
1.147
1.148
1.149
1.150
1.151
1.152
1.153
1.154
1.155
1.156
1.157
1.158
1.159
1.160
1.161
1.162
1.163
1.164
1.165
1.166
1.167
1.168
1.169
1.170
1.171
1.172
1.173
1.174
1.175
1.176
1.177
1.178
1.179
1.180
1.181
1.182
1.183
1.184
1.185
1.186
1.187
1.188

8- blind flange

8 stainless steel bolt pack

8 red rubber gasket 1/8

12- knife gate valve flange

12gate valve flange to flange

12 gate valve mechanical x mechanical

12 gate valve flange x mechanical

12 plug valve flange to mechanical

12 plug valve mechanical to mechanical

12 plug valve flange to flange

12 lever and weight check valve MJ x Flange
12- lever and weight check valve MJ x MJ
12- lever and weight check valve flange x flange
12 90 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
12 90 degree bend Flange x Flange

12 90 degree bend Flange x mechanical

12 x 16 90 degree bend MJ x MJ

12x16 90 degree bend MJ x Flange

12 x 16 degree bend Flange x Flange

12-45 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
12-45 degree bend Flange x flange

12-45 degree bend mechanical x flange
12-22.5 degree bend Flange x Flange
12-22.5 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
12-22.5 degree bend mechanical x flange
12 x 6 long flange x flange spool

12 x 1 long flange x flange spool

12 x 2 long flange x flange spool

12 x 3 long flange x flange spool

12 x 5 long flange x flange spool

12 x 10 long long flange x flange spool

12 x 20 long flange x flange spool

12 x 10 mechanical x mechanical reducer
12 x 10 flange x flange reducer

12 x 10 mechanical x flange reducer

12 x 12 mechanical x flange adapter
12-True wye flange x flange

12-Wye Flange x Flange

12-Tee flange x flange

12 Tee mechanical x mechanical

12- blind flange

12 stainless steel bolt pack

12 red rubber gasket 1/8

16 knife gate valve flange x flange

16 gate valve mechanical x mechanical

16 gate valve flange x flange

16 gate valve flange x mechanical

16 plug valve MJ x MJ

A Db AP EEMAEAEEAEEEAAMDEAEAEMDEEEAEEAEAAEAEEAEAEAAEAEAEAEAAEMAEAADELEAEDDLPN

EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$398.83
$46.88
$7.85
$1,929.57
$1,556.48
$1,570.87
$1,498.82

$2,422.61
$2,270.44

$3,329.57
$3,540.18
$1,026.18
$2,028.53
$1,199.12
$3,785.33

$871.33
$1,736.48
$1,012.95
$1,717.06

$781.33

$795.89
$1,267.83
$1,267.83
$1,441.74
$1,615.66
$1,963.48
$2,833.05
$4,572.18

$641.48
$1,598.39
$1,598.39

$787.95
$5,576.48
$2,859.71
$3,021.18
$1,240.16

$673.24
$114.50

$17.90
$4,333.92
$5,356.53
$5,356.53
$5,356.53
$4,549.40

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$423.34
$29.20
$3.81
$2,272.26
$1,832.91
$1,849.86
$1,765.01

$2,852.86
$2,673.66

$3,920.90
$4,168.91
$1,090.15
$2,154.95
$1,273.99

$6,413.59

$925.68
$1,844.90
$1,076.24
$1,821.09

$829.79

$854.41
$1,444.91
$1,551.31
$1,764.11
$1,976.91
$2,402.51
$3,466.51
$5,594.51

$681.21
$1,697.83

$1,430.79
$836.74

$3,038.39
$3,209.81
$1,317.21
$715.00
$75.03
$8.28
$5,103.62
$6,307.84
$6,307.84
$6,307.84
$5,357.36

FY21-093 - Page 4



1.189
1.190
1.191
1.192
1.193
1.194
1.195
1.196
1.197
1.198
1.199
1.200
1.201
1.202
1.203
1.204
1.205
1.206
1.207
1.208
1.209
1.210
1.211
1.212
1.213
1.214
1.215
1.216
1.217
1.218
1.219
1.220
1.221
1.222
1.223

2.1
2.2
2.3
2.4
2.5
2.6
2.7
2.8
2.9
2.10
2.11

16 plug valve flange to flange

16 plug valve flange to mechanical

16- lever and weight check valve MJ x MJ
16- lever and weight check valve flange x flange
16 lever and weight MJ x Flange

16 90 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
16 90 degree bend Flange x Flange

16 90 degree bend Flange x mechanical
16-45 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
16-45 degree bend Flange x flange

16-45 degree bend mechanical x flange
16-22.5 degree bend Flange x Flange
16-22.5 degree bend mechanical x mechanical
16-22.5 degree bend mechanical x flange

16 x 12 90 degree bend MJ x MJ

16 x 12 90 degree bend MJ X Flange

16 x 12 90 degree Bend Flange to Flange

16 x 6 long flange x flange spool

16 x 1 long flange x flange spool

16 x 2 long flange x flange spool

16 x 3 long flange x flange spool

16 x 5 long flange x flange spool

16 x 10 long flange x flange spool

16 x 20 long flange x flange spool

16 x 10 mechanical x mechanical reducer
16 x 10 flange x flange reducer

16 x 10 mechanical x flange reducer

16 x 16 mechanical x flange adapter
16-True wye flange x flange

16-Wye Flange x Flange

16-Tee flange x flange

16 Tee mechanical x mechanical

16- blind flange

16 stainless steel bolt pack

16 red rubber gasket 1/8
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Section Il Composite Manhole Ring Covers **All manhol 1

24 clear opening composite ring and cover
30 clear opening composite ring and cover
24R125 1-1/4 LADTECH RISER HDPE
24R200 2 LADTECH RISER HDPE

245150 1-1/2 SLOPE LADTECH

250
100
500
800
50

32FGF300 34 TO 32 FIBERGLASS FLAT TRANSITION RINGS 50
SP32FS-025 LADTECH SPACER RING 32 X 2 HDPE GRAND |50

34 X 2 HDPE GRAND RINGS 34F200

50

345225 2-1/4 SLOPE LADTECH 34 X 1-1/4-2-1/4 HDPE RIN 50

BUTYL MASTIC SEALANT X 21
2 ARV D025 Air Release Valve

200
20

EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA

$224,764.00
$380.00

$560.00
$30.22

$30.22
$30.22
$52.00
$25.44
$52.25
$52.25
$6.75
$1,126.00

$224,764.00

$4,060.00
No Bid
$6,578.79
$6,956.18
No Bid
$2,079.28
$5,347.51
$3,187.51
$1,683.10
$2,730.00
$2,513.39
$3,494.57
$1,629.71
$3,494.57
$5,633.39
No Bid
$5,633.39
$2,221.31
$2,221.31
$2,465.66
$2,710.00
$3,198.70
$4,420.44
$6,741.74
$1,274.12
$2,280.00
$2,280.00
$1,428.53
8,529.42
9,176.0
7,362.8
2,950.5
1,615.1
$212.28
$25.30
$329,660.40
$603.53
$828.24
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20 No Bids

$329,660.40

$4,781.06

No Bid
$7,747.17
$8,191.59

No Bid
$2,209.11
$5,681.28
$2,556.59
$1,788.25
$2,900.26
$2,456.29
$3,712.65
$1,731.11
$2,672.59

No Bid

No Bid
$6,413.59
$2,568.50
$2,717.99
$3,016.97
$3,315.96
$3,913.92
$5,408.84
$10,817.69
$1,353.49
$2,422.26

No Bid
$1,502.67

No Bid
$9,749.19
$7,822.80
$3,134.79
$1,715.71
$154.43

$11.88
$318,351.90

$516.46
$735.42
$35.31
$35.31
$35.31
$61.02
$61.02
$61.02
$61.02
$7.18
$2,719.32
27 No Bids

$318,351.90
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