
Total Price $36,200.00 Total Price $60,081.96 Total Price $72,301.00 Total Price $89,258.90 Total Price $113,099.76 Total Price $121,982.00

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Section I  Rental of Skid Steer The intent of this specification is to define the minimum requirements for the rental of a 2018 or newer, T650, T4 Bobcat Compact Track Loader or Equivalent.  **Please upload documentation onto Cit-E-Bid the make, model, and year of the rental equipment.**1 EA $12,685.00 $12,685.00 $8,854.239 $8,854.24 $12,746.00 $12,746.00 $9,937.34 $9,937.34 $10,732.84 $10,732.84 $14,061.00 $14,061.00

1.1 Rental Price - Skid Steer as per Specifications  22.01 Day $425.00 $202.00 $340.00 $370.00 $371.86 $486.00

1.2 Rental Price - Skid Steer as per Specifications  22.01 Week (7 Days) $1,260.00 $716.00 $1,020.00 $1,100.00 $958.75 $1,391.00

1.3 Rental Price - Skid Steer as per Specifications  22.04 Week (28 Days) $2,700.00 $1,984.00 $2,754.00 $1,990.00 $2,281.86 $2,796.00

1.4 Texas Unit Property Tax 1 Each $0.239 $0.00 $7.34 $4.79

1.5 Delivery Charge 1 Each $100.00 No Bid $185.00 $250.00 $135.00 $500.00

1.6 PickupCharge 1 Each $100.00 No Bid $185.00 $250.00 $135.00 $500.00

2 Section II  Rental of Mini-Excavator The intent of this specification is to define the minimum requirements for the rental of a 2018 or newer Tier 4, Mini Excavator John Deere 35G with Extended Boom or Equivalent.  **Please upload documentation onto Cit-E-Bid the make, model, and year of the rental equipment.**1 EA $7,340.00 $7,340.00 $8,145.239 $8,145.24 $10,380.00 $10,380.00 $8,501.35 $8,501.35 $8,386.24 $8,386.24 $9,756.00 $9,756.00

2.1 Rental Price - Mini-Excavator as per Specifications  23.01 Day $245.00 $220.00 $275.00 $270.00 $283.95 $307.00

2.2 Rental Price - Mini-Excavator as per Specifications  23.01 Week (7 Days) $675.00 $725.00 $825.00 $925.00 $760.18 $813.00

2.3 Rental Price - Mini-Excavator as per Specifications  23.04 Week (28 Days) $1,555.00 $1,800.00 $2,227.50 $1,700.00 $1,767.10 $1,909.00

2.4 Texas Unit Property Tax 1 Each $0.239 $0.00 $6.35 $3.71

2.5 Delivery Charge 1 Each $100.00 No Bid $185.00 $250.00 $135.00 $500.00

2.6 PickupCharge 1 Each $100.00 No Bid $185.00 $250.00 $135.00 $500.00

3 Section III  Rental of Trench-Roller The intent of this specification is to define the minimum requirements for the rental of a 2020 or newer Pad foot Drum vibratory soil compactor.  **Please upload documentation onto Cit-E-Bid the make, model, and year of the rental equipment.**1 EA $8,050.00 $8,050.00 No Bid No Bid $10,835.56 $10,835.56 $20,167.13 $20,167.13 $15,513.00 $15,513.00

3.1 Rental Price - Trench Roller as per Specifications  24.01 Day $285.00 $230.00 $712.72 $483.00

3.2 Rental Price - Trench Roller as per Specifications  24.01 Week (7 Days) $785.00 $918.00 $1,746.38 $1,410.00

3.3 Rental Price - Trench Roller as per Specifications  24.04 Week (28 Days) $1,695.00 $2,295.00 $4,356.82 $3,155.00

3.4 Texas Unit Property Tax 1 Each $7.56 $9.15

3.5 Delivery Charge 1 Each $100.00 $250.00 $135.80 $500.00

3.6 PickupCharge 1 Each $100.00 $250.00 $135.80 $500.00

4 Section IV  Rental of Backhoe The intent of this specification is to define the minimum requirements for the rental of one 2018 or newer Backhoe Loader: (Case 580N or Approved Equal).  **Please upload documentation onto Cit-E-Bid the make, model, and year of the rental equipment.**1 EA $8,125.00 $8,125.00 $7,440.239 $7,440.24 $10,221.00 $10,221.00 $10,737.97 $10,737.97 $9,181.22 $9,181.22 $11,156.00 $11,156.00

4.1 Rental Price - Backhoe as per Specifications  25.01 Day $310.00 $250.00 $320.00 $330.00 $316.08 $342.00

4.2 Rental Price - Backhoe as per Specifications  25.01 Week (7 Days) $855.00 $790.00 $945.00 $1,100.00 $801.25 $1,014.00

4.3 Rental Price - Backhoe as per Specifications  25.04 Week (28 Days) $1,690.00 $1,600.00 $2,146.50 $2,200.00 $1,947.05 $2,200.00

4.4 Texas Unit Property Tax 1 Each $0.239 $0.00 $7.97 $4.09

4.5 Delivery Charge 1 Each $100.00 No Bid $185.00 $250.00 $135.80 $500.00

4.6 PickupCharge 1 Each $100.00 No Bid $185.00 $250.00 $135.80 $500.00

5 Section V  Rental of Dozer The intent of this specification is to define the minimum requirements for the rental of one 2018 or newer Tier 4 Final/EU Stage IV (Liebherr Crawler Tractor PR756 Litronic Landfill Application, John Deere Crawler 1050K/Waste Handler Package, Caterpillar D8T/Waste Handler Package or Approved Equal).  **Please upload documentation onto Cit-E-Bid the make, model, and year of the rental equipment.**1 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.1 Rental Price - Dozer as per Specifications  26.0 1 Day No Bid

5.2 Rental Price - Dozer as per Specifications  26.0 1 Week (7 Days) No Bid

5.3 Rental Price - Dozer as per Specifications  26.0 4 Week (28 Days) No Bid

5.4 Texas Unit Property Tax 1 Each No Bid

5.5 Delivery Charge 1 Each No Bid

5.6 PickupCharge 1 Each No Bid

6 Section VI  Rental of Water Truck The intent of this specification is to define the minimum requirements for the rental of one 2018 or newer 3500 Gallon Water Truck or Approved Equal).  **Please upload documentation onto Cit-E-Bid the make, model, and year of the rental equipment.**1 EA No Bid No Bid $16,487.02 $16,487.02 $18,786.27 $18,786.27 $28,049.00 $28,049.00

6.1 Rental Price - Water Truck as per Specifications  27.01 Day $450.00 $605.79 $869.00

6.2 Rental Price - Water Truck as per Specifications  27.01 Week (7 Days) $1,525.00 $1,723.36 $2,540.00

6.3 Rental Price - Water Truck as per Specifications  27.04 Week (28 Days) $3,500.00 $4,046.38 $5,910.00

6.4 Texas Unit Property Tax 1 Each $12.02

6.5 Delivery Charge 1 Each $250.00 $135.80 $500.00

6.6 PickupCharge 1 Each $250.00 $135.80 $500.00

7 Section VII  Rental of Excavator The intent of this specification is to define the minimum requirements for the rental of one 2018 or newer Caterpillar 336F Excavator or Approved Equal).  **Please upload documentation onto Cit-E-Bid the make, model, and year of the rental equipment.**1 EA $35,642.239 $35,642.24 $38,954.00 $38,954.00 $32,759.66 $32,759.66 $45,846.06 $45,846.06 $43,447.00 $43,447.00

7.1 Rental Price - Excavator as per Specifications  28.01 Day $942.00 $1,060.00 $885.00 $1,488.45 $1,329.00

7.2 Rental Price - Excavator as per Specifications  28.01 Week (7 Days) $2,800.00 $3,180.00 $3,350.00 $4,003.54 $3,850.00

7.3 Rental Price - Excavator as per Specifications  28.04 Week (28 Days) $7,800.00 $8,586.00 $7,000.00 $10,015.36 $8,817.00

7.4 Texas Unit Property Tax 1 Each $0.239 $0.00 $24.66 $21.03

7.5 Delivery Charge 1 Each $350.00 $185.00 $250.00 $135.80 $1,500.00

7.6 PickupCharge 1 Each $350.00 $185.00 $250.00 $135.80 $1,500.00

H&E Equipment Services, Inc.TEXAS FIRST RENTALS LLC RDO Equipment Co Nueces Power Equipment Ahern Rentals, Inc. United Rentals
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