Glz Auto Services (Maria

Green Dream Internationl

Gonzalez Auto Parts (Laredo

Advance Auto Parts

Total Price $137,003.00| Total Price $199,765.00| Total Price $234,554.30 Total Price| $139,552,967.00
Line#  Description QTY UOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Section |A: Battery Price— Built in USA—1 Ye: 1 Pkg $0.00 $0.00( $199,765.00 $199,765.00(No Bid $34,891,641.50 $34,891,641.50
1.1  Battery Group: BAT-24Reserve Capacity Ratir 25 Each $0.00 $155.00 $3,758.50
1.2  Battery Group: BAT-24FReserve Capacity Rat 25 Each $0.00 $144.00 $3,758.50
1.3 Battery Group: BAT-27Reserve Capacity Ratir 10 Each $0.00 $160.00 $1,359.90
1.4 Battery Group: BAT-26RReserve Capacity Rat 35 Each $0.00 No Bid $4,759.65
1.5  Battery Group: BAT-31PReserve Capacity Rat 100  Each $0.00 $136.00 $11,255.00
1.6  Battery Group: BAT-31SReserve Capacity Rat 265  Each $0.00 $144.00 $29,825.75
1.7  Battery Group: BAT-34Reserve Capacity Ratir 25 Each $0.00 $144.00 $3,399.75
1.8  Battery Group: BAT-35Reserve Capacity Ratir 10 Each $0.00 $295.00 $1,503.40
1.9  Battery Group: BAT-40RReserve Capacity Rat 20 Each $0.00 $184.00 $0.00
1.10 Battery Group: BAT-47Reserve Capacity Ratir 10 Each $0.00 $168.00 $1,503.40
1.11 Battery Group: BAT-48Reserve Capacity Ratir 65 Each $0.00 $168.00 $9,772.10
1.12  Battery Group: BAT-49Reserve Capacity Ratir 125  Each $0.00 $184.00 $18,792.50
1.13  Battery Group: BAT-58Reserve Capacity Ratir 60 Each $0.00 $160.00 $8,159.40
1.14 Battery Group: BAT-58RReserve Capacity Rat 15 Each $0.00 $160.00 $2,039.85
1.15 Battery Group: BAT-59Reserve Capacity Ratir 15 Each $0.00 $160.00 $2,039.85
1.16  Battery Group: BAT-65Reserve Capacity Ratir 375  Each $0.00 $160.00 $56,250.00
1.17 Battery Group: BAT-75Reserve Capacity Ratir 20 Each $0.00 No Bid $2,719.80
1.18 Battery Group: BAT-78Reserve Capacity Ratir 30 Each $0.00 $148.00 $4,079.70
1.19 Battery Group: BAT-86Reserve Capacity Ratir 15 Each $0.00 $184.00 $2,255.10
1.20 Battery Group: BAT-94RReserve Capacity Rat 55 Each $0.00 $176.00 $8,268.70
1.21  Battery Group: BAT-UILReserve Capacity Rati 15 Each $0.00 $52.00 $2,039.85
1.22  Battery Group: BAT-UIRReserve Capacity Rat 20 Each $0.00 $52.00 $2,719.80

2 Section IB: Battery Price— Builtin USA—11/21 Pkg $0.00 $0.00|No Bid No Bid $34,891,641.50 $34,891,641.50
2.1  Battery Group: BAT-24Reserve Capacity Ratir 25 Each $0.00 $3,758.50
2.2 Battery Group: BAT-24FReserve Capacity Rat 25 Each $0.00 $3,758.50
2.3  Battery Group: BAT-27Reserve Capacity Ratir 10 Each $0.00 $1,359.90
2.4  Battery Group: BAT-26RReserve Capacity Rat 35 Each $0.00 $4,759.65
2.5  Battery Group: BAT-31PReserve Capacity Rat 100  Each $0.00 $11,255.00
2.6 Battery Group: BAT-31SReserve Capacity Rat 265 Each $0.00 $29,825.75
2.7  Battery Group: BAT-34Reserve Capacity Ratir 25 Each $0.00 $3,399.75
2.8  Battery Group: BAT-35Reserve Capacity Ratir 10 Each $0.00 $1,503.40
2.9  Battery Group: BAT-40RReserve Capacity Rat 20 Each $0.00 $0.00
2.10 Battery Group: BAT-47Reserve Capacity Ratir 10 Each $0.00 $1,503.40
2.11 Battery Group: BAT-48Reserve Capacity Ratir 65 Each $0.00 $9,772.10
2.12  Battery Group: BAT-49Reserve Capacity Ratir 125 Each $0.00 $18,792.50
2.13  Battery Group: BAT-58Reserve Capacity Ratir 60 Each $0.00 $8,159.40
2.14  Battery Group: BAT-58RReserve Capacity Rat 15 Each $0.00 $2,039.85
2.15 Battery Group: BAT-59Reserve Capacity Ratir 15 Each $0.00 $2,039.85
2.16 Battery Group: BAT-65Reserve Capacity Ratir 375 Each $0.00 $56,250.00
2.17 Battery Group: BAT-75Reserve Capacity Ratir 20 Each $0.00 $2,719.80
2.18 Battery Group: BAT-78Reserve Capacity Ratir 30 Each $0.00 $4,079.70
2.19 Battery Group: BAT-86Reserve Capacity Ratir 15 Each $0.00 $2,255.10
2.20 Battery Group: BAT-94RReserve Capacity Rat 55 Each $0.00 $8,268.70
2.21 Battery Group: BAT-UILReserve Capacity Rati 15 Each $0.00 $2,039.85
2.22  Battery Group: BAT-UIRReserve Capacity Rat 20 Each $0.00 $2,719.80

3 Section lIA: Battery Price— Not Built in USA— 1 Pkg $137,003.00 $137,003.00|No Bid $117,277.15 $117,277.15| $34,878,042.50 $34,878,042.50
3.1  Battery Group: BAT-24Reserve Capacity Ratir 25 Each $0.00 $69.95 $3,758.50
3.2  Battery Group: BAT-24FReserve Capacity Rat 25 Each $0.00 $69.95 $3,758.50
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