Rain For Rent (WOSCO) United Rentals (North
Total Price $47,741.23 Total Price $59,070.00
Line#  Description QTY UuUOoM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Section I:Pumps, Hoses, Valves, Fittings and /1 PKG $11,450.94 $11,450.94| $10,493.00 $10,493.00
1.1 Pumps (Diesel-Powered, Trailer-Mounted)6” 1 Per Unit (W $463.20 $719.00
1.2  Pumps (Diesel-Powered, Trailer-Mounted)8” 1 Per Unit (W $616.67 $1,008.00
1.3  Pumps (Diesel-Powered, Trailer-Mounted)10 1 Per Unit (W $723.33 No Bid
1.4  Pumps (Diesel-Powered, Trailer-Mounted)12 1 Per Unit (W $1,282.17 $1,856.00
1.5  Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)6” : 1 Per Set (We $518.85 $615.00
1.6 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)6” 1 Per Set (We $220.26 $212.00
1.7  Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)8” : 1 Per Set (We $853.60 $1,025.00
1.8  Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)8” 1 Per Set (We $609.52 No Bid
1.9  Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)10” 1 Per Set (We $1,164.16 No Bid
1.10 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)10” 1 Per Set (We $1,164.16 No Bid
1.11 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)12" 1 Per Set (We $1,318.68 $1,715.00
1.12 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)12”1 Per Set (We $1,318.68 $1,232.00
1.13 Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)6” Chec 1 Per Unit (W $103.37 $200.00
1.14 Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)8” Chec 1 Per Unit (W $105.39 $300.00
1.15 Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)10” Che 1 Per Unit (W $115.36 No Bid
1.16 Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)12” Che 1 Per Unit (W $193.62 $400.00
1.17 Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)6” Plug 1 Per Unit (W $93.07 $281.00
1.18 Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)8” Plug 1 Per Unit (W $109.75 $281.00
1.19 Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)10” Plug1 Per Unit (W $124.11 $281.00
1.20 Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)12” Pluy1 Per Unit (W $184.54 $281.00
1.21  Fittings (Cam-Lock, Flanged, or Gasketed)6” t 1 Per Unit (W $23.85 $14.00
1.22  Fittings (Cam-Lock, Flanged, or Gasketed)8” t 1 Per Unit (W $36.87 29.00
1.23  Fittings (Cam-Lock, Flanged, or Gasketed)10” 1 Per Unit (W $47.88 No Bid
1.24  Fittings (Cam-Lock, Flanged, or Gasketed)12” 1 Per Unit (W $59.85 $44.00
2 Section Il:Pumps, Hoses, Valves, Fittings and 1 PKG $25,977.04 $25,977.04 $33,492.00 $33,492.00
2.1  Pumps (Diesel-Powered, Trailer-Mounted)6” 1 Per Unit (M $1,389.60 $2,159.00
2.2 Pumps (Diesel-Powered, Trailer-Mounted)8” 1 Per Unit (M $1,850.00 $3,026.00
2.3  Pumps (Diesel-Powered, Trailer-Mounted)10 1 Per Unit (M $2,169.98 No Bid
2.4  Pumps (Diesel-Powered, Trailer-Mounted)12 1 Per Unit (M $3,846.50 $5,136.00
2.5 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)6” 1 Per Set (Mo $1,037.70 $1,845.00
2.6 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)6” 1 Per Set (Mo $440.52 $556.00
2.7 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)8” 1 Per Set (Mo $1,707.20 $3,065.00
2.8  Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)8” 1 Per Set (Mo $1,218.96 $1,132.00
2.9 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)10” 1 Per Set (Mo $2,323.28 No Bid
2.10 Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)10” 1 Per Set (Mo $2,323.28 No Bid
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3.1
3.2
3.3

Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)12” 1
Hoses (Includes Quick Connect Couplings)12” 1
Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)6” Chec 1
Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)8” Chec 1
Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)10” Che 1
Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)12” Che 1
Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)6” Plug 1
Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)8” Plug 1
Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)10” Pluy1
Valves (Sewage Grade, Rental Ready)12” Pluy1
Fittings (Cam-Lock, Flanged, or Gasketed)6” I 1
Fittings (Cam-Lock, Flanged, or Gasketed)8” 1
Fittings (Cam-Lock, Flanged, or Gasketed)10” 1
Fittings (Cam-Lock, Flanged, or Gasketed)12” 1
Section IIl: AdditionalServices. 1
On-Site Pump Operator (if requested).
Emergency Delivery and Setup (<4 hours).
By-Pass Removal and Clean Up.
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